2011
Minturn Council Meeting

Wednesday August 03, 2011

Work Session: 4:45pm
(Town Center)

Regular Session: 6:30pm
(Town Center)

ToP FIVE COUNCIL PRIORITIES:

Entry Signs

Sidewalk Installations

Street repairs with drainage (by priority)
100% completion of Telemetry
Implement Streetscape Plan



Minturn Town Council
August 3,2011
Page 1 of 3

Agenda

MEETING OF THE MINTURN TOWN COUNCIL
Minturn Town Center, 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645 ¢ (970) 827-5645

Wednesday August 3, 2011

Work Session — 4:45pm
Regular Session — 6:30pm

MAYOR — Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty TOWN MANAGER — Jim White
MAYOR PRO TEM — George Brodin TOWN CLERK/TREAS — Jay Brunvand

CoUuNCIL MEMBERS:
Shelley Bellm
Earle Bidez
Jerry Bumgarner
Aggie Martinez
John Rosenfeld

When addressing the Council, please state your name and your address for the record prior to providing your
comments. Please address the Council as a whole through the Mayor. All supporting documents are available for
public review in the Town Offices — located at 302 Pine Street, Minturn CO 81645 — during regular business hours
between 8:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, excluding holidays.

Work Session — 4:45pm

e Site Visit: Minturn Towne Homes (MEET AT INTERSECTION OF TAYLOR ST
AND LIONS LANE) — Cerimele (45min)

e Discussion/update: VSSC Aldo Radamus — White (30min)
Regular Session — 6:30pm
1. Call to Order
a. Roll Call
b. Pledge of Allegiance

2. Approval of Agenda
a. Items to be Pulled or Added




Minturn Town Council
August 3,2011

Page 2 of 3

Approval of Minutes and Action Report
e July 20,2011

e July 25,2011 Special Meeting

e Action Item Report

4. Public comments on items, which are NOT on the agenda (5 minute time limit per
person)

5. Special Presentations/Citizen Recognition

6. Planning Department Update

7. Town Manager’s Report

8. Town Council Comments

PUBLIC HEARINGS AND DISCUSSION/ACTION ITEMS

9. Discussion/Action — Ordinance S — 2011 (Second Reading) an Ordinance adopting
the 2009 IBC as amended — Cerimele/Lanci (15min)

10. Discussion/Action — Ordinance 11 — 2011 (Second Reading) Holy Cross Franchise
Agreement — White (30min)

11. Discussion/Action — Ordinance 10 - 2011 (Second Reading) an Ordinance granting
and approving an Encroachment Agreement between the Minturn Towne Homes
and the Town of Minturn — Cerimele (15min)

EXECUTIVE SESSION

12. Executive Session — Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(a) for the purposes to consult with
the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the negotiations of the USFS
Boneyard property and Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(b) for the purposes to consult
with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the negotiations of the
Battle Mountain Resort property annexation, water right issues, and EPA update —
White/Christensen

FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS

13. Next Meeting — August 17, 2011

e Meeting: Discussion/Action — Ms. Wendy Naugle of the Colorado Dept of Public
Health and Environment — White (30min)




Minturn Town Council
August 3,2011
Page 3 of 3

14. Future Meeting

e Town Manager annual evaluation

e Worksession: Discussion/update: Water Quality Control Professionals — White
(30min) (09/07/11)

e Meeting: Discussion/Action — Resolution 4 — Series 2011 a Resolution approving a
subdivision exemption plat for the Maloit Park Area — Cerimele (20min)

e Meeting: Discussion/Action — Ordinance 9 — 2011 (First and Second Readings) an
Ordinance allowing the sale of Medical Marijuana (TBA Meetings in January 2012
45min, NOTE: this will require two readings)

e Worksession: Request from the Planning Commission for a work session time during
September with the Council to determine a sidewalk master plan.

15. Set Future Meeting Dates
a) Council Meetings:
e August 17,2011
e September 7, 2011
e September 21, 2011

b) Planning & Zoning Commission Meetings:
e August 10,2011

e August 24,2011

e September 14, 2011

c¢) Other Dates:

16. Adjournment



TOWN COUNCIL
Mayor — Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty

Mayor Pro Tem — George Brodin

' Councilwoman - Shelley Bellm
' Councilman - Earle Bidez

Councilman - Jerry Bumgarner

Councilman - Aggie Martinez

Council - John Rosenfeld

P.O. Box 309 ¢ 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645
Phone: 970-827-5645
Fax: 970-827-5545
Jim White Town Manager
manager@minturn.org

AGENDA ITEM COVER SHEET

AGENDA TITLE: Vail Ski and Snowboard Club (VSSC)

MEETING DATE: August 3, 2011

PRESENTER: Jim White, Town Manager

BACKGROUND:

The Town of Minturn supported the placement of the VSSC at the Maloit Park site following the
departure of the Minturn Middle School. Fortunately, the Eagle County School District subsequently
approved an agreement to house the Ski and Snowboard Club at Maloit Park.

As the transition moves forward, discussion has ensued about a partnership which may result in a
community use wellness center or recreation center of some variety. The Town of Minturn, VSSC, and
the Battle Mountain Development have all discussed ideas about how this might materialize.

Tonight’s discussion will help update the Town Council on the current status of the transition process and
open dialog to help determine if a partnership is feasible or prudent.

Aldo Radamus for VSSC will be present to deliver opening remarks, expand the dialog, and elicit
feedback form the Town Council regarding this prospect.
CORE ISSUES: N/A

STAFF RECOMMENDATION/MOTION: N/A




Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 1 of 8

Official Minutes

MEETING OF THE MINTURN TOWN COUNCIL
Minturn Town Center, 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645 ¢ (970) 827-5645

Wednesday July 20, 2011

Work Session — 5:00pm
Regular Session — 6:30pm

MAYOR — Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty TOWN MANAGER - Jim White
MAYOR PRO TEM — George Brodin TOWN CLERK/TREAS — Jay Brunvand

CoUuNCIL MEMBERS:
Shelley Bellm
Earle Bidez
Jerry Bumgarner
Aggie Martinez
John Rosenfeld

When addressing the Council, please state your name and your address for the record prior to providing your
comments. Please address the Council as a whole through the Mayor. All supporting documents are available for
public review in the Town Offices — located at 302 Pine Street, Minturn CO 81645 — during regular business hours
between 8:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, excluding holidays.

Work Session — 5:00pm

e Work Session Review: Discussion/Action — Ordinance 9 — 2011 ( Reading) an
Ordinance allowing the sale of Medical Marijuana (45min)

(Note: although no decision was made on this item, it was reviewed in full with Town
Council and staff was directed to finalize the ordinance and then bring it back in January
2012 for review and consideration.)

e Work Session Review: Discussion/Action — Ordinance 5 — 2011 (First Reading) an
Ordinance adopting the 2009 IBC as amended — Cerimele/Lanci (30min)

Regular Session — 6:30pm

1. Call to Order
a. Roll Call




Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 2 of 8

b. Pledge of Allegiance

The meeting was called to order by Mayor Hawkeye Flaherty at 6:35 pm.

Those present included: Mayor Hawkeye Flaherty, Mayor Pro Tem George Brodin, Council
Members Shelley Bellm, Aggie Martinez, John Rosenfeld, Jerry Bumgarner and Earle Bidez.

Staff present: Town Manager Jim White, Town Treasurer/Clerk Jay Brunvand, Town Planner
Chris Cerimele, Deputy Clerk Michelle Metteer and Attorney Allen Christensen.

2. Approval of Agenda
a. Items to be Pulled or Added

e Request to add item 12a to the agenda, to address the appointment of a CML policy
committee person.

Motion by John R., second by Aggie M., to approve the agenda as amended; all voted in favor.

3. Approval of Minutes and Action Report
e July6,2011
e Action Item Report

Motion by George B., second by Jerry B., to approve the minutes as presented; all voted in favor.
(Note: Council member Bellm abstained as she was absent from the July 6, 2011 meeting.)

Request from Council to add the following to the action report: amounts of money to be spent
on street repairs and sidewalk repairs and the timeline for those accomplishments and an update
on the accomplishments on the streetscape plan.

4. Public comments on items, which are NOT on the agenda (5 minute time limit per
person)

5. Special Presentations/Citizen Recognition
e Mr. Daniel Chisholm (not present)

6. Planning Department Update

07.13.11 Planning Commission Meeting Update

The Planning Commission met on 7.13.11 to discuss the following topics:
e Design Review Board procedures
e Open Space requirements
e Sidewalk installation requirements

The Commission finalized the language for the new DRB procedures. This will be presented to
the Council as a code amendment at an upcoming meeting.



Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 3 of 8

Sidewalks in south Minturn were also discussed at the meeting. The Commission would like to
have a joint work session with the Town Council in September to discuss a comprehensive plan
to address the issue.

251 Main Street

The mobile home at 251 Main Street was removed to accommodate the construction of a single
family home. Due to unforeseen circumstances, building plans have yet to be submitted and the
project has been placed on a temporary hold.

As mentioned at the July 6, 2011 Council meeting, the mobile home was relocated to the
Quintana property in South Minturn with the intention of utilizing the unit for a residence. Staff
has informed the Quintanas that is not permissible under the Municipal Code and International
Building Code and that the mobile home must be removed from the property by August 26,
2011.

Upcoming Project
An application has been submitted for a variance to construct a detached garage at 1688 Main
Street. This item is anticipated to be the subject of a Town Council public hearing in August.

7. Town Manager’s Report

XCEL Natural Gas Pipeline Project Continues!

The XCEL Pipeline Project from Edwards to Minturn will return to Minturn sometime in the
next two weeks once the gas line section at Dowd Junction from Eagle Vail reaches the Minturn
Dowd Junction area. XCEL plans to work six days, twelve hour days from 7am to 7pm. XCEL
was made aware of Minturn’s Saturday weekly market and also was informed about the
upcoming bike race events on July 30" and August 6". XCEL is replacing 6” and 12” existing
lines with a new 16” line. The Minturn section should take two to three weeks to complete per
Jimmy Smith, project manager. Overall project completion is set for September 15, 2011. With
any questions, please call XCEL at 1-877-481-6380.

Battle Mountain Update

Most of the issues discussed currently involve pending lawsuits related to responses to the EPA,
quiet title action, and legal challenges to the annexation agreement. Mr. Dave Kleinkopf had
requested that we restart our committee meetings. We convened the committee on Tuesday, July
12, 2011. Councilmembers Earle Bidez, and Shelley Bellm represented the Town Council. The
Town Manager and the Town Attorney also participated.

Signage
Plans for signage at the south end of Minturn are in progress. In addition, we are looking at

signage for the entrance to Little Beach Park. We will be working on access agreements or
easements needed for both signs.

Maloit Park Water Tank




Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 4 of 8

Inspection of the Maloit Park water tank finds the need to make repairs. Public Works is securing
bids for the job. The plan would be to complete restoration of both the inside and outside of the
tank.

Holy Cross Franchise Agreement Extension
The Town of Minturn and Holy Cross have extended our franchise through September 21, 2011.
1" and 2™ reading of the ordinance are currently planned on July 20th and August 3, 2011.

Park Update
Little Beach Park has had twelve solar lights installed along walking paths to improve visibility

following the Saturday night movies. An additional porta-potty has been brought to the park.
Public Works staff has been assigned to clean the park every morning beginning at 7am.

Bone Yard Parcel

On Monday evening, July 11, 2011, the Town staff made a preliminary presentation to the Eagle
County Open Space Advisory Committee (OSAC) on the prospective request for funding to
purchase the Bone Yard property. Toby Sprunk, new director for Eagle County’s Open Lands
Program, has been asked to arrange a site tour for the committee. We have also requested to be
on the next agenda in August to formally request funding. We received very supportive
commentary from committee members. The one predominant request was to secure funding from
other partners.

On Tuesday, July 12, we met with Battle Mountain CEO, Dave Kleinkopf, and raised the issue
of the Bone Yard purchase and the OSAC expressed concerns that the Town secure other
funding partners.

The USEFS is requesting an offer acceptance letter by July 22, 2011. In the letter, the USFS is
further requesting language that outlines how the Town intends to secure funds for this
transaction by September 8, 2011.

Minturn Community Garden

I will be meeting with representatives of the Minturn Community Fund to discuss possible
locations and plans to begin a Minturn Community Garden. Though the growing season is
relatively short here in the mountains, we will consider what types of plants to begin this
endeavor. A location has not yet been selected.

Movies in the Park
Last week’s movie, School of Rock, was postponed due to inclement weather. The plan is to
show the movie instead on Saturday, July 16™ at dusk.

Concert Series at Little Beach Park

The 2nd Annual Concert Series at Little Beach Park began July 7, 2011 at Little Beach Park
from 6pm-8pm. Many thanks to all the volunteers who have collaborated to raise funds, secure
quality music, and cover all the planning and logistics required for such events to be successful.



Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 5 of 8

Special thanks are extended to Terry and Jeff Armistead, Chris Alexander, Chris Cerimele,
Michelle Metteer, Lisa Osborne, Chief Martinez, and to several others.

8. Town Council Comments

John R. reminded everyone that the bears are out and to please have garbage cans secured
properly.

George B. also attended the Open Space meeting and felt Minturn was well received. He was
also at the ECO meetings.

PUBLIC HEARINGS AND DISCUSSION/ACTION ITEMS

9. Discussion/Action — Ordinance S — 2011 (First Reading) an Ordinance adopting the
2009 IBC as amended — Cerimele/Lanci (Meeting 15min)

The Mayor referred the discussion to Chris C. and Chuck Lanci, Building Inspector. Chris C. and
Chuck L. summarized the issues and answered questions, advised Council that the International
Energy Conservation Code is for both residential and commercial properties.

Mr. Richard Brinkley, Holy Cross Energy, 3799 HWY 82, Glenwood Springs, discussed that the
International Energy Conservation Code is more about energy conservation that economic
savings.

Motion by Shelley B., second by Jerry B., to approve Ordinance 5 — 2011 (First Reading) an
Ordinance adopting the 2009 IBC as amended; motion passed 5-2 with John R. and Hawkeye F.
nay.

10. Discussion/Action — Ordinance 11 — 2011 (First Reading) Holy Cross Franchise
Agreement — White (30min)

Motion by George B., second by John R., to approve Ordinance 11 — 2011 (First Reading) as
amended (review of contract in ten years) Holy Cross Franchise Agreement; all voted in favor.

11. Discussion/Action — Ordinance 10 - 2011 (First Reading) an Ordinance granting and
approving an Encroachment Agreement between the Minturn Towne Homes and
the Town of Minturn — Cerimele (15min)

Mr. Onie Bolduk, Representative, Minturn Townhomes, addressed the berm and drainage issues
at the Townhomes location and moving forward these concerns are to be rectified through
improvements and annual inspections and maintenance of the soils and the overall property. He
stated the berm is to run along the back (east side) of the property in order to catch the water
from the hill side and more thoroughly divert it from the back of the property and then into an
existing storm drain system along the north side of the property between the Minturn Towne



Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 6 of 8

Homes property and the property to the immediate north but on the Minturn Towne Homes
property.

Request by Council for a work session and site visit August 3, 2011 at the Minturn Townhome
property location. Notification to surrounding neighbors was requested. More information
regarding the liner, the re-vegetation plan, and adding a maintenance clause to the ordinance
were all part of the discussion.

Motion by Jerry B., second by George B., to approve Ordinance 10 - 2011 (First Reading) an
Ordinance granting and approving an Encroachment Agreement between the Minturn Towne
Homes and the Town of Minturn; motion passed 4-3 with John R, Aggie M, and Shelley B. nay).

12. Discussion/Action — Update and discussion regarding the River View Cemetery —
White (10min)

The Council was updated on a request from the Riverview Cemetery District to drill and erect a
water well and vault sewage system on the cemetery property. This project would enable the
Town to connect the existing Public Works Facility (810 Cemetery Rd) to a potable water and
sewage system that would provide service year around. Council directed staff to ensure all
necessary state and local approvals are provided in writing and that the Town received copies.

12a. Action/Discussion- Acknowledging a primary representative for the CML policy
committee.

Motion by Jerry B., second by Aggie M., to appoint the Mayor as the CML Policy Committee
representative, and Town Manager, Jim White as the alternate; all voted in favor.

EXECUTIVE SESSION

13. Executive Session — Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(a) for the purposes to consult with
the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the negotiations of the USFS
Boneyard property and Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(b) for the purposes to consult
with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the negotiations of the
Battle Mountain Resort property annexation, water right issues, and EPA update —
White/Christensen

Motion by Shelley B., second by Aggie M., to convene into executive session pursuant to CRS
24-6-402(4)(a) for the purposes to consult with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction
regarding the negotiations of the USFS Boneyard property and Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(b)
for the purposes to consult with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the
negotiations of the Battle Mountain Resort property annexation, water right issues, and EPA
update. All voted in favor.




Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 7 of 8

Following the executive session, the Town environmental attorney was directed to request a copy
of the CBS water treatment plant annual audit; the Town Manager was directed to send a letter to
the USFS and to have meetings with Vail and Avon managers; and the Town water attorney was
asked to clarify legal processes related to annexation agreements.

The Executive Session adjourned at 10:37pm.

FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS

14.

15.

16.

17.

Next Meeting — August 3, 2011

Meeting: Discussion/Action — Resolution 4 — Series 2011 a Resolution approving a
subdivision exemption plat for the Maloit Park Area — Cerimele (20min)

Meeting: Discussion/Action — Ordinance 11 — 2011 ( Reading) Holy Cross
Franchise Agreement — White (15min) (8/3/11)

Meeting: Discussion/Action — Ordinance 5 —2011 ( Reading) an Ordinance
adopting the 2009 IBC as amended — Cerimele/Lanci (15min) (8/3/11)

Work Session- Ordinance 10 - 2011 (First Reading) an Ordinance granting and
approving an Encroachment Agreement between the Minturn Towne Homes and the
Town of Minturn — Cerimele (15min)

Town Administrator Evaluation

Future Meeting

e Meeting: Discussion/Action — Ordinance 9 — 2011 (First Reading) an Ordinance
allowing the sale of Medical Marijuana (TBA Meetings 45min, NOTE: this will
require two readings)

e Discussion/Action — Ordinance  — 2012 ( Reading) an Ordinance allowing
the sale of Medical Marijuana (45min) (1/2012)

Set Future Meeting Dates

a) Council Meetings:

August 3, 2011
August 17, 2011
September 7, 2011

b) Planning & Zoning Commission Meetings:

July 27, 2011
August 10, 2011
August 24, 2011

c¢) Other Dates:

Adjournment



Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 8 of 8

As there was no further business, Council adjourned at 10:38pm.

Mayor Hawkeye Flaherty

ATTEST:

Town Clerk, Jay Brunvand



Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 1 of 2

Minutes

MEETING OF THE MINTURN TOWN COUNCIL
Minturn Town Center, 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645 ¢ (970) 827-5645

Monday — July 25, 2011

Regular Session — 5:30pm

MAYOR — Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty TOWN MANAGER — Jim White
MAYOR PRO TEM — George Brodin TOWN CLERK/TREAS — Jay Brunvand

CoUNCIL MEMBERS:
Shelley Bellm
Earle Bidez
Jerry Bumgarner
Aggie Martinez
John Rosenfeld

These minutes are formally submitted to the Town of Minturn Town Council for approval as the official written record of the
proceedings at the identified Council Meeting. Additionally, all Council meetings are tape-recorded and are available to the
public for listening at the Town Center Offices from 8:30am — 2:00 pm, Monday through Friday, by contacting the Town Clerk at
970/824-5645 302 Pine St. Minturn, CO 81645

Regular Session — 5:30pm

1. Call to Order
a. Roll Call
The meeting was called to order by Mayor Flaherty at 5:30pm.

Those present included: Mayor Hawkeye Flaherty, Mayor Pro Tem George Brodin, Council
Members Shelley Bellm, Aggie Martinez, John Rosenfeld, Council Members Jerry Bumgarner
and Earle Bidez.

Staff present: Town Manager Jim White, and Town Attorney Allen Christensen, and Attorneys
Boots Ferguson and Elizabeth Mitchell of Holland and Hart.

b. Pledge of Allegiance

2. Approval of Agenda
a. Items to be Pulled or Added

10




Minturn Town Council
July 6, 2011
Page 2 of 2

Motion by Jerry B., second by Shelley B., to approve the agenda as presented; all voted in favor.

EXECUTIVE SESSION

3. Executive Session — Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(a) for the purposes to consult with
the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the negotiations of the USFS
Boneyard property and Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(b) for the purposes to consult
with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the negotiations of the
Battle Mountain Resort property annexation, water right issues, and EPA update —
White/Christensen

Motion by Shelley B., second by John R., to convene in Executive Session Pursuant to CRS 24-
6-402(4)(a) for the purposes to consult with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction
regarding the negotiations of the USFS Boneyard property and Pursuant to CRS 24-6-402(4)(b)
for the purposes to consult with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction regarding the
negotiations of the Battle Mountain Resort property annexation, water right issues, and EPA
update; all voted in favor.

Following the Executive Session the following direction was give to Staff as a result of the
Executive Session:

Motion by Jerry B., second by Shelley B., to:
e Staff is directed to review the re-engineering issues and to report back to Town Council
e Jim W. to set a meeting with Aldo Radamus of the Vail Ski and Snowboard Club

4. Adjournment

Motion by Jerry B., second by George B., to adjourn the meeting at 7:10pm. All voted in favor.

Mayor Hawkeye Flaherty

ATTEST:

Town Clerk, Jay Brunvand

11




‘[esodoid [eurioy ym 11/8/8 U0 DVSO Yim 309w 03 sueld

oIS ‘pels Auno)) o[3ey UM Jow Jjeis umo ], ‘s1oulted Juisreipuny yo0S AMYM oseyound preAsuog 103 Surpung DVSO
11/L/6 UO [10UN0D)/M Pamal1Adl 9q 0} Ajiorid yoes

Jo smyess oy uo epdn [[ng € 10§ SunddwW | [/07/L Y I paisanbal 1ouno) AMYM IST] AJLIOLIJ UMO T
"UOTIONIISUOD MU JOJ SY[BMIPIS
oxmbair 03 3p0d 01 a3en3ue] FUIMIIAII UOISSIUIIO)) SUlUUR[d PUe JJeIs

‘[[BH UMO], 9y} J& PUB 1S UIBJA UO | [/] [/L UO IN390 0} SUONB[[BISUI ISIL] | OUYA/ZOUIMBIN 'V SY[BMOPIS UMO],
Surpuny drysie[oyos 103

suoneuOp UNIOI[OS pue Aduow pads Furpraoid ur paIsAIAUI SI [IOUNO)) AMYM Surpun,] diysie[oyog wInjurjy
‘suonNqIIuOd

puny diysie[oyos urejunoA d[eq Wwolj Aouow 110Ul ansIng AMYM puny diyse[oyog uonexauuy UIejuUno apieq
"UOIBISPISUOD JOJ
[1ounoy) 03 Joeq WYINOIq 9q [[14 }I W) YdIYM Je 7] (g Alenue[ [1jun pjoy

uo SI pue [10UN0)) pPue Jjeis Aq pamaraal A[03o[dwod usaq sey yeid Y.L, AMYM ooueuIpi() euen(lBA [BOIPIN Yel(d
sug1g Jo asnoy je paonpoid uraq
st pa1doooe uooq sey [esodoid ugig ‘uone[eISUI [ [()Z JO [€0S © YIIm USIS

& 10§ suondo ym padooad 03 ST SUIIOAN [IOUNO)) T1/9/L WOIJ UOTIOAIL(] AMYM Inog — uSIs ANuo UMo ],

Aaed
310ddYy ssda30ag drqisuodsay W) U0y

12

SSUNOA [IOUNOD) UMO], WOJ SW)] UONIY JO smel§  LDALdNS

110T ‘€0 3sndny ALV
ToZRUBIA] UMO, /ONYA\ WIf TNOUA
SISQUIDTA [IOUNO0))/SIOQUISA JJel1S 0L

OWIIJA] W) UONIY [IdUN0))
WINJUIA] JO UMO T,



Post Office Box 309 Town Council

302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645
Phone: 970-827-4272
Fax: 970-827-7420

Mayor Pro Tem — George Brodin
Councilwoman - Shelley Bellm
Councilman - Jerry Bumgarner
Councilman - Aggie Martinez
Councilman - Earle Bidez
Councilman - John Rosenfeld

To: Minturn Town Councill

Cc: Jim White, Town Manager
From: Chris Cerimele, Town Planner
Re: Planning Department Update
Date: July 29, 2011

07.27.11 Planning Commission Meeting Update

The 7.27.11 Planning Commission meeting was cancelled due to the property owner at
1688 Main Street withdrawing their variance application.

Community Wildfire Protection Plan

The Eagle River Fire Protection District is funding a program to create a Community
Wildfire Protection Plan. A team of consultants in conjunction with fire district
personnel will assess the wildfire danger within the fire district and make
recommendations to mitigate the danger. Staff attended the kick-off meeting for this
planning effort last week in Edwards. Further information will be provided as the
planning effort proceeds.

13

Mayor - Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty



TOWN COUNCIL
Mayor — Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty
Mayor Pro Tem — George Brodin
Councilmember - Shelley Bellm
Councilmember - Earle Bidez
Councilmember - Jerry Bumgarner
Councilmember - Aggie Martinez
Councilmember - John Rosenfeld

Jim White
Town Manager
P.O. Box 309 ¢ 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645
Phone: 970-827-5645
Fax: 970-827-5545
Email: manager@minturn.org

To: Mayor Flaherty and Minturn Town Council

From: Jim White, Town Manager

Date: July 28, 2011

Re: Manager’s Report for the August 3, 2011 Town Council Meeting

XCEL Natural Gas Pipeline Project Continues!

The XCEL Pipeline Project from Edwards to Minturn will return to Minturn sometime in
the next week or so once the gas line section at Dowd Junction from Eagle Vail reaches
the Minturn Dowd Junction area. XCEL plans to work six days, twelve hour days from
7am to 7pm. XCEL was made aware of Minturn’s Saturday weekly market and also was
informed about the upcoming bike race event on August 6". The Minturn section
should take two to three weeks to complete per Jimmy Smith, project manager. Overall
project completion is set for September 15, 2011. With any questions, please call XCEL
at 1-877-481-6380.

Signage
Plans for signage at the south end of Minturn are in progress. In addition, we are

planning for directional signage at Cemetery Bridge for the entrance to Little Beach
Park. We will be working on access agreements or easements needed for the signs.

Maloit Park Water Tank

Inspection of the Maloit Park water tank determined the need to make repairs. Public
Works has secured two bids for the job. The plan would be to complete restoration of
both the inside and outside of the tank. | met with a representative from the School
District to discuss repairs and payment arrangements on this and other projects in
Maloit Park.

Bone Yard Parcel

On Monday evening, August 8, 2011, the Town staff will make a formal presentation to
the Eagle County Open Space Advisory Committee (OSAC) on the request for funding
to purchase the Bone Yard property in Minturn. Toby Sprunk, new director for Eagle
County’s Open Lands Program, has been asked to arrange a site tour for the
committee. We received very supportive commentary from committee members. The
one predominant request was to secure funding from other partners. Meetings were
held with the managers of the Towns of Vail and Avon.

The USFS closing deadline for this transaction is September 8, 2011.

14



7/28/2011

Holy Cross Franchise Agreement Extension
The Town of Minturn and Holy Cross have extended our franchise through September
21, 2011. 2" reading of the ordinance is planned at tonight's meeting.

Sidewalk Replacement Plan

Staff has completed two sidewalk projects already this summer and is slated to
complete another this week. E are also in the process of compiling a report for Town
Council to be delivered at the September 7, 2011 Town Council meeting.

Battle Mountain Update
Current issues include pending lawsuits related to responses to the EPA, quiet title
action, and legal challenges to the annexation agreement.

Budget Calendar

The budget calendar is included in your packet for this evening’s meeting. | will provide
a brief review for planning purposes and to answer any preliminary questions Town
Council may have.

Eagle County Airport Planning Meeting
The latest airport planning meeting was held yesterday in the Eagle County offices in
Eagle, CO.

Lifetime Achievement Award

On August 1%, | travelled to the City of Arvada to present the first “Lifetime Achievement
Award” to Craig Kocian, City Manager. He was awarded this honor by the Colorado City
and County Managers’ Association. | serve as president—elect of that organization and
will become president in February 2012 at the annual conference.

Vacation
My wife and | will be away on vacation from August 15 through August 25™.

Respectfully submitted,

Jim White
Town Manager

15



TOWN COUNCIL
Mayor - Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty
Mayor Pro Tem - George Brodin
Councilwoman - Shelley Bellm
Councilman - Jerry Bumgarner
Councilman - Earle Bidez
Councilman - Aggie Martinez
Councilman - John Rosenfeld

P.O. Box 309 ¢ 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645
Phone: 970-827-5645
Fax: 970-827-5545
Email: manager@minturn.org

AGENDA ITEM COVER SHEET

AGENDA TITLE:

Ordinance 5 - 2011; An Ordinance of the Town of Minturn repealing and reenacting
multiple sections of Chapter 18 of the Municipal Code to adopt by reference the 2009
International Building Codes with amendments. (second reading)

MEETING DATE: August 3, 2011

PRESENTER: Chris Cerimele

BACKGROUND: The Town Council approved this ordinance on first reading at their
July 20™ meeting. At that meeting, the Council requested that the Building Official
investigate air exchange fans to see if any models contained an alarm system that would
warn a homeowner if the unit failed and ceased functioning.

CORE ISSUES: At the time of this report, the Building Official has yet to locate a fan with
the described alarm system.

BUDGET/FINANCE IMPLICATIONS: None

RECOMMENDED MOTION: I move to approve Ordinance 5 — Series 2011 on second
reading.

16



TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. 5 - SERIES 2011

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN REPEALING AND
REENACTING ARTICLES 1-4 AND 5-8 OF CHAPTER 18 OF THE TOWN OF
MINTURN MUNICIPAL CODE AND REPLACING THOSE SECTIONS WITH
ARTICLES 1-4 AND 5-8 AND ADDING A NEW ARTICLE 9 AND 10 AND
RENUMBERING SUBSEQUENT SECTIONS TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE
THE 2009 EDITIONS OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE,
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE,
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL
CODE, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AND THE
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE AS CURRENTLY ADOPTED BY THE
STATE OF COLORADO

WHEREAS, in promotion of the public health, safety and welfare of the inhabitants of
the Town of Minturn, the Town Council desires to update its ordinances by adopting the 2009
International Building Codes with amendments; and .

WHEREAS, section 11.11 of the Home Rule Charter and section 31-16-202, C.R.S., as
amended, permit the contemplated adoption by reference of such codes upon notice and hearing
as provided in Section 31-16-203, C.R.S.; and

WHEREAS, the Minturn Town Council held a public hearing, with proper notice
provided, to consider adoption of such International Codes as required by law; and

WHEREAS, copies of said International Codes are available in the Planning Office at
the Minturn Town Center; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council has determined, based on the evidence and testimony
presented at the public hearing, that the adoption of these codes, as amended herein, will further
the health, safety and welfare of the inhabitants of Minturn; and

NOW, THEREFORE, THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS as follows:

Section 1. Article 1 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Section 18-1-10. Title.

The provisions of the ordinance codified herein shall be know and cited collectively as
the “Town of Minturn Building Code” or “International Codes.”

Section 18-1-20. Codes adopted.

() The Town of Minturn adopts by reference the following codes:

17



a. International Building Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

b. International Residential Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

c. International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

d. International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition as published
by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001

e. International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

f. International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

g. International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, as published
by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001

h. National Electrical Code as currently adopted by the State of
Colorado.

i. International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001 (adopted by Ordinance 8 - Series 2011)

Section 2. Article 2 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Building Code
Section 18-2-10. International Building Code adopted.

(a) The International Building Code, 2009 Edition, ond printing, as published by the International
Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, Chapters 1
through 35 inclusive, exclusive of any Appendices, (“IBC”) is hereby adopted by reference as
the Town of Minturn Building Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions,
deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IBC, as adopted and as amended.

18



Section 18-2-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:

(1) Section 111.2 Certificate Issued shall read: “Final Certificate of Occupancy Inspection
approval shall be the Certificate of Occupancy.”

(2) Section 419.2 Occupancies. The following sentence shall be added: “F and I occupancies
shall not be permitted in a live/work unit.”

(3) Section 1029 Emergency Escapes and Rescue is amended to delete Exception 1

(4) Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Loads is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:
“Snow loads for roods and decks shall be 75 pounds per square foot.”

(5) Section 1809.5 Frost Protection. This section is amended by deleting the section in its
entirety and replacing it with the following language: “Foundation walls, piers and other
permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from frost by the
following method — Footings subject to frost shall have a minimum depth of 48”
measured from finished grade to the bottom of the footing or the depth specified by the
soils engineer of record.”

(6) Section 1809.12 Timber Footings is deleted in its entirety.

(7) Section 2111.13 Exterior Air Intake is amended by adding the following: “Outside
combustion air intake shall be required for all gas-fired and wood burning fireplaces.
Combustion air ducts shall be a minimum 26 gauge sheet metal for the portion of duct
extending through the building on the outside of the fire-resistive shaft. Ducts extending
from the fireplace and exiting directly to the outside without passing through any other
portion of the building may be of any material permitted by the fireplace manufacturer or
the International Mechanical Code. Fireplaces: Where dampers are required to be
removed, clamped or welded open- doors in front of fireplace openings are required.

(8) Section 3001.5 is amended to read as follows: “A fee for each permit and plan review
shall be paid to the Northwest Colorado Council of Governments. The annual certificate
of inspection will be administered by the certified elevator inspection agency. For permit
applications and inspections, contact Elevator Inspection Program at (970) 468-0295.
Ext. 108

Section 3. Article 3 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Residential Code

Section 18-3-10. International Residential Code adopted

19



(a) The International Residential Code, 2009 Edition, 2" printing, as published by the

International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC
20001, Chapters 1 through 44 inclusive and Appendices A, C, G, H, and N, (“IRC”) is
hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Residential Building Code as if
fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as
set forth in this Article.

(b) No residential building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or

moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of
materials and workmanship, conform with the IRC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-3-20. Amendments.

The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:

(1)

(2)

€)
“)

©)

(6)
(7

®)

)

Section R104.4 Inspections is amended by the addition of the following paragraph: “A
third party inspection by a certified log inspection agency shall be required of all
structural members in log framed buildings. A letter from the log grading agency
certifying log grades are in accordance with the plan specifications shall be required at,
or prior to frame inspection. Elevators installed in all structures shall require a third
party plan review and inspection by Northwest Colorado Council of Governments.”

Section R301.2.3 Snow Loads is amended by the addition of the following: “Snow
loads for roofs and decks shall be 75 pounds per square foot.”

Section R302.2.2 Townhouses is amended by the deletion of the exception.

Section R302.5.1 is amended by the addition of the following statement at the end,
Doors shall be self closing.

Section R302.7 is amended to read enclosed accessible spaces under stairs shall have
walls, under stair surfaces and any soffit protected on the enclosed side with 5/8” Type
X gypsum board.

Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems is deleted in its entirety.

Section R313.2 One and two-family dwelling automatic fire systems is deleted in its
entirety.

Section R315.1 Carbon Monoxide alarms is amended by deleting this section and
replacing it with the following language: “For new construction, an approved carbon
monoxide alarm shall be installed within fifteen feet of the entrance to each bedroom in
dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in dwelling units that
have attached garages.”

Section R403.1.4.1 Frost Protection is amended by deleting the section in its entirety
and replacing it with the following: “Foundation walls, piers, and other permanent
supports of buildings shall be protected from frost by the following method — Footings
subject to frost shall have a minimum depth of 48” measured from finished grade to the
bottom of the footing or the depth specified by the soils engineer of record.”

20



(10) Section R403.2 Footings for Wood Foundations is amended by adding the following:
“Foundations shall be designed by a registered Colorado Engineer or Architect and
approved by a Geotechnical Engineer.

(11) Section R403.3 Frost Protected Shallow Foundations is amended by adding the
following: “Foundations shall be designed by a registered Colorado Engineer or
Architect and approved by a Geotechnical Engineer.

(12) Section R404.2 Wood Foundation Walls is amended by adding the following:

“Foundations shall be designed by a registered Colorado Engineer or Architect and
approved by the Geotechnical Engineer.”

(13) Section G2425.8 (501.8) Equipment Not Required to be Vented is amended by deleting
item #7. The sentence after this exception should be amended to read: “Where the

appliances listed in [tems 5 and 6 above...”

(14) Section G2445 (621) is amended by removing all subsections and replacing it with
“Section G2445.1 General. Unvented room heaters are prohibited from installation.”

(15) Table R301.2(1) is amended by deleting it in its entirety and replacing it with the

following:
Table R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
Roof WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM | WINTER ICE BARRIER FLOOD AIR MEAN
Snow DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT | HAZARDS | FREEZING | ANNUAL
Speed | Topographic | DESIGN | Weathering | Frost | Termite
Load TEMP REQUIRED INDEX TEMP
effects line
(mph) CATEGORY
depth
75 90 NO B SEVERE 48" | NONE | -15°F YES 2007 2000 45°F
psf TO
SLIGHT

21




(16)

(17)

(18)

(19)

Table R302.6 is amended to read:

SEPERATION MATERIAL

not less than5/8” Type X gypsum board

From residence and attics applied on the garage side

From all habitable rooms above the garage | not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum board

Structure(s) supporting floor ceiling
assemblies used for separation required by | not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum board
this section

not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum board

Garages located less than 6 feet from a applied to the interior side of exterior
dwelling unit on the same lot walls of the garage that are within this
area

Add a new Section R303.1.2 Mechanical ventilation to read:

R303.1.2 Mechanical ventilation. Dwelling units shall be provided witha
mechanical exhaust system, supply system, or combination thereof to provide whole-
building ventilation with outdoor air. Such system shall comply with Section
R303.1.2.1 through R303.1.2.2.

Exception:

1. Other approved mechanical ventilation systems.

Add a new Section R303.1.2.1 Mechanical ventilation rate to read:

R303.1.2.1 Mechanical ventilation rate. The mechanical ventilation system shall
provide outdoor air continuously at a rate of not less than that determined in accordance
with Table R303.4(1)

Exception: Continuous operation of the system is not required where the system has
controls that enable operation for not less the 25% of each 6 hour segment and the
ventilation rate prescribed in Table R303.1.2.1 (1) is multiplied by the factor in
accordance with Table R303.1.2.1 (2)

Add a new table, TABLE R303.1.2.1 (1) to read:

TABLE R303.1.2.1 (1)

VENTILATION AIR REQUIREMENTS, CFM!
22




FLOOR BEDROOMS
?%')EA SQ. 0-1 23 4-5 67 >7
<1,500 30 45 60 75 90
1,500-3,000 45 60 75 90 105
3,001-4,500 60 75 90 105 120
4,501-6,000 75 90 105 120 135
6,001-7,500 90 105 120 135 150
>7,500 105 120 135 150 165

For SI: 1 square foot = 1 square foot = 0.0929 m2.

L.

Equation R303.1.2.1 (1) can be used as an alternative to Table R303.1.2.1 (1)

Qfan = 0.01 Afloor + 7.5 (Nbr + 1)

Where:

Qfan = fan flow rate in cubic feet per minute (cfm).
Afloor = floor area in square feet (ft2)
Nbr = number of bedrooms; not to be less than 1

(20) Add a new table, TABLE R303.1.2.1 (2) to read:

TABLE R303.1.2.1 (2)
INTERMITTENT MECHANICAL VENTILATION RATE FACTORS * b

Run-Time
Percentage
In each 6
hour
Segment

25%

33%

50%

66%

75%

Factor

1.5

1.3

a. Interpolation between entries is permitted.

b. The ventilation system run time shall be not less than 25%

(21) Add a new section R303.1.2.2, System design, to read:

R303.1.2.2 System design. The required whole-house ventilation system shall consist
of one or more supply or exhaust fans or a combination therof and associated ducts and
controls. Outdoor air ducts connected to the return side of an air handler shall be
considered to be supply ventilation where the manufacturer’s requirements for a

minimum return air temperature for the air handler are met.

(22) Add a new section R303.1.2.3 System Controls, to read:

23




R303.1.2.3 System Controls. The mechanical ventilation system shall be provided
with controls that enable occupant override.

(23) Add a new section R303.3.1 Bathroom ventilation to read:

R303.3.1 Bathroom ventilation. Bathrooms shall be mechanically exhausted in
accordance with section 1507.

Section 4. Article 4 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

International Fuel Gas Code
Section 18-4-10. International Fuel Gas Code adopted.

(a) The International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition 2™ printing as published by the International
Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, Chapters 1
through 8 inclusive, (“IFGC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Fuel Gas
Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as
set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IFGC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-4-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:
(1) Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations is amended by deleting exceptions number 3 and 4.

(2) Section 402.6.2 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Facilities and Piping is amending by the
addition of the following sentence: “Liquefied petroleum gas facilities and equipment
shall not be located in any pit or basement, under show windows or interior stairways, in
engine, boiler, heater, or electric meter rooms”. The following exception shall apply:
“equipment may be installed with an approved means of detection and removal of
unburned liquid petroleum gas. A minimum 3" drain pipe to the exterior of the building,
propane sensor and automatic safety shutoff shall be installed. The drain shall not be
trapped and shall be protected from snow closure and rodents. When the above listed
means cannot be achieved, an engineered mechanical exhaust system with a propane
sensor, and an automatic safety shut-off, shall be required”.

(3) Section 501.8 Equipment Not Required to be Vented is amended by the deletion of item
No. 8

24



Section 5. Article 6 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

International Energy Conservation Code
Section 18-5-10. International Energy Conservation Code adopted.

(a) The International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition 5™ printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001,
Chapters 1 through 6 inclusive, (“IECC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn
Energy Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and
changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IECC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-5-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:

(1) Chapter 1 Administration shall be deleted and chapter 1 of the IBC and IRC shall apply.

Section 6. Article 7 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

International Plumbing Code

(a) The International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition 3™ printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001,
Chapters 1 through 13 inclusive, (“IPC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of
Minturn Plumbing Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions,
insertions and changes as set forth in this Article. '

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the
Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship,
conform with the IPC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 7. Article 8 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Mechanical Code
Section 18-8-10. International Mechanical Code adopted.

(a) The International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition 4" printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001,
Chapters 1 through 15 inclusive, (“IMC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn
Mechanical Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and
changes as set forth in this Article.

25



(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IMC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 8. Article 9 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Property Maintenance Code
Section 18-9-10. International Property Maintenance Code adopted.

(a) The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition 1* printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, is
hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Property Maintenance Code as if fully set
out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this
Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IPMC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 9. Article 10 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed
and reenacted to read as follows:

National Electrical Code
Section 18-9-10. National Electrical Code adopted.

(a) The National Electrical Code, as published by the National Fire Protection Association, and
the rules and regulations thereunder, as adopted, amended and updated to the most current
edition by the Colorado State Electrical Board from time to time (“NEC”) pursuant to the
authority set forth in Article 23 of Title 12, C.R.S., is hereby adopted by reference as the City of
Centennial Electrical Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions,
insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the City
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the NEC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 10.  Severability. If any part, section, sub-section, clause or phrase of this
Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this Ordinance; and the Town Council for the Town of Minturn, Colorado
hereby declares it would have passed this ordinance and each part, section, sub-section, sentence,
clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more parts, sections, sub-
sections, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared invalid.

Section 11.  The Town Council hereby finds, determines and declares that this

26



Ordinance is necessary and proper for the health, safety and welfare of the Town of Minturn and
the inhabitants thereof.

Section 12.  The repeal or the repeal and re-enactment of any provision of the Minturn
Municipal Code as provided in this ordinance shall not affect any right which has accrued, and
duty imposed, any violation that occurred prior to the effective date hereof, any prosecution
commenced, nor any other action or proceeding as commenced under or by virtue of the
provision repealed or repealed and re-enacted. The repeal of any provision hereby shall not
revive any provision or any ordinance previously repealed or superseded unless expressly stated
herein.

INTRODUCED, TITLE READ IN FULL, APPROVED ON FIRST READING AND
ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL THE 72 DAY OF JULY, 2011. A PUBLIC
HEARING ON THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE HELD AT THE REGULAR MEETING
OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ON THE
_5 DAY OF AUGUST, 2011, AT 7 P.M. IN THE MINTURN TOWN CENTER IN THE
TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO.

/7/7, frtoa= //J:f/r i}u/>—7é/H
Sy

——

Attest:

= o

TO\I)fvn Clerk

THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE READ BY
TITLE, ENACTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED BY TITLE ONLY ON SECOND

READING THIS DAY OF , 2011.
Mayor

Attest:

Town Clerk

27



TOWN OF MINTURN ORDINANCE CHECKLIST

A - 2ot/
FIRST READING

) ff 2/l ' The ordinance shall be introduced and read by title at any regular or special
meeting. Copies shall be available to the public.

752 C/’ ”_ If the ordinance is approved on first reading, Mayor and Clerk must sign
ordinance after first reading. It shall be published in full in a newspaper of general
circulation within the Town. The minutes shall reflect number of votes for and against
each ordinance.

If the ordinance is tabled, it shall be reconsidered at subsequent meetings
until it is approved with or without amendment or rejected by vote of the Council.

% // The Council shall set a day, hour and place at which the Council shall
hold a public hearing on the ordinance, and notice of such day, hour and place shall be
included in the first publication.

SECOND READING

The ordinance shall be introduced a second time at the meeting at which
the public hearing on the ordinance is held. The ordinance may be read by title only on
second reading. The ordinance may be amended before final approval or rejection by
vote of the Council. The text of any such amendment or amendments shall be read in
full.

If the ordinance is substantially amended it shall be published in full after
final passage. If not amended in substance, it may be published either by title or in full,
as the Council may determine, after final passage.

The minutes shall reflect the number of votes for and against the ordinance.

A true copy of every ordinance shall be numbered and recorded in the
official records of the Town. Its adoption and publication shall be authenticated by the
signatures of the Mayor or Mayor Pro Tem and the Town Clerk and by the certificate of
publication. Proof of publication for both readings shall be attached to the ordinance.

The effective date of ordinances is seven (7) days after publication
following final passage unless a later date is prescribed in the ordinance.

28



Fri, Jul 22, 2011
6804958

Phone: (303)827-5645

E-Mail:

15:22:06

Ad Ticket #5

Name: Town of Minturn

Client:
Caller: Ja City: Mintun
Receipt State: CO Zip: 81645-0309

Ad Name: 6804958D
Editions: 8VD/8VDI/
Start: 07/25/11

Original Id: 6804915

Class: 0990
Stop: 07/25/11

Color: |SSUE 1
Copyline: 6804958 2-2 Ordinance No 5-2011 Rep: Pam Schultz
Lines: 0 T e T o
Depth: 10 i =re METR
Columns: 5
Discount: 0.00
Commission: 0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00 fifﬁfil*""’"*::“‘::;“:':;ﬁ::“" i

g b e i

Ad shown is not actual print size

29



Fri, Jul 22, 2011
6804915

Acct: 1003134
Phone: (303)827-5645

15:20:36

Ad Ticket #5

N ame: Town of Minturn

E-Mail:
Client:
Caller: ' City; Minturn
Receipt State: CO Zip: 81645-0309

Ad Name: 6804915D

Editions: 8VD/8VDI/
Start: 07/25/11
Color:

Copyline: 6804915 1-2 Ordinance No 5-2011

Original Id: 6804893
Class: 0990
Stop: 07/25111

Issue 1
Rep: Pam Schultz

Lines: 0
Depth: 15
Columns: 5
Discount: 0.00
Commission: . 0.00
Net: 0.00
Tax: 0.00
Payment 0.00

Ad shown is not actual print size

30



TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. 5 < SERIES 1011

AN ORDINA?I’CI OF TM! m\\'ﬁ OF MINTURN REPEALING AND REENACTING ARTICLES 1< AND 548 OF
CHA! HE F MINTURN MUNICIPAL WDI ARD RIPMCIN THOSE ’L'llmlmlél"rn-};

ITIONS O
RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS mbl. INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSI
INTERNATIONAL PLUMDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL RNATIMMI- I‘RGI‘II‘“'
MAINTENANCE CODE AND THE RATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE AS CURRENTLY ADOPTED BY THE STATE
OF COLORADO

WHEREAS, in promotion n|’ u.. Fhlie hsalth, urnq- and wdmn of the Inhablianis of ihe Town of Mintum, the Tovwn Cainel
dasdres 1o wpdate lis adapting uilding Codes with amendm mis; &

WHEREAS, secticn 11,11 of he Home Rule Charter and seation 31-16-202, .3, as amendaed, permit the contemplaled adoption
by reference of such codes upon notice ind hearing as provided in Scction 3116200, CRE: and

WHEHREAS, ihe Mintum Town Councll held s public hearing. %a coniider dapl 1] el

Codes ua required by law; an
WHEREAS, copies of 1aid Intematianal Codes are available in the Planniag OfMee i the Mintum Town Cantar; and

WHEREAS, the Tovwn Council b based on b h diat the adoptl
of thass codes, ax smended herin, will furiher ihe healih, safaty and welfure of ihe inhabitante of Mintumn; and

HOW, THEREFORE, THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORAD D, ORDAINS 53 follaws:

Section 1, Articls | of Chapior 18 of the Mintum Municipal Code is berehy repealed and recnacted 1o read a follows:
Seetlon 18110, Tiile

The provisions of the ordinance codified herein shall be Inow snd elted collectively ax the “Town of Miatum Building Code™ of
“Intemativnsl Codes.”

Sacilon 18-1-20. Codes wdopiul.
(U] The Town of Mintum sdopti by relerence the ollawing cader:

a Iniernational Bllding Cada, 2000 Ediiion, as published by e Intemstionsl Cade Council, 100
Hew Jersey Avenue, HW, 6ih Floor, Washingion, DC 20001

& Tsmmational Restdantiol Cody, 2009 Edition, ux published by the Inemations! Code Council,
300 Mew Jetsey Avenws, HW, éih Floor, Waikingiea, DC 20001

[ Indernational Fud e Code, mmhl.upbliuhulbrdwll\lmlﬂnul Code Council, 300
Haw Jarssy Avanus, NW, éih Floor, Washingion, D 2000

d Tnnernational Energy Conservarion Code, 2009 Edition as published by the Intemational Code
Council, 360 New Jorey Avenue, HW, Gith Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001

& Tueenational Plumbing Code, 1009 Edition, as published by the Iniematioas] Code Council,
300 Hew Jeney Avenus, MW, dih Floor, Washingion, DC 20001

s Truernationsd Afechoviea] Code, 2009 Edbtvon, as publithed by the Intmatioasl Code Council,
300 Mew Jeiey Aveniie, NW, 6ih Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001

A e, Ei a3 published by the Iniemstional Code
Cruneil, 300 New Jersey Avenue, NW, Gth Floor, Wubingion, DC 20001

o Novonal Elecerieal Code as currenrly adopred by the Stare of Colorada.

i Twervational Fire Code, 2000 Edton, ax pullished Yy e Titeratisnn] Code Counil, 100
New Jersey Avense, Nl?ﬁibm Wishingion, DC 20001 (udopied by Ordinmce & = Serter
1)

Seetion X Aniele T of Chapier 18 of the Minnm Municipal Coxle is hereby repealed ind reenseied 1 resd as follows:
il ding Caide
Section 18-2-10. Internstionsl flullding Code sdapted,

(a) The fiermatianal Biillding Code, 2000 Editian, 29
Floar, Waikinglon, BC 20001, Chaplers | through 33 inclusive, exclusive of any
Mintum Building Coda ss I fully set oat b this Onfinsnce with the additions, del

s published by the Intemationa! Cade Council, 360 Mew Jerasy Avenue, HW, 6l
dices, (*IUE") s hervby sdopted by reference as ihe Town of
ons, insertions and chianges aa st forth ia this Article.

{b) M building shall be hereafler convincied, rrecied, mlarged, sliered, or moved into ibs Town wnloss the suns shall, & i design, conviruciion,
quility of matedials aad workmanthip, confarm wih the INC, sx sdopied snd as smended.

Seetion 18-2.20. Amendments.
The following seciions of the sdopied cede are herelry revised as fallows:

() Sestion 1112 Cenificate Issved shall read: “Fiasl Cenifieate of Ocoupmisy lnspection spproval shall be the Canifieste of
Doupanay.”

@) Sestion 4193 Occupansier. The followisg senieace shall be added. “F and | oecupansies shall noi be prrmitied in o live'wmk
uniL”

(¥)  Section 1029 Emergeney Escapes and Reseva [s amended 1o delets Evewphion {

{4)  Section 16082 Oround Snow Laady iv herebry delstad and replaced with the following: “Snow loads for reods snd decks thall he 75
pounds per square fool.”

(#)  Secion 1609.5 Frost Prowection. This ssction Is amendad by delating the section In s entirety and replaciag It with the following
Ianguage: "Faundation walls, plers and ather permanent supporis of bulldings and sinictires shall bs protecied from feit by iha
following method = Footlngs subject 1o frost shall have 8 minimum depih of 487 measured from fnished grade 1o the botiom of ihe
Tiocting ov the depth specified by the soils enpineer of recand*

(6)  Seation 130912 Timber Footings is deleted ia it entirety,

(1) Section 211113 Exterior Air Intake is amended by adding the following: “Oubide combustion sly intake shall be requived forsll |n-
fired and wood buming fiplaces. Combution alr ducts shall ke & mindrum 26 gauge shest metsl for the partion of

i i hallk iredalal I memben b log fis Alatiar from the eantifying
I ) i with the pl; shall be required al. or prios ie frame inspection, Elevators initalled in all
siruetures shall require n ihind pany phn review and inspection by Horihwedl Colotada Coundil of Governments.™

[+1] Secilon R101.2.3 Snow Loads is amended by the sddition of the lollowing: “Sacw lasdi for isafs snd desks shall be 75 pounch
per acgiaie oo™

4] Section R102 33 Townhoused ls amended by the delelion of ihe excapiion,
) Sectlon RI023.1 Is smendod by the sdition of the following Matement at the end, Doors hall be self cloving.

[} Section RI02.7 ir amended 1o resd encloied necensible spaces under siain shall have nalls. undss ﬂllr mifices aad day soflil
protected on the enclosed side with /8" Type X pypsum board,

(] Section B3, 1 Townhouse sutomatic fre sprinkler nyatema is deleted in f1a entivety,
] Section R313 3 One and two-family dwelling suomatic flie sysiems is deloled in its enliniy.

[]] Section K315.1 Carbon Monuxide alams is smended by deleting ibis section and replacing it with the following language. “Foi
new eonftiuction, an appreved catben mencxdde slarm shall be installed within filiesn feet of tha entrance to each bedmam in
dwlling unite within which fucl-fired spplisnces are instslled and [ dwelling vnits that have snached garges *

@) Beation R40Y.14.1 Frosi Proleoiion is amended by deleiing the seciion in its entimsty and replacing it with the fellowing:
“Foundation walls, piees, and oiher permaneat supporis of bulldings shall be protecied from frost by the following method -
Footing# rubject lo font ihall have & minimumm depth of 44 measured from finlihed grads to the bottom of tha foting ar the depih
spacified by the solls engineer of ecard”

{10y Seciion R4012 thll for Wood Foundailons is amended iy wdding ihe following: “Foundstions shall be desiged by o
reginisred Calorada F appraved by & Or Enginect,
{an Section R401.3 Fron Protecied Shalluw Foundstions is smended by sdding ihe lollowing: "Foundations shall be designad by &
regivered Colorado Engir rehi d npp y Engineer.
an Seetish R404.2 Wood Foundatien Walls s smeaded by sdding the following: “Foundations shall be derigned by s sgistared
Colorada Enginesr or Architect and approved by the Ceotechnical Engineer.”
{1 Seetion 02425 B (301.8) Equiprent Hol Required 10 be Vented is smended by deleting liem #7. The senience sfler ihis
exeeption shauld be smended 1o read: *Where the applisnees lived in Tteme 3 and 6 abave..,”
[40}] Seclion 02445 (621) |1 amended by remosing ill subsections snd replasing It with “Section G2445.1 Genend. Unvented mam
hesters air piokibited from installation.”
[{5}] Table RI012{1)is deleting itin Ty fel fih the following
Table RI012(1)
CLIMATIC ARD GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
Roof | WIND DESIGN | SEISMIC | SURJECT TO WINTER| ICEBARRIER | FLOOD Al MEAN
Enew FROM DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT [HAZ ZINGANNUAL
Losd i;md}'hvmrlpm- DESIGN  |Weathering| Frost | Termite| TEMP REQUIRED INDEX | TEMP
wlfecla Tine
(mphy CATEGORY| dapth
TEpal| $0 NGO L] SEVERE | 41" | NONE | «15°F VES 1007 2000 &' F
O
LAGIT
{16) Table K302.6 |s umended 1o cead:
SEPERATION MATERIAL
Fi sidence mad atfics Sensihand/8” Type ¥ gvomm board spolied on the gamge sids
Faixa all habitable gamage it Jesi thas 58" Tipe X popsiim boand
gl ot less than 58 Type X gypsum baarl
acparafion ssction.
arges located less than & fost from a dwelling unit on uol fasn than 8* Type X gypoum basrd applied (o the inverior ride of exierior
bz 2ame Lot wallsof the gamgs that are within this asa
017y Add s new Section R181.1.2 Mechanical veniilation fa read:
11303.1.2 Mechanleal Drwelling provided with s wipply syste
womblnaiion ihereol io provide whole-bullding ventilatlon Ml}dﬂ\‘ﬂl sl Such system ﬂllmply vlllh Suihn N.'Im 121
through R303.122.
Excaptlon:

1, Other appruved mechanizal ventilatisn systems.

(1) Add s aew Seetion A300.1.2.1 Mechanical ventilation rate 1o read:

R3os1L2E raie
o

venlilation systam shall provide suldoor sl continususly &1 a e of
thai in

with Table R303.4(1)

Exception: l.'.mllnuw:o rathon ul'LIu ilmu Mwl\mlh bas contrls thit en ihle opemtion for ot
less iha 23% of esch & B 'F"" '!“ |.mmu|2|(13 Ilullllgdlhn'yﬁinuuh
ateordance with Table R30]. 1.}.I m

(19)  Add s new lable, TABLE R301.1.2.1 (1) 10 reail:

TAILE 03,131 (1)
VENTILATION AIR REQUIREMENTS, CRMY

though the building on the outside of the Rre-fesistive ihall. Dueti extendin g fom the Greplace and exiting dirclly 1 Uie cutaide
withoul passing through any ather pantion af the huilding may be of any material pemined by the fireplsce manufacwrar of the
Intematinaal Mechanical Code. Fireplaces: Where dampers are required 1o b removed, elamped or welded apen- doars I frant of
fireploce openings are required.

(F)  Seclion 30013 i dedioread s follows: “A fee for each and plan reviow shall be paid 1o ihs Norbwes: Col

odommmmln. The IMHI| uﬂiﬂm oNnrpulnm will ba u!mlnlmndw the cantified alovalor invpection sgency. For pamil
Peogiarn a1 {970) 468-0295. Fx1. 108

Bastlond, Anicle 3 of Chaptar 1§ of the Minwm Munfcipal Code iv heraby repoaled and reenscted 1o read aa follows:
Resfdential Code
Section 18310, Internstionsl Residintal Cods aidopred

() Thelaiemational Resdential Code, 3000 Edition, 2 printing. as published by the Iniemstional Coda Council, 500 New Jersey
Avenne, NW, dih Floor, Warhingion, DE 20001, Chaplers § through 44 inclusive md Appendices A. €, 4, H. snd N, ("IRC™}
Ia hareby wdopted by referenes an the Tows of Mintim Residential Daliding Code as if fully vet out in this Ordlnsnce, with the
additicas, deletions, insertions aad ek sal farth in this Astiel

(0] Nn resideniial building shall be hereafier mnlmm‘ nttlad |, enlarged, aliered, or moved inio the Town unless the same shall, ss
desipn. quality of materials conform with the IR, a1 adopled and as i

Sectlon 18320, Amendmienis
The following sestions of the sdopted cods are hereby revised s follows:

i Heclion R104.4 Inspections iv smended by the sddition of the follawing paragraph: “A third party inspection by & cenified log

FLODRAREA (80 HENROOMS.
EL), [iN] 2] L5 .1 =1

<1500 an i i 2% (1]

do Connsil 1,400-3,000 i 0 7 20 108
210914500 i b7 0 105 120

A501.6,000 28 50| 10% 120 138

60013500 ap 104 ii0 135 140

=140 104 120 133 140 ifid

For S1: | square foot = | square foot = 0.0920 m2,
I Equation RI03.1.2.1 (1) can bs used a3 an allemative o Tabla RIDL12.1 (1)
Qi = 0.01 Alloas + 7.3 (Hor + 1)
Where:
Qfsa = faa low raie in cuble fest par minuta (< fin).
Alloos = Moo area in square feet (2}
Mt = mumber of bedioom s nol (o be less ihan |

(30)  Add anew isble, TABLE RI03,1.2.1 2) io read:

31



TABLER303.1.2.1 ()
INTERMITTENT MECHANICAL VENTILATION RATE FACTORS 0 [0

Run-Time Percentage In 5% 13% 0% 66% 5%
each & haur Segment
Encior i ] B § LS Ll

8, Inteepalation between enirics s pormiuted.
b The ventilation system run time shall be not less than 25%
(21)  Add o new seetion R303.1.2.2, Bystem design, Lo read:

R303.1.2.2 System Juslgn. The required whole-house ventilation sysiem shall consist of one or more supply or exhaust fans

ora ion therof and inted dueta and eontroly, Dutdoor air duets conneeted W the retum side of an sir handler shall
ba 10 be supply ventilation where the qui A mini retum sir for the alr
handler are met.

(12)  Add n new sectien R101.1.2, System Controls, to read:
R303.1.2.3 System Contrals, The mechanical ventilation system shall be provided with controls that ensble aceupant override,

(23)  Add & new seetion R303.3,1 Bathroom ventilalion to read:

R303.3.1 shall be y din 4 with eection 1507,
Seelian4, Article 4 of Chapler 18 of the Mintum Municipal Cade is heroby repealed and reenseted 1o read as follows:
Intermatianal Fuel Gas Caile
Section 18-4-10. Intornatlonal Fuel Gas Code ndapied.

(n) The Infernatlanal Fuel Gas Codle, 2009 Editlon 24 printing as published by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenve, NW, 61k
Floar, Washington, DC 20001, Chaplers | through B inelusive, ("IFGC™ is hereby adopted by reforence aa the Tawn of Mintum Fuel Gas Code as
il fully set out in this Ordinsnce with the ndditions, deletions, insertions and ehanges ax set forth in this Anticle.

(b) No building shall be hereafer constructed, erected, enlatged, sltered, af moved inta the Town unless the same shall, o3 16 design, constniction,
quality af materials and workmanship, eanform wilh the IFGC, as adopted and as smended.

Section 18-4-10, Amendmenis,
The flollowing sections of the adopied cada are hereby revised as follaws:
(1} Seetion 3023 Prohibiled Locations [s smended by deleting exceplions number 3 and 4.

(2} Section 402,62 Liquefied Petyoleum Gy Facilities und Piping ix smending by the nddition of the following sentenee: “Liguefied
petrcleum gas fachlities and equipment shall ot be located in sny pit or basement, under show windows or interior stairways, in
englne, bollet, hester, ar electrio meler rooms™. The follawlng exception shall apply: “squipment may ba installed with an spproved
meana af deteotion and remaval of unburmed liquid petraleum gas. A minimum 3° dmin pipe lo the exterior of the bullding, propane
sensor and automatie safety shutefT thall be installed. The drwin shall not be trapped and shall be prolected from wnaw clasure and
rodents. When the above listed means cannot be achleved, sn engineered mechanical exhaus! system with a propana sensor, and an
autamalie safety shul-off, shall be required”,

(3)  Section 501.8 Equipment Mot Required 1o be Vanied is amended by the delztion of ilem No. 8
Secllan & Artlele & of Chapter 18 of the Mintum Munioipal Code is hereby repealed and reenicted to read as follows:
Inlernatianal Energy Conservation Code
Seation 18510, International Energy Conservallon Code ndopted,

) The Jaternational Energy Conservation Code, 2003 Edition 3* printing sy publithed by the International Code Couneil, 500 New Jersey Avenue,
NW, 6th Floar, Washinglon, DC 20001, Chapters | tiough 6 inclusive, ('IECC") is hereby ndopied by reference s the Town of Minwm Energy
Code axif fully set oul in this Ordinance with the addilions, deletions, insertions and changes as st forth in this Asticle.

(&) Mo building shall be hereafler constiucted, erccled, enlarged, altered, or moved (nto the Town unless tha sama shall, as to design,

Bection 7, Anticle 8 of Chapler 18 of the Minturm Municipal Cods §i hercliy repealed anid reenacted to read as follows:
Mechanical Code
Section 15-5-10. International Mochanleal Code adopted.

{8) The International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition 4* printing as published by the Intemational Code Council, 500 Now Jersay Avenus, NW, 6tk
Fleor, Wuhinglan, DC 20001, Chapters | Urough 13 inclusive, ("[MC") Is hereby adapted by reference as the Tewn of Mintum Mechanieal Code
a3l fully sei out in this Ordinance with the additions, daletions, insertions and changes s zet forth in this Anticle.

() Mo building shall ba hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved inta the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction,
wquality of materials and workmanship, eonform with the IMC, as adopied and as nmended.

Section B, Anicle 9 of Chapter 18 af the Minturn Municipal Coda is heroby ropealed and reenncted 1o read as follaws:
Property Maintenance Code

Bection 15-9-10, T Code adopted.

Property

(8) The Jnternelional Properiy Malutenance Code, 7009 Edition 1* printing as published by the Intemational Cede Couneil, 500 Mew Jersey Avenue
HW, fith Floor, Washingfon, DC 20001, is hereby adopled by reference a3 the Town of Mintum Property Maintenance Code ax if fully set out in thit
Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes s set forth in this Article.

{b) No bullding shall be hereafier constructed, erected, enlarged, allered, ar moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction,
guality of matetials and workmanship, canform with the IPMC, ss adopled and as smended.

{ection % Article 10 of Chapler 1B of the Mintum Munleipal Code {s hereby repealed and reenseied 1o read as followa;
Mational Electrical Code
Sectlon 18:9:10. Naiional Eleetrieal Cade adopted,

(a) The National Electrical Code, as published by the Mational Fire Protection Assooiation, and the niles and regulations thereunder, as adopted
amended and updated o the most ourrent edition by the Colorado State Electrieal Board from time o time ("NEC™) pursuant to the sulhority set forlk
inArficle 23 of Title 12, CR.8,, s hereby adopied by referance as the City of Centennial Electrical Code a1 if fully set out in this Ordinance with the
edditions, deletions, insertions and changos ax sot forth in this Artigle.

(b} Mo buildi ba herealtor , ereoted, enlarged, altered, or moved inte the City usless the same ehall, a1 1a design, construction,
quality of materials and sworkmanship, conform with the NEC, as adopied and as amended.

Hection 10.  Sevembility, 1M any wection, sub-tection, clause or phase of this
Ordinance ix for eny reason held to ba invalid, such deeisian shall nat affeet the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinanca; and the Towr
Caunel for the Town af Mintum, Colorado hereby declares it would have passed this ordinance and each part, sectlon, sub-section, sentence, elause
of phrass thereol, imespective of the fol the any one or more parts, sections, sub-seclicns, senlences, clausos ar phrases bo dealared invalid.

Sectlon 11 The Town Council hereby finds, determines and declares that this
Ordinance is necessary and proper for the health, safety nnd welfare of the Town of Minturm and the Inhabitants thereal,

SeelianlZ.  The repeal or the repeal and re-enactment of n
Municipal Code ns provided in this ordinance shall not afTect sny right which has accrued, a
effective daie hereof, lnyurnueulion sommencad, nor any other action or proceeding s
or repealed and resenscled. The repeal of eny provision hareby shall not revive any provision or any
unless expressly ataled hervin.

provision of the Mintum

ined duty im| any vielation st eeuved prie to the
mmmm or by vinua of the provision repealed
repealed o b

INTRODUCED, TITLE READ IN FULL, AFPROVED ON FIRST READING AND ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL THE DAY
OF JULY, 2011, A PUBLIC HEARING ON THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE HELD AT THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE TOWR
COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ONTHE ___ DAY OF AUGUST, 2011, AT 7F:M. IN THE MINTURN TOWR
CENTER IN THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO.

Muyor

Attest:

quality of muterinls and workmanship, conform with the 1ECC, as sdopled and ax amended.
Seetion 18-5-20, Amendmenis.
The follawing seotions of the sdopted eode are horeby revited as follaws:
(1) Chapter | Adminisiration shall be deleted and chapter | of the IBC and IRC shall spply.
Seelinn. 6, Articlo 7 of Chapter 18 of the Mintum Munieipal Cods is heraby repealed and reennoted 1o read as follows:
International Plumbing Code

(&) The Internailonal Phuibing Code, 2009 Edition 3 printing as published by the Intemational Cods Counell, 00 New Jerscy Avenue, MW, éth
Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001, Chapters | through 13 inclusive, ('IPC) is hereby sdopied by reference s the Town of Mintum Flumbing Code as
i Tully sei out in this Ordi with i deletions, insertions and changes ad 5ot forth in this Article.

(1) Me bullding shall be herealler consinuated, ereeted, enlarged, sltered, or moved inio the Town unless the sume shall, as ta design, censiruction,
quality of materinle and workmanship, eonform withi the IPC, as adopled and a5 smended.

Town Clerk

THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE READ BY TITLE, ENACTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED
BY TITLE ONLY ON SECOND READING THIS DAY OF 2011,

Mayor

Anet:

Town Clerk

Published in the Vail Daily on July 26, 2011.

32



P.O. Box 309 ¢ 302 Pine Street
Minturn, CO 81645
Phone: 970-827-5645
Fax: 970-827-5545
Jay Brunvand, Treasurer/Clerk
Email: treasurer@minturn.org

TOWN COUNCIL
Mayor — Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty
Mayor Pro Tem — George Brodin
Councilwoman - Shelley Bellm
Councilman - Earle Bidez
Councilman - Jerry Bumgarner
Councilman - Aggie Martinez
Councilman - John Rosenfeld

AGENDA ITEM COVER SHEET

AGENDA TITLE: Ordinance No. 11 — 2011 (Second Reading) consideration of a Franchise Agreement
with Holy Cross Energy

MEETING DATE: August 3, 2011

PRESENTER: Brunvand

e BACKGROUND:
During the past several meetings, Council has reviewed this Ordinance in detail. All concerns are
reflected as have been discussed. This Ordinance passed on first reading at the July 20, 2011 meeting with
no concerns.

CORE ISSUES:

STAFF RECOMMENDATION/MOTION: Motion to approve Ordinance 11 — 2011 on Second
Reading an Ordinance OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, EAGLE COUNTY, COLORADO, GRANTING A
FRANCHISE TO HOLY CROSS ENERGY, ITS SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS, TO LOCATE, BUILD,
INSTALL, CONSTRUCT, ACQUIRE, PURCHASE, EXTEND, MAINTAIN, REPAIR AND OPERATE INTO,
WITHIN AND THROUGH A PORTION OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, DEFINED AS THE SERVICE AREA,
ALL NECESSARY AND CONVENIENT FACILITIES FOR THE PURCHASE, GENERATION,
TRANSMISSION AND DISTRIBUTION OF ELECTRICAL ENERGY, AND TO FURNISH, SELL AND
DISTRIBUTE SAID ELECTRICAL ENERGY TO THE RESIDENTS OF THE SERVICE AREA FOR LIGHT,
HEAT, POWER AND OTHER PURPOSES BY MEANS OF CONDUITS, CABLES, POLES AND WIRES
STRUNG THEREON, OR OTHERWISE ON, OVER, UNDER, ALONG, ACROSS AND THROUGH ALL
PUBLIC EASEMENTS AND ALL STREETS AND OTHER PUBLIC WAYS IN SAID SERVICE AREA, AND
FIXING THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS THEREOF.

33



TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO

ORDINANCE NO. 11 - Series of 2011

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, EAGLE COUNTY, COLORADO, GRANTING A
FRANCHISE TO HOLY CROSS ENERGY, ITS SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS, TO LOCATE, BUILD,
INSTALL, CONSTRUCT, ACQUIRE, PURCHASE, EXTEND, MAINTAIN, REPAIR AND OPERATE
INTO, WITHIN AND THROUGH A PORTION OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, DEFINED AS THE
SERVICE AREA, ALL NECESSARY AND CONVENIENT FACILITIES FOR THE PURCHASE,
GENERATION, TRANSMISSION AND DISTRIBUTION OF ELECTRICAL ENERGY, AND TO
FURNISH, SELL AND DISTRIBUTE SAID ELECTRICAL ENERGY TO THE RESIDENTS OF THE
SERVICE AREA FOR LIGHT, HEAT, POWER AND OTHER PURPOSES BY MEANS OF
CONDUITS, CABLES, POLES AND WIRES STRUNG THEREON, OR OTHERWISE ON, OVER,
UNDER, ALONG, ACROSS AND THROUGH ALL PUBLIC EASEMENTS AND ALL STREETS AND
OTHER PUBLIC WAYS IN SAID SERVICE AREA, AND FIXING THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS
THEREOF.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO:

ARTICLE 1
SHORT TITLE
1.1 This Ordinance shall be known and may be cited as the “Holy Cross Energy
Franchise Ordinance.”

ARTICLE 2
DEFINITIONS
For the purpose of this Ordinance, the following terms shall have the meaning given
herein;
2.1 “Town” is the Town of Minturn, Eagle County, Colorado, the municipal
corporation as is now constituted or as the same may be enlarged or expanded
from time to time through annexation.

2.2 “Company” refers to Holy Cross Energy, a Colorado corporation, its successors
and assigns.
2.3 “Service Area” refers to all land inside the municipal boundaries of the Town, as

of the enactment of this Ordinance, and all land annexed within such boundaries
hereafter, within the area certified to the Company by the Public Utilities
Commission of the State of Colorado.

2.4 “Council” refers to the legislative body of the Town, known as the Town Council
of the Town of Minturn, Colorado.
2.5 “Facilities” refers to all overhead and underground electric facilities, buildings

and structures owned by the Company which are necessary to provide electricity
into, within and through the Town including, but not limited to, such essential
apparatus, appliances, plants, systems, substations, works, transmission and
distribution lines, structures, anchors, cabinets, cables, conduits, guy posts, guy
wires, meters, microwave, communication facilities, overhead and underground
lines, pedestals, poles, regulators, sectionalizers, switchgears, transformers,

Page 1 of 15

34



2.6

2.7

2.8

2.9

2.10

3.1

3.2

3.3

various pad mounted and pole mounted equipment, vaults, wires and all other
related electrical equipment required for the distribution, generation,
maintenance, operation, purchase and transmission of electrical energy.

“Public Easements” refers to easements created by general dedication and
available for use by any public utility for its facilities

“Private Easements” refers to easements created by deed, specific dedication to
specific grantees or acquired by the Company by prescriptive right and available
only for use by the Company for its Facilities, or by the Company and other users
or utilities specifically named as grantees in the deed of dedication or which have
also acquired the easement by prescriptive right.

“Residents” refers to and includes all persons, businesses, industry,
governmental agencies and any other entity whatsoever, presently maintaining a
residence, business, farm, ranch or other enterprise located within, in whole or in
part, the boundaries of the Town.

“Revenues”, unless otherwise specified, refers to and are the gross amounts of
money that the Company receives from its customers within the Town from the
sale or delivery of electrical energy for any particular period of time.

“Streets and Other Public Ways” refers to streets, alleys, viaducts, bridges, roads,
lanes and other public ways in the Town, subject to limitations stated herein.

ARTICLE 3
GRANT OF FRANCHISE

Grant of Right to Serve. Subject to the conditions, terms and provisions
contained in this Franchise, the Town hereby grants to the Company a non-
exclusive right, privilege and authority to locate, build, install, construct, acquire,
purchase, extend, maintain, repair and operate into, within and through all of the
Service Area, all necessary and convenient Facilities for the purchase, generation,
transmission and distribution of electrical energy. Such grant is made together
with the exclusive right and privilege to furnish, sell and distribute said electrical
energy to the Residents for light, heat, power and other purposes.

Scope of Grant. Such grant includes the non-exclusive right and obligation to
furnish electrical energy using the Company Facilities on, over, under, along,
across and through any and all Public Easements and all Streets and Other Public
Ways, on, over, under, along, across and through any extension, connection
with, or continuation of, the same and/or on, over, under, along, across and
through any and all such new Public Easements and Streets and Other Public
Ways as may be hereafter laid out, opened, located or constructed within the
Service Area. The Company is further granted the right, privilege and authority
to excavate in, occupy and use any and all Streets and Other Public Ways and
Public Easements. Any such excavation, occupation and use must be in
accordance with Town standards and regulations, and will be undertaken under
the supervision of the properly constituted authority of the Town for the purpose
of bringing electrical energy into, within and through the Service Area and
supplying electrical energy to the Residents.

Service to Town Facilities. The Town hereby grants to the Company the non-
exclusive right, privilege and authority to provide street and security lighting to
the Town, and to serve all Town owned or operated structures, plants,

Page 2 of 15

35



4.1

4.2

4.3

4.4

4.5

4.6

equipment or Town apparatus and facilities, including the right, privilege and
authority to furnish, sell and distribute electrical energy necessary for such.

ARTICLE 4
SPECIFIC ELEMENTS OF GRANT
Recreational Areas. The Company shall not have the right to locate, build or

construct Facilities under, across or through public parks or recreational areas,
open space or other Town owned property located within the Town except as
expressly set forth in this Franchise or with prior written approval granted by the
Council. Said approval shall not be unreasonably withheld.

Trees and Shrubs. The Company shall have the right to trim or cut down such
trees and shrubbery and to control the growth of the same by machinery or
otherwise but shall not use chemicals for such purpose, only as may be
reasonably necessary to protect its Facilities as provided for in the Company
“Vegetation Management Guidelines” as such may from time to time be
amended.

Location of Company’s Facilities. Wherever reasonable and practicable, the
Company will endeavor to install its Facilities within Public Easements. The
Company shall locate its Facilities within the Town so as to cause minimum
interference with any of the Town's facilities or property, including without
limitation water lines, sewer lines, storm drains and the proper use of Streets
and Other Public Ways, and so as to cause minimum interference with the rights
or reasonable convenience of property owners whose property adjoins any of the
said Streets and Other Public Ways.

Restoration of Public and Private Improvements. Should it become necessary for
the Company, in exercising its rights and performing its duties hereunder, to
interfere with any sidewalk, graveled or paved street, road, alley, water line,
sewer line, storm drain or any other public or private improvement, the Company
shall at its own expense and in a quality workmanlike manner, repair or cause to
be repaired and restored to its original condition such sidewalk, graveled or
paved street, road, alley, water line, sewer line, storm drain or other public or
private improvement after the installation of its Facilities. However, upon failure
of the Company to do such required repairs within a reasonable time and in a
workmanlike manner, the Town may perform the required work and charge the
Company for all reasonable costs thereof. Nothing hereinabove shall be
construed to obligate the Company to pay for the removal and relocation of its
Facilities where such is at the request or demand of a person, or a public or
private entity under circumstances which require the party requesting or
demanding such to pay for the relocation under other provisions hereof or under
the provisions of the Company’s Electric Service Tariffs, Rules and Requlations or
other customary practices, as such may from time to time be amended.

Use of Facilities. The Company shall have the right to make-such use of its
Facilities and other property owned by Company, for uses other than the uses
contemplated in this Franchise Ordinance, as it deems proper so long as such
other uses do not interfere with its ability to supply electrical energy, consistent
with the then current zoning.

Changed Conditions (Overhead). If at any time it shall be necessary to change
the position of any overhead electrical facilities of the Company located within

Page 3 of 15

36



4.7

4.8

4.9

4.10

Public Easements or Streets and Other Public Ways to permit the Town to lay,
make or change street grades, pavements, sewers, water mains, storm drains or
other Town works, such changes shall be made by the Company at its own
expense, after reasonable notice from the Town. Any necessary position change
of overhead electrical facilities of the Company located within Private Easements
will be paid for by the person, or private or public entity requesting such change.
The Town shall consult with the Company during the design of any such Town
works which may require relocation of existing overhead electrical facilities of
the Company and work with the Company to ensure that any relocation
necessary is minimized and that a location for the relocated Facilities is
provided.

Compliance with Town Ordinances. The Company shall comply with all Town
ordinances and regulations regarding curb and pavement cuts, excavating,
digging and related construction, maintenance and operational activities. If
requested by the Town, the Company shall submit copies of reports of annual
and long-term planning for capital improvement projects with descriptions of
required street cuts, excavation, digging and related construction activities
within 30 days after issuance of request.

Town Review of Construction and Design. Prior to construction of any significant
Facilities within the Town, as determined jointly by the Company and Town, the
Company shall furnish to the Town the plans for such proposed construction. In
addition, the Company shall assess and report on the impact of such proposed
construction on the Town environment. Such plans and reports may be reviewed
by the Town to ascertain, inter alia, (1) that all applicable laws including building
and zoning codes, air and water pollution regulations are complied with, (2) that
aesthetic and good planning principles have been given due consideration and
(3) that adverse impact on the environment has been minimized.

Capital Improvement and Major Development Projects. The Company and the
Town shall endeavor to inform one another of any capital improvement and
major development projects anticipated within the Town that may impact the
Facilities or operations of either party. The party proposing such capital
improvements shall inform the other party of the nature of such improvements
within a reasonable time after plans for such improvements have been
substantially formulated. Each party shall cooperate in the timely exchange of all
necessary information, design data, drawings and reports to properly assess and
evaluate the potential impacts of said improvements and major developments.
Maintenance of Facilities. The Company shall install, maintain, repair, replace
and upgrade its Facilities to ensure both the adequacy of and quality of, electric
service to the Town and all Residents. All excavation and construction work
done by or under the authority of the Company shall be done in a timely and
expeditious manner which minimizes the inconvenience to the Town and all
Residents. The Town shall have the right to inspect any portion of the Facilities
located in the Streets or Other Public Ways. However, the Town will not require
construction of the Facilities in such a manner that would not meet the National
Electrical Safety Code and other governing entity requirements or standard utility
engineering practices. The Company agrees to cooperate with the Town in
conducting the inspection.

Page 4 of 15

37



4.11

4.12

4.13

4.14

5.1

5.2

5.3

5.4

Town Not Required to Advance Funds. Upon receipt from the Town of an
authorization to proceed and a promise to pay for construction, the Company
shall extend its Facilities to the Town for municipal uses therein or for any
municipal facility outside the Service Area and within the Company’s certificated
service area, without requiring the Town to advance funds prior to construction.
Scheduled Interruptions. The Company shall, whenever possible, give notice,
either oral or written, to the Town and its affected Residents, of planned service
interruptions of significant duration.

Cooperation with Other Utilities. When undertaking a project of undergrounding,
the Town and the Company shall work with other utilities or companies to have
all lines undergrounded as part of the same project. The Company shall not be
required to pay the costs of any other utility or company in connection with work
under this section.

Annual Review of Franchise. At the request of either the Town or the Company,
the parties hereto shall meet to discuss any topic of concern.

ARTICLE 5
RATES, REGULATIONS, UNIFORMITY OF SERVICE AND UPGRADES
Furnishing Electrical Energy. The Company shall furnish electrical energy within
the Service Area, and to the Residents thereof at the Company’s applicable and
effective rates and under the terms and conditions set forth in the Company's
Electric Service Tariffs, Rules and Requlations and Consumer Service Facilities

Metering and Use Guidebook adopted by and on file with the Company, as such
may from time to time be amended, subject only to regulations thereof as is
provided by law. The Company shall not, as to rates, charges, service, Facilities,
rules, regulations or in any other respect, make or grant any preference or
advantage to any Resident, provided that nothing in this grant shall be taken to
prohibit the establishment from time to time of a graduated scale of charges and
classified rate schedules to which any customer coming within an established
classification would be entitled.

Facility Upgrades. The Company will, from time to time, during the term of this
Franchise make such improvements, enlargements and extensions of its
Facilities incorporating, when reasonable and practical, technological advances
within the industry as the business of the Company and the growth of the Town
justify, in accordance with its Electric Service Tariffs, Rules and Regqulations,
Consumer Service Facilities Metering and Use Guidebook or other customary
practices in effect and on file with the Company, as such may from time to time
be amended, subject only to regulations thereof as is provided by law.

Reliable Supply of Electricity. The Company shall take all reasonable and
necessary steps to provide an adequate supply of electricity to its customers at
the lowest reasonable cost consistent with long-term reliable supplies. If the
supply of electricity to its customers is interrupted, the Company shall take all
necessary and reasonable actions to restore such supply within the shortest
practicable time.

Maps and Regqulations. The Company shall, submit copies of its Consumer
Services Facilities Metering and Use Guidebook, Electric Service Tariffs, Rules and
Regulations and maps of its Facilities within the Service Area to the Town Clerk.

Page 5 of 15

38



5.5

5.6

6.1

6.2

All changes in such information shall be submitted to the Town as the same may
from time to time occur.

Subdivision Review. The Company shall analyze any subdivision plats or planned
unit development plans submitted to it by the Town and respond to any request
by the Town for information regarding the adequacy of its Facilities necessary to
serve such proposed plat or plan and answer any other questions posed to the
Company by the Town regarding said plat or plan as are within the knowledge of
the Company. The Company shall respond to said requests or questions within
reasonable time limits set by the Town’s Subdivision Regulations. The Town will
require the developers of such projects to meet all applicable provisions of the
Company’s Electric Service Tariffs, Rules and Regulations and other customary
practices, as such may from time to time be amended.

Interrelationship of lLaws, Rates, Regulations and Ordinances. The Company
shall comply with all County, State or Federal laws and rules and regulations
related to the subject matter hereof. The Company also agrees to abide by all
ordinances and resolutions of the Town, unless and except to the extent that
this Franchise Ordinance shall relieve the Company of the obligation to comply
with the terms and conditions of such other ordinances or any other provisions
hereof. The Company, from time to time, may promulgate such rules,
regulations, terms and conditions governing the conduct of its business,
including the use of electrical energy and the payment therefor, and the
interference with, or alteration of, any of the Company’s property upon the
premises of its customers as shall be necessary to provide a safe, continuous
and uninterrupted service to each and all of such customers and the proper
measurement thereof and payment therefor. Any such rules, regulations, terms
and conditions must not be inconsistent with this Franchise Ordinance, but no
ordinance of the Town may regulate the Company’s rates or charges for the
furnishing of electrical energy, or shall lessen the safety of providing such
energy to its customers, nor shall any such ordinance alter the manner in which
service is extended to such customers.

ARTICLE 6
USE OF COMPANY FACILITIES

Use of Poles by Town. The Town shall have the right, without cost, to jointly use
all poles and suitable overhead structures within the Service Area for the purpose
of stringing wires thereon for any reasonable Town authorized use; which use
shall not include generation, distribution or transmission of electricity. However,
the Company shall assume no liability, or any additional expense, in connection
therewith, and said use shall not interfere in any unreasonable manner with the
Company’s use of same, or the use thereof by the Company’s permittees,
licensees or other existing users of such Facilities. The Town is not authorized
to assign its right to jointly use the Company’s Facilities to any third party. The
Company, in its sole discretion, may allow third parties to use its Facilities upon
such terms and conditions as the Company deems appropriate.

Joint Use of Trenches. The Company, upon receiving a written request from the
Town, shall permit the Town to install additional conduit in any trench excavated
for the Company’s Facilities, for the express purpose and use of the Town,
provided such additional instaliation shall be in accordance with sound

Page 6 of 15

39



7.1

7.2

8.1

engineering methods and safety regulations, and shall not interfere with or cause
any conflict with the Company’s Facilities, and shall not cause the Company
additional installation expense or additional expense to maintain and repair its
Facilities. The Town, at its expense, will pay all costs and expenses of such
additional installation. The Town shall be responsible for ensuring that required
vertical and horizontal separations between its facilities and that of the
Company’s are strictly maintained. The Town and Company shall jointly hold
each other harmless from any liability or damage resulting from their respective
facilities being installed in a joint trench.

ARTICLE 7
INDEMNIFICATION AND POLICE POWER

Mutual Hold Harmless. Each party, shall to the extent allowed by law, indemnify,
defend and save the other party harmless from and against all liability or damage
and all claims or demands whatsoever in nature arising out of the operations of
the indemnifying party under the provisions of this Franchise, and the securing
of, and the exercise of the Franchise rights granted in this ordinance and the
indemnifying party shall pay all reasonable expenses arising therefrom. The
indemnifying party will provide prompt written notice to the other party of the
pendency of any claim or action against the indemnified party arising out of the
exercise of the Franchise rights. The indemnifying party will be permitted, at its
own expense, to appear and defend or to assist in defense of such claim.
Notwithstanding any provision hereof to the contrary, the indemnifying party
shall not be obligated to indemnify, defend or hold the other party harmless to
the extent of any claim, demand, or lien arising out of, or in connection with, any
negligent act or failure to act or the intentional misconduct by the indemnified
party or any of its officers, employees or agents. The indemnified party’s use of
independent contractors shall not constitute an avoidance or defense to the
indemnifying party’s duties to defend and indemnify under this section. Each
party shall maintain public liability insurance in an amount not less than
$1,000,000. Each party shall be a named additional insured on the other party’s
liability insurance.

Police Power Reserved. The right is hereby reserved to the Town to adopt from
time to time, in addition to the provisions herein contained, such Ordinances as
may be deemed necessary in the exercise of its police power, provided that such
regulations shall be reasonable and not destructive of the rights herein granted,
and not in conflict with the laws of the State of Colorado, or with orders of other
authorities having jurisdiction in the premises.

ARTICLE 8
FRANCHISE FEE
Franchise Fee. As a further consideration for this Franchise, and accepted by the
Town in lieu of all occupancy and license taxes and all other special taxes,
assessments, fees, or excises upon the Facilities or other property of the
Company, or other levies that might be imposed, either as a franchise tax,
occupation tax, occupancy tax, license tax, permit charge, or for the inspection
of the Facilities or other property of the Company, and charges which would

Page 7 of 15

40



8.2

8.3

8.4

8.5

otherwise be chargeable to the Company, or otherwise, the Company shall pay to
the Town a sum equal to three percent (3%) of its quarterly Revenues collected
from the sale of electricity within the Service Area for electrical energy furnished
for light, heat, power and other purposes. This three percent (3%) fee shall be
surcharged to the Residents within the Service Area and is in addition to any
charges specified in the Company’s Electric Service Tariffs, Rules and Regulations
and any applicable taxes. Payment of the franchise fee does not exempt the
Company from payment of property or sales taxes which are not directly related
to the franchise or the occupation of the Streets and Other Public Ways.
Revenues received from Town facilities will not be assessed a three percent (3%)
fee under this section nor will the Town be paid the three percent (3%) fee from
such revenues collected from Town facilities.

Payment. Payment of the Franchise Fee shall be made by the Company to the
Town on or before 30 days after the end of each quarter of each calendar year
for the preceding three (3) month period, but shall be adjusted for the portions
of the calendar quarters at the beginning and at the end of this Franchise. All
payments shall be made to the Town Clerk.

Revenue Audit. For the purpose of ascertaining or auditing the correct amount
to be paid under the provisions of this Article, the Company shall file with the
Town Clerk, or such other official as shall be designated by the Town from time
to time, a statement, in such reasonable form as the Town may require, showing
the total gross receipts received by the Company from the sale of electricity to
Residents within the Service Area for the preceding three (3) month period. The
Town Clerk or any official appointed by the Council shall have limited access to
the books of said Company for the sole purpose of confirming the quarterly
Revenues received from operations within the Service Area. Such access is
conditioned on the agreement of the Town not to disclose the information to any
third party.

Correction of Underpayment/Overpayment. Should either the Company or Town
discover either an underpayment or overpayment of the quarterly Franchise Fee,
the party making such discovery shall inform the other party within a reasonable
time. If the error is substantiated as an underpayment, the Company shall make
payment of the deficiency within 30 days of the date the error was substantiated.
If the error is substantiated as an overpayment, a credit equal to the
overpayment will be applied to the next quarterly Franchise payment due the
Town. If any dispute arises regarding underpayment/overpayment, Company
and Town agree to submit the dispute to binding arbitration, with each party to
bear their own costs.

Occupancy Tax Alternative. In the event said Franchise Fee levied herein should
be declared invalid and or shall be set aside by a Court of competent jurisdiction,
then, and in such event, and in lieu thereof, the Town may thereafter levy an
occupancy tax upon the Company, not to exceed in any calendar year three
percent (3%) of the Revenues collected from the sale of electricity within the
Service Area for electrical energy furnished for light, heat, power, and other
purposes for that calendar year. Such occupancy tax shall be adjusted for any
Franchise Fees previously paid to the Town in such calendar year. In the event
the Town shall enact such an occupancy tax, in lieu of the Franchise Fee, all of
the remaining terms, conditions and provisions of this Ordinance shall remain in

Page 8 of 15

41



8.6

8.7

8.8

8.9

9.1

9.2

9.3

full force and effect for the period stated herein. Such occupancy tax ordinance
or enactment shall be designed to meet all legal requirements to ensure that it is
not construed as an income tax.

Franchise Fee Payment in Lieu of Other Fees. As indicated in Section 8.1, above,
the Franchise Fee paid by the Company is accepted by the Town in lieu of any
occupancy tax, license tax, permit charge, inspection fee or similar tax on the
privilege of doing business or in connection with the physical operation thereof,
but does not exempt the Company from any lawful taxation upon its property or
any other tax not related to the Franchise or the physical operation thereof and
does not exempt the Company from payment of head taxes or other fees or
taxes assessed generally upon business.

Payment of Expenses Incurred by Town in Relation to Ordinance. At the Town's
option, the Company shall pay in advance or reimburse the Town for expenses
incurred in publication of notices and ordinances arising out of the negotiations
or process of obtaining this franchise.

Street Cut Permits. The Company will provide the Town with a Corporate Bond
without Sureties each year to ensure it performs all conditions imposed by such
permits. Upon request from the Town, the Company will furnish the Town with
the Company’s estimated cost of street repair.

Termination of Franchise. If this Franchise is terminated by either the Company
or the Town for whatever reason, or is declared null and void, all Franchise Fees
or occupancy taxes levied herein shall be suspended as of the date the Franchise
is legally terminated. Final payment of any Franchise Fee or occupancy tax owed
and due the Town shall be made on or before 30 days after the date the
Franchise is legally terminated.

ARTICLE 9
REPORTING AND CHANGE IN FRANCHISE FEE

Reports. The Company shall submit reasonable and necessary reports
containing, or based upon, information readily obtainable from the Company’s
books and records as the Town may request with respect to the operations of the
Company under this Franchise, and shall, if requested, provide the Town with a
list of real property within the Town which is owned by the Company.

Change of Franchise Fee. The Company shall, upon request from the Town,
notify the Council of any changes in the Franchise Fee percentage made with
other municipalities served by the Company under a franchise within the State of
Colorado. If the Council decides the Franchise Fee percentage hereunder shall
be changed, it shall provide for such change by Ordinance. However, any change
in the Franchise Fee percentage shall then be surcharged by the Company to the
Residents of the Town.

Change of Franchise Fee - Town Initiated. The Town expressly reserves the right
to notify the Company of its desire to revise the Franchise Fee to a different
percentage of revenue prior to October 1 of the even numbered years during the
term of this franchise, which revised Franchise Fee shall become effective on the
next succeeding January 1, following notification. Provided, however, that the
maximum amount of the Franchise Fee shall be five percent (5%) of the gross
Revenues collected within the Service Area. Notification to the consumer shall be
given by the Town no less than thirty (30) days prior to January 1, the effective

Page 9 of 15

42



10.1

10.2

10.3

10.4

10.5

10.6

date of the scheduled increase. All expenses associated with notification shall be
paid entirely by the Town.

ARTICLE 10

ADMINISTRATION
Duration of Franchise. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and
after its passage as by law required and the conditions, terms, and provisions
herein shall remain in full force and effect for a period of 10 years from and after
such enactment.
Temporary Extension of Franchise. Prior to the expiration of this Franchise,
should the parties desire to renew the terms and conditions of this Franchise or
execute a new Franchise, but have not yet done so, the parties may temporarily
extend the terms and conditions of this Franchise by written agreement for a
period of not longer than 180 days from such date of expiration. During such
extension, all provisions of the Franchise shall continue in effect as if the
Franchise had not expired.
Amendments. At any time during the term of this Franchise, the Town through
its Council, or the Company, may propose amendments to this Franchise by
giving 30 days written notice to the other party of the proposed amendment(s)
desired, and both parties thereafter, through their designated representatives,
shall within a reasonable time, negotiate in good faith in an effort to agree upon
a mutually satisfactory amendment(s). No amendment(s) to this Franchise shall
be effective until mutually agreed upon by the Town and the Company and until
all public notice requirements pursuant to Colorado statutes, and ordinance
requirements of the Town, have been met. This section shall not apply to
Franchise Fee changes under Article 9.
Revocation of Privileges by Condemnation. In the event, at any time during the
term of this Franchise, the Town shall condemn any of the Facilities of the
Company within the Service Area, and thereby revoke all or any part of the
privilege and authority herein granted to the Company to serve the Residents of
the Service Area, then and in such event the Town shall pay to the Company just
compensation as provided by the laws of the State of Colorado for such rights
and Facilities by reason of such condemnation.
Compliance Impaired. Both the Company and the Town recognize there may be
circumstances whereby compliance with the provisions of this Franchise is
impossible or is delayed because of circumstances beyond the Company’s or
Town’s control. In those instances, the Company or Town shall use its best
efforts to comply in a timely manner and to the extent possible.
Company’s Failure to Perform. It is agreed that in case of the failure of the
Company to perform and carry out any of the conditions, terms and provisions
herein set forth in any substantial particular, wherein such failure is within the
Company’s control and with respect to which redress is not otherwise herein
provided, the Town, acting through its Council, may, after hearing, determine
such substantial failure; and, thereupon, after notice given the Company of such
failure, the Company may have a reasonable time, not less than 90 days, unless
otherwise agreed by parties, in which to remedy the conditions respecting which
such notice shall have been given. After the expiration of such time and the

Page 10 of 15

43



10.7

10.8

10.9

10.10

11.1

11.2

failure to correct such conditions, the Council shall determine whether any or all
rights and privileges granted the Company under this ordinance shall be
forfeited and may declare this Franchise null and void.

Ownership of Facilities. All Facilities used or placed by the Company either
within or outside the Service Area shall be and remain the property of the
Company.

Transfer of Rights. The Company shall not transfer or assign any rights under
this Franchise to a third party, excepting only corporate reorganizations of the
Company not including a third party, unless the Town shall approve in writing
such transfer or assignment. Approval of the transfer or assignment shall not be
unreasonably withheld. .

Removal of Facilities. Upon the expiration of this Franchise, if thereafter the
Company Facilities shall not be used for electric, telephone, or cable TV
purposes for a period of 12 successive months, the Town shall have the option
of having the Company remove such Facilities or claim such Facilities as its own.
If the Town elects to have the Company remove the Facilities, it shall give written
notice to the Company directing it to remove such Facilities, and the Company
shall remove the same no later than 90 days after the date of such notice, unless
the Company and the Town agree to a longer period within which removal shall
occur. Any Facilities, either underground or overhead, remaining after such time
that are not expressly claimed by the Town shall be deemed to have been
abandoned. Any cost incurred by the Town in removing abandoned Facilities,
and any liability associated with Facilities abandoned by the Company shall be
the liability of the Company. For any Facilities claimed by the Town, any liability
associated with such Facilities shall become the liability of the Town.
Non-renewal of Franchise (Alternative Electric Service). If this Franchise is not
renewed, or if it is declared null and void, or the Company terminates any service
provided for herein for any reason, and the Town has not provided for alternative
electric service to the Residents of the Service Area, the Company shall not
remove its Facilities and shall be obligated to continue electric service to the
Residents until alternative electric service is provided. The Company will not
withhold any temporary services necessary to protect the public.

ARTICLE 11

COMMUNITY ENHANCEMENT FUND
Purpose. The Company is committed to programs designed to make a difference
in people’s lives and the communities in which they reside. The Company will
voluntarily make monetary resources available to the Town for such programs
and/or activities. Programs for which such funds shall be spent shall be limited
to (1) beautification projects, (2) energy conservation projects, (3) equipment and
technology upgrades for schools, (4) scholarship funds, (5) acquisition of open
space and/or park land and development thereof, (6) sponsorship of special
community events and (7) undergrounding of overhead electric and other utility
lines. Funds made available under this Article may be spent for other purposes
only with the express written consent of the Company.
Payments to the Fund. The Company shall make annual payments to the fund
equal to one percent (1%) of its prior year’s Revenues, prorated for the portions
of the months at the beginning and end of the term of this Franchise, collected

Page 11 of 15

44



11.3

11.4

11.5

11.6

11.7

11.8

from the sale of electricity within the Service Area, or $2,000, whichever amount
is greater. Said payments shall be made into the fund no later than February 15"
of the year subsequent to the year in which the gross revenues are received by
the Company.

The Fund. The fund established by the Company shall be maintained in a bank
account in the name of the Town, but shall be maintained separately from all
other funds and accounts held by the Town.

Payments from the Fund. All payments from the fund shall be for projects
described in Section 11.1 hereof. Prior to any such expenditure, authorization to
withdraw from the fund shall be given by resolution or ordinance duly enacted by
the Council, and such resolution or ordinance shall clearly describe the nature
and purpose of the project for which the expenditure is made. Prior to any
expenditure, the Town shall notify the Company of its intended use of the funds.
Unless the Company objects, in writing, prior to such expenditure, the Company
shall have waived its right to object in the future if the funds are expended for
the use identified in the notice.

Audits. The Town may audit the Company’s books for the limited purpose of
determining the Revenues being collected within the Town at any reasonable
time and with reasonable prior notice. The Company may audit the fund
account, expenditures from the fund and resolutions and ordinances authorizing
such expenditures at any reasonable time and with reasonable prior notice.
Forfeiture of Enhancement Funds. The Company shall have the express right to
temporarily suspend or terminate in full its annual contributions to the
Enhancement Fund if it is determined that funds allocated and paid to the Town
are being, or have been, misappropriated, administered with bias or
discrimination or for other inappropriate actions.

Advancement of Fund. The Company shall consider advances of funds, subject
to the provisions of this section, for all projects that specifically involve
undergrounding of overhead lines or projects acceptable to the Company which
are related to the Company’s existing Facilities. The Town shall make all
reasonable attempts to plan and budget use of the Fund without advancement of
future Funds. However, if the Town requests and the Company and the Town
agree that it is in the mutual interest of both, the Company shall anticipate Fund
amounts to be available for up to three (3) years in advance. Both parties shall
enter into a special agreement concerning the advanced Funds. Any amounts
advanced shall be credited against amounts to be expended in succeeding years
until such advances are eliminated.

TABOR Compliance Issue. The Community Enhancement Fund described in this
Article is a program that has been initiated solely by the Company. This Town
has not made the program a requirement for granting of a franchise to the
Company. Funding for this program is not a cost of doing business, but is a
voluntary contribution by the Company and is intended to be and shall be
considered to be a gift or grant within the meaning of Article X, Section 20, of
the Constitution of the State of Colorado for purposes of determining
compliance by the Town with such constitutional provisions.

ARTICLE 12

Page 12 of 15

45



12.1

12.2

12.3

12.4

13.1

UNDERGROUNDING

At Consumer’s Request. If a customer(s) within the Town should request that
new Facilities be installed underground or for the conversion of existing
overhead electrical facilities of the Company to underground facilities or if Town
ordinances or resolutions require a customer(s) to install Company facilities
underground, the Company shall proceed in accordance with its Electric Service
Tariffs, Rules and Regulations or other customary practices, as each may from
time to time be amended.

Town Requested Undergrounding. Except for the Company’s contributions to
the Community Enhancement Fund, which may be used by the Town to pay for
the undergrounding of the Company’s overhead electric facilities, any request,
requirement imposed by resolution or ordinance, or other communication from
the Town to the Company, asking, or requiring the Company to underground its
new electrical facilities or its existing overhead electric facilities, or move,
remove, or replace its existing underground electrical facilities, shall be
responded to in accordance with the provisions of the Company’s Electric Service
Tariffs, Rules and Requlations or other customary practices, as such may from
time to time be amended.

Relocation of Underground Facilities. No provision contained in this Article shall
be construed to obligate the Company to pay for the removal and relocation of
its underground electric facilities where such is at the request or demand of a
person, or a public or private entity under circumstances which require the party
requesting or demanding such to pay for the relocation under other provisions
hereof or under the provisions of the Company’s Electric Service Tariffs, Rules
and Requlations or other customary practice in use by the Company, as such may
be from time to time amended.

Governmental Mandates. This Franchise or the Town’s Municipal Code, as either -

may be amended from time to time, shall not prohibit or limit the Company’s
right to enforce its collection of any cost increase caused by governmental
mandate in accordance with the provisions of the Company’s Electric Service
Tariffs, Rules and Requlations, or other customary practices of the Company, as
such may be from time to time amended.

ARTICLE 13
MISCELLANEOUS
Changes in Utility Requlation. In the event new legislation materially affects the
terms and conditions of this Franchise Ordinance, the parties agree to
renegotiate the affected terms and conditions in good faith as an amendment
hereto. The parties hereto acknowledge that regulatory and legislative changes
in the electric utility, gas utility and other energy industries are currently being
discussed nationwide and statewide; that some changes in utility industry
sectors have already heen implemented; and that other changes may be made in
the future, during the term of this Franchise. The parties agree, that insofar as
future changes in the utility laws will allow, the Company shall always retain the
right to bill customers for utility transportation services and energy sales within
the Service Area if it is the provider of either the energy product or the
transportation of such product. The parties agree that this will provide the most
efficient and convenient utility service to the Residents of the Service Area and

Page 13 of 15

46



13.2

13.3

134

13.5

14.1

14.2

provide assurance to the Town of franchise fee collection for each component
charged for the sale and delivery of energy products within the Service Area.
Successors and Assigns. The rights, privileges, franchises and obligations
granted and contained in this Ordinance shall inure to the benefit of and be
binding upon the Company, its successors and assigns.

Representatives. Both parties shall designate from time to time in writing
representatives to act as franchise agents for the Company and the Town. Such
will be the persons to whom notices shall be sent regarding any action to be
taken under this Ordinance. Notice shall be in writing and forwarded by certified
mail or hand delivery to the persons and addresses as hereinafter stated, unless
the persons and addresses are changed at the written request of either party.
Until any such change shall hereafter be made, notices shall be sent to the Town
Manager and to the Company’s Chief Executive Officer. Currently the addresses
for each are as follows:

Town:

Town Manager

Town of Minturn

P.O. Box 309

302 Pine Street

Minturn, CO 81645-0309
Company:

Chief Executive Officer

Holy Cross Energy

P.O. Box 2150

Glenwood Springs, CO 81602-2150

Severability. Should any one or more provisions of this Franchise be determined
to be illegal or unenforceable, all other provisions nevertheless shall remain
effective; provided, however, the parties shall forthwith enter into good faith
negotiations and proceed with due diligence to draft provisions that will achieve
the original intent of stricken provisions.

Entire Agreement. This Franchise constitutes the entire agreement of the
parties. There have been no representations made other than those contained in
this Franchise.

ARTICLE 14

APPROVAL
Town Approval. This grant of Franchise shall not become effective until approved
by the Town in accordance with its ordinances and the statutes of the State of
Colorado.
Company Approval. The Company shall file with the Town Clerk its written
acceptance of this Franchise and of all its terms and provisions within 15
business days after the final adoption of this Franchise by the Town. The
acceptance shall be in the form and content approved by the Town Attorney. If
the Company shall fail to timely file its written acceptance as herein provided,
this Franchise shall become null and void.

Page 14 of 15

47



INTRODUCED, TITLE READ IN FULL, APPROVED ON FIRST READING
AND ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL THE 20t DAY OF JULY, 2011. A
PUBLIC HEARING ON THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE HELD AT THE
REGULAR MEETING OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF
MINTURN, COLORADO, ON THE 3" DAY OF AUGUST, 2011, AT 7 P.M.
IN THE MINTURN TOWN CENTER IN THE TOWN OF MINTURN,

COLORADO. /
7 -
N //mp/&ﬂ;—/@ % //f;j/k

ATTEST:

7/ L/

Tovﬁ Elerk

“TOLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE
READ BY TITLE, ENACTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED BY TITLE ONLY
ON SECOND READING THIS 3¢ DAY OF AUGUST, 2011.

Mayor
Attest:

Town Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Town Attorney

Publication Dates:

HOLY CROSS ENERGY

Del Worley, Chief Executive Officer

Date

Page 15 of 15

48



TOWN OF MINTURN ORDINANCE CHECKLIST
' gl Jf—ze
FIRST READING

74 22/ 7/ The ordinance shall be introduced and read by title at any regular or special
meeting. Copies shal be available to the public.

— S ﬂ//‘xf /A/‘/ﬁ

7/ 25 If the ordinance is approved on first reading, Mayor and Clerk must sign
ordinance after first reading. It shall be published in full in a newspaper of general
circulation within the Town. The minutes shall reflect number of votes for and against
each ordinance.

If the ordinance is tabled, it shall be reconsidered at subsequent meetings
until it is approved with or without amendment or rejected by vote of the Council.

/??:f / /g  The Council shall set a day, hour and place at which the Council shall
hold a public hearing on the ordinance, and notice of such day, hour and place shall be
included in the first publication.

SECOND READING

The ordinance shall be introduced a second time at the meeting at which
the public hearing on the ordinance is held. The ordinance may be read by title only on
second reading. The ordinance may be amended before final approval or rejection by
vote of the Council. The text of any such amendment or amendments shall be read in
full.

If the ordinance is substantially amended it shall be published in full after
final passage. If not amended in substance, it may be published either by title or in full,
as the Council may determine, after final passage.

The minutes shall reflect the number of votes for and against the ordinance.

A true copy of every ordinance shall be numbered and recorded in the
official records of the Town. Its adoption and publication shall be authenticated by the
signatures of the Mayor or Mayor Pro Tem and the Town Clerk and by the certificate of

publication. Proof of publication for both readings shall be attached to the ordinance.

The effective date of ordinances is seven (7) days after publication
following final passage unless a later date is prescribed in the ordinance.

49



Fri, Jul 22, 2011 _ 15:19:13

6804869
Ad Ticket #5
Acct: 1003134 Name: Town of Minturn
Phone: (303)827-5645 Address: PO Box 309
E-Mail: |
Client:
Caller: /& City: Minturn
Receipt State: CO Zip: 81645-0309
Ad Name: 6804869D Originalld: 0
Editions: 8VD/8VDI/ Class: 0990
Start: 07/25111 . Stop: 07/25111
Color: Issue 1
" Copyline: 6804869 1-2 Ordinance No 11-2011 Rep: Pam Schultz
Lines: 0 &__ >
Depth: 15 :
“Columns: 5
Discount: 0.00
Commission: 0.00 )

Payment 0.00

Ad shown is not actual print size



Fri, Jul 22, 2011
6804893

Acct: 1003134
Phone: (303)827-5645
E-Mail:

Client:

Caller: Ja
Receipt

Ad Ticket #5

15:19:53

Name: Town of Minturn

Address:

City:
State:

PO Box 309

Minturn
CcO

Zip: 81645-0309

Ad Name: 6804893D

Editions: 8VD/8VDI/
Start: 07/25/11
Color:

Copyline: 6804893 pg 2-2 Ordinance No 11

Original Id:

6804869

Class: 0990
Stop: 07/25/11

Issue 1

Tm Rt o

Pam Schultz

ETAS by v war ¢ cananew ta wren o7

e S R e

sFine

n gg‘_ PRyt e

eI e
5 LD e ¥ o2 178 ot va Fik pot]
R A RO

i
R e
. it reprichd
. A
gt
INes: s R
Dire
o
e
o & ‘.x'\v(-(-ﬂua.:{m’uuanuu
Depth 10.5 = R Bty
* - e v pasiy o
o B o
e
. T (22 L
olumns Comerraorad WAV = (At eT]
- W R ur:.’vﬂb r e
Peayet 1 ue LAl pem s pem v st
e LBL RIS Ay
Pl
\ . EINTE v
Iscoun . GBI .x.‘.m,f_.,-..m
. e FEAR IR
ey
Pt
e
. . prap-hid ngclh
. v Haere
fertechigt
ommission: AL
. £ e Awert u
EaTars
jl ey
e
TR ER,
o
[
s eyt
g T ’nli“ii T TR
1 e UGBTI o o
i Foa Jantion thtes ton
ur e
N
e e
Wy o
°
2y & 2 Aingat
2 o ;-‘H.’ CE2 A et b":".:‘" mn)rl&-vul:(ﬂ:
TR Ter e TR I3t 1, Wl e € B
> Z Vot ‘ﬂ ey PRy e and e ¢
& s S O ]
w * Al
th rmz‘w 'ﬂ.a "»:n'.‘,‘;:'—‘a
o o s b i P
Yo
Ten -
Payment ko -
o
See L,
e : JrEC T
Benx
. P
. a PeeE e
v G b et -
T s ey .
6 B RS EO R
B T A TSR R LEe TR B

oy

Ad shown is not actual print size

51



ORDINANCE NO. 11 - Serles of 2011

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, EAGLE COUNTY, COLORADO,
GRANTING A FRANCHISE TO HOLY CROSS ENERGY, ITS SUCCESSORS AND
ASSIGNS, TO LOCATE, BUILD, INSTALL, CONSTRUCT, ACQUIRE, PURCHASE,
EXTEND, MAINTAIN, REPAIR AND OPERATE INTO, WVAITHIN AND THROUGH A
PORTION OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, DEFINED AS THE SERVICE AREA, ALL

NECESSARY

AND CONVENIENT FACILITIES FOR THE PURCHASE, GENERATION,

TRANSMISSION AND DISTRIBUTION OF ELECTRICAL ENERGY, AND TO FURNISH,

SELL AND DI

SERVICE AREA FOR LIGHT, HEAT, POWER

ISTRIBUTE SAID ELECTRICAL ENERGY TO THE RESIDENTS OF THE
ANO OTHER PURPOSES BY MEANS OF

CORDUITS, CABLES, POLES AND WIRES STRUNG THEREON, OR OTHERWISE ON,

OVER, UNDE!

R, ALONG, ACROSS AND THROUGH ALL PUBLIC EASEMENTS AND

ALL STREETS AND OTHER PUBLIC WAYS (N SAID SERVICE AREA, AND FIXING THE

TERMS AND

CONOITIONS THEREOF.

BE IT ORDAINEO BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN,

COLORADO:

1l

ARTICLE |

This Ordinance shall be known and may be cited as the *Holy Cross
Energy Franchise Ordinance,”

ARTICLE 2

For the purpose of this Ordinance, the following terms shall have the meaning

given hereln:
11

1.2
13

1.4
15

1.6
1.7

1.8

1.9

3.1

3.2

3.3

4.1

4.2

4.3

4.5

4.6

“Town" is the Town of Minturn, Eagle County, Colorado, the
munlcipal corporation as Is now constituted or as Lhe same may be
enlarged or expanded from time to lime through annexation.
“Company” refers to Holy Cross Energy, a Colorade corporation, its
successors and assigns.
“Service Area® refers to all land Inside the municipal boundarles
of the Town, as of the enactment of this Ordinance, and all land
annexed within such boundaries hereafter, within the area certioed
to the Company by the Publlc Utllltles Commission of the State of
Colorado,
“Counchi® refers to the legislative body of the Town, known as the
Town Council of the Town of Minturn, Colerado,
“Facllltles” refers toall overhead and underground electric facllitles,
bulldings and structures owned by the Company which are
necessary lo provide electricity Into, within and through the Town
including, but not limited to, such essential apparatus, appliances,
lants, systems, s works, and distrib
Ines, structures, anchors, cablnets, cables, condulls, guy posts,
guy wires, meters, microwave, communication facilltles, overhead
and underground lines, pedestals, poles, regulators, sectlonallizers,
switchgears, transformers, varlous pad mounted and pole meunted
equipment, vaults, wires and all mgu related electrical equipment
required for the i e,
purchase and transmlsslon of electrical energy.
“Public Easements* refers to easements created by general dedlcatlon
and available for use by any public utility for Its fackitles
“Private Easements® refers 10 easements created by deed, specine
dedication to speciOc grantees or acquired by the Company by
presuiptive 7ight and avallable only for use by the Company for Its
Facilltles, or by the Comﬁany and other users or utllltles speciacally
named as grantees In the deed of dedicatlon or which have also
acqulred the easemnent by prescriptive right.
“Residents” refers to and includes ali persons, businesses, industry,
govemmmenlal agencles and any other entity whatsoever, present
malntalning a residence, business, farm, ranch or other enterprise
located within, in whole or In part, the boundartes of the Town,
“Revenues™, unless otherwlse speclDed, refers to and are the gross
amounts of money that the Company recelves from Its customers
within the Town from the sale or delivery of electrical energy for any
particular period of {ime,
“Streels and Other Public Ways® refers to streets, alleys, viaducts,
bridges, roads, anes and other public ways In the Town, subject to
fimitations stated herein,

ARTICLE 3

. SubjJect to the condltions, terms and
provisions contained in this Franchise, the Town hereby grants
to the Company a non- exclusive right, privilege and authorlty to
locate, bulld, install, construct, acquire, puschase, extend, maintaln,
repalr and operate Inlo, within and through all of the Service Area,
all necessary and convenlent Facilitles for the purchase, generation,
transmission and distributlon of electrical energy. Such grant is
made together with the exclusive right and privilege to furnish, sell
and distribute sald electrical energy to the Residents for light, heat,
power and other purposes,

. Such grant Includes the non-exclusive right
and obligation to furnish electrical energy using the Company
Facliltles on, over, under, along, across and through any and all
Publlc Easements and all Streets and Other Public Ways, on, over,
under, along, across and through any extension, connection with,
or contlnuation of, the same and/or on, over, under, along, across
and through any and all such new Public Easements and Streets and
Other Public Ways a5 may be hereafter lald out, apeaed, located
or conslructed within the Service Area, The Company Is further
granted the right, privilege and authorlty to excavate In, o<c upy and
use any and all Streels and Other Public Ways and Public Easements.
Any such excavation, occupation and use must be in accerdance
with Town standards and regutations, and wili be undertaken under
the supervision of the properly constituted authority of the Town for
the purpose of bringing electrical energy Into, within and through
the Service Area and supplying electrical energy to the Residents.

. The Town hereby grants to the Company
the non-exclusive right, privilege and authorlty to provide sireet
and securlty lighting to the Town, and to serve all Town owned
or operated structures, plants, equipment or Town apparatus and
facllitles, including the right, privilege and authority t o furnish, sell
and distribute electrical energy necessary for such.

ARTICLE 4

Recreatlonal Areas. The Company shall not have the right to locate,
bulld or construct Facillties under, across or through public parks
or recreatlonal areas, open space or other Town owned property
located within the Town excepl as expressly set forth In this
Franchise or with prior wiltten approval granted by the Councli. Sald
approval shall not be unreasenably wllh?uld.

. The Company shall have the right 10 trim or cut
down such trees and shrubbery and to control the growth of the
same by machinery or otherwise but shall not use chemicals for
such purpose, only as may be reasonably necessary 10 protect Its
Facilltles as provided for in the Company “Vegetation Managernent
Guidelines® as such may from time to time be amended.

. Wherever reasonable and
practicable, the Company will endeavor to Install its Facllitles within
Public Easements, The Company shall locate hts Facilhies within the
Town $0 as to cause minlmum interference with any of the Town's
facilitles or property, Including without limltation water lines, sewer
fines, storm dralns and the proper use of Streets and Other Publlc
Ways, and 50 as to cause minimum Inerference with the rights or
reasonable convenlence of property owners whose property adjolns
any of the said Streets and Other Publlc Ways.

. Should It become
necessary for the Company, in exerclsing its rights and pesforming
its duties hereunder, to Interfere with an¥ sldewalk, graveled or
paved street, road, alley, water line, sewer line, storm drain or any
other public or privaie improvement, the Company shall at hts own
expense and In a quality workmanllke manner, repair or cause to
be repalred and restored 1o its original condltion such sidewalk,
graveled or paved sireel, road, alley, water line, sewer line, storm
drain or other public or private improvement aftes the Installation
of its Facllitles. However, upon fallure of the Company to do such
required repalrs within a reasonable Ume and In a workmanlike
manner, the Town miy perform the required work and charge the
Company for all reasonable costs thereof. Nothing herelnabove shall
be construed to obligate the Company lo pay for the removal and
relocation of its Facilities where such Is al the request of demand
ofa {;euon, or a public or rr(vale entity under clrcumstances which
require the party request n? or demanding such to pay for the
relocation under other provisions hereof or under the provisions
of the Company's
or other customary practices, as such may from time to time be
amended.

The Company shall have the right to make suth
use of its Facillties and other property owned by Company, for uses
other than the uses conlemplated in thls Franchise OrdInance, as it
deems proper 5o long as such other uses do not Interfere with Its
ablllty te supply electrical energy, consistent with the then current
20ning.

. If at any time it shall be necessary

Changed Conditlons (QOverhead).
to change Lhe position of any overhead electrical facilltles of the

Company located wilthin Public Easements or Streets and Other

4.7

4.8

4.10

4.12

4.13

5.1

5.2

5.4

5.5

5.6

6.1

6.2

VI TIVERS, 3ULH LHTSNY S 311t UE ITEUT LY UIE Lurmpany aL iy own
expense, after reasonable notice from the Town. Any necessary
ositlon change of overhead electrical facHlities of the Company
ﬂ)ulcd within Private Easements wlll be pald for by the person, or
private or public entity requesting such change. The Town shall
consult with the Company during the design of any such Town
works which may require relocation of existing overhead electrical
facllities of the Company and work with the Company to ensure that
any relocation nécessary Is minimized and that a location for the
relocated Facilltles Is provided,

The Company shall comply with
all Town ordinances and regulalions regarding curb and pavement
cuts, excavating, dlgging and related consiruction, malntenance
and operational activitles, If requested by the Town, the Company
shail submit coples of reports of annual and long-term planning for
capltal Improvement projects with descriptions of required sireet
cuts, excavation, digging and related construction actlvitles within
30 days after [ssuance of request.

. Prior to construction
of any sfgniticant Facilltles within the Town, as determined jointly
by the Company and Town, the Company shall furnish 1o the
Town the plans for such proposed construction. [n addltlon, the
Company shall assess and report on the impact of such proposed

on the Tewn envi Such plans and reports
may be reviewed by the Town to ascertaln, inter alfa, (1) that all
aprlluble laws including bullding and zoning codes, air and water
pol

ulion regulations are complled with, (2) that aesthetic and good
planning principles have been given due consideration and (3) that

adverse impact on the environment has been minimlzed. ™
e

Company and the Town shall endeavor Lo Inform one another of any
capital improvement and major developmenl projects anticipated
within the Town that may impact the Facllities or operations of
either party, The party proposing such capital improvements shall
Inform the other party of the nature of such improvements within
a reasonable time afler plans for such Improvements have been
substantlally formulated. Each party shall cooperate in the timely
exchange of all necessary Information, destgn data, drawings and
n{;om Lo properly assess and evaluate the potentlal Impacts of
sald Improvemnents and major devel

The Company shall install, maintaln,
repalr, replace and upgrade Its Facllitles to ensure both the adequacy
of and guallty of, electric service to the Town and all Residents. All
uu\uﬂon and construction work done by of under the autherlty
of the Company shail be done [n a imely and expeditious manner
which minimizes the inconvenience to the Town and all Resldents,
The Town shall have the right 1o Inspect any portion of the Faciiiles
located In the Streets or Other Public Ways. However, the Town wil|
not requlire construction of the Facilltles In such a manner that would
not meet the Natlonal Electrical Safety Code and other ?ovlm|ng
entily requlrements of standard utliity englneering practlces, The
Company agrees to cooperate with the Town In conducting the
Inspectlon,

Town Not Required to Advance Funds. Upon recelpt from the
Town of an authorization 10 proceed and a promlse to pay for
construction, the Company shall extend its Facilltles to the Town
for municipal uses thereln or for any municipal facillty outside the
Service Area and within the Company's certiDcated service area,
without requiring the Town o advance funds prior to const rucilon.
. The Company shall, whenever possible,
give notlce, either oral or wiilten, to the Town and Its affected
Residents, of planned service interruptlons of signincant duration.
. When undertaking a pmde:l of
undergrounding, the Town and the Company shall work with other
utilities or companies to have all lines undergrounded as part of the
same project. The Company shall not be required to pay the costs
of any other utllity of company fn connectlon with work under this
seclion.
At the request of either the Town or
\he Company, the parties hereto shall meet Lo dlscuss any toplc of
concem.

ARTICLE §
M

. The Company shall furnish electrical
energy within the Service Area, and to the Resldents thereof at the
Company's applicable and effective rates and under the terms and
conditions set forth in the Company's.

ani

adopied by and on Ole with the Company, as such may
from time to time be amended, subject only 10 regulations thereof
as Is provided by [aw. The Company shall not, as to rates, charges,
service, Faclfitles, rules, regulations or In any other respect, make
of grant any preference or advantage to any Resldent, provided that
nothing [n this grant shall be taken to prohlblt the establishment
from lime to time of a gradualed scale of charges and classiOed
rate schedules to which any customer corning within an established

classiDcation would be entltled.
The Company will, frorn time to time, durlng the
term of this Franchise make such Improvements, enlargements
and extensions of its Faclllties incorporating, when reasonable and

praclical, technologlc al advances within the Industry as the business
of the Company and the growth of the Town jusliﬁ. In accordance
whh ity /| Consumer

or other customary
practices in effect and on Dle with the Company, a3 such may from
time to lime be amended, subject only to regulations thereof as Is
provided by law,

The Company shall take all reasonable
and necessary steps to provide an adequate supply of efectricity to
its al the fowest ble cost with jong~
term reflable supplies. if the su| pll of electricity to Its customers
Is Interrupted, the Company shalrla ke all necessary and reasonable
actlons to restore such supply within the shortest practicable lime.

The Company shall, submit coples of its

and maps of its Faclllties
within the Service Area to the Town Clerk. Al changes In suth
Informatlon shall be submitted to the Town as the same may from
dme to time occur,
Al The Company shall analyze any subdivision
plats or planned unit development plans submiited to it by the
Town and respond to any request by the Town for Informatlon
regarding the adequacy of Its Facllities necessary to serve such
proposed plat or plan and answer any other questions posed to
the Company by the Town regarding sald plat or plan as are within
the knowledge of the Company. The Company shall respond to
sald requests or questions within reasonable Iime limits set by
the Town's Subdivislon Regulatlons. The Town will require the
developers of such profects to meet all applicable provisions of the
Company's i and olher
customary practices, as such may from time to time be amended,

. The
Company shail comply with all County, State or Federal laws and
rules and regulations related to the subject matier hereof, The
Company also agrees to abide by all ordinances and resolutions
of the Town, unless and except to the extent that this Franchise
Ordinance shall relleve the Company of the obligation to comply
with the terms and conditions of such other ordlnances or any
other provisions hereof, The Company, from time to time, may
pr such rules, governing
the conduct of Its business, including the use of electrical energy
and the payment therefor, and the interference with, or alteration
of, any of the Company's property upon the premises of Its
custerners as shall be necessary 1o provide a safe, centinuous and
uninterrupted service 10 each and all of such customers and the
proper measurement Lhereof and payment therefor. Any such
rules, terms and cond must not be |
with this Franchise Ordinance, but no ordinance of the Town may
regulate the Company's rates or charges for the fumishing of
electrical energy, or shall lessen the safety of providing such energy
1o Its customers, nor shall any such ordinance alter the manner In
which service Is extended to such customers,

ARTICLE 6

Use of Poles by Town. The Town shall have the right, without cost,
to ]olnllr use all poles and sultable overhead structures within
\he Service Area for the purpose of stringlng wires thereon for
any reasonable Town authosized use; which use shall not Include
generation, dlstributlon or transmission of electricity. However,
the Company shall assume no liability, or any additlonal expense,
In connection therewith, and said use shall not interfere In any
unreasonable manner with the Compmri use of same, or the use
thereof by the Company's permittees, licensees or other exIsting
users of such Facilltles. The Town is not authorized to assign its
right to Jontly use the Company’s Facilities o any third party, The
Company, in ts sole discretion, may allow Vhird parties to use Its
Facliltles upon such lerms and conditions as the Company deems
appropriate,

The Company, upon recelving & wrltten

71

7.2

8.1

8.2

8.3

8.4

8.5

8.6

8.7

8.8

8.9

9.1

9.3

INE EXPress purpose ang Use oI the 10¥yn, provioed SULl 40diliondl
Instaltation shall be In accordance with sound englneering methods
and safety regulations, and shall not interfere with or cause any
conOict with the Company's Facllities, and shall not cause the

Company add ion expense or additional expense to
maintaln and repalr Its Fadillties. The Town, at Its expense, will pay
allcostsand of such additional The Town shall

be respomiblerfor ensuring that required vertical and horlzontal
separations between Tts facllities and that of the Compan(‘s are
strictly malntained. The Town and Company shall Jointly hold each
other harmless from any lability or damage resulting from thelr
respective facili tles being [nstalled [n a joint \rench,

ARTICLE 7

Mutual Hold Harmless. Each party, shall to the extent allowed by
law, indemnify, defend and save the other party harmless from and
against all Habllity or damage and all claims or demands whatsoever
in nature arising out of the operations of the indemnlfying party
under the provisions of this Franchise, and the securing of, and
the exercise of the Franchise rights granted in this ordinance and
the indemnifying party shall pay all reasonable expenses arlsing
therefrom. The Indemnlfying party will provide prompt written
notice to the other party of lghe pendency of any clalm or action
against the IndemniOed party arising out of the exercise of the
Franchise rights. The fy party will be p d, at s
own expense, to appear and defend or to assist In defense of such
claim. Notwithstanding any provision hereof to the contrary, the
indemnlfying party shall not Ee obligated to Indemnify, defend or
hold the other pasty harmiess to the extent of any claim, demand, or
lien artsing out of, or In connection with, any negligent act or fallure
to act or the intentional misconduct by the IndemnlOed party or any
of its officers, employees or agents. The IndemniQed party's use of
independent contractors shal! not constitute an avoldance or defense
10 the indemnifying party’s dutles to defend and indemnify under
this section. Each party shall maintaln public lablllty insurance in
an amount not less than 51,000,000. Each party shall be a named
addidonal Insured on the other party’s Habliity insurance.

. The right [s hereby reserved to the Town
to adopt from time to time, in additlon to the provisions herein
contalned, such Ordinances as may be deemed necessary in the
exercise of Its police power, provided that such regulations shall be
reasonable and not destructive of the rights herein granted, and not
In conDict with the faws of the State of Colorado, or with orders of
other authorities having Jurisdiction In the premises.

ARTICLE 8

Eranchise Fee. As a further conslderation for thls Franchise, and
accepted by the Town in lleu of all occupancy and license taxes
and all other special taxes, assessments, fees, or excises upon
the Facillties or other property of the Company, or other levies
that might be Imposed, either as a {ranchise tax, occupation tax,
occupancy tax, license tax, permit charge, or for the Inspection of
the Facilities or other property of the Company, and charges which
would otherwise be chargeable to the Company, or otherwise, the
Company shall pay to the Town a sum equal te three percent (3%)
of [ts quarterly Revenues collected from the sale of electricity within
the Service Area for electrical energy furnished for light, heat, power
and ather purposes. This three percent (3%) fea shall be surcharged
to the Residents within the Service Area and Is In addition to any
charges specined In the Company’s i i

and Reaulations and any applicable taxes. Payment of the franchise
fee does not exempt the Company from payment of property ot
sales taxes which are not directly related to the franchise or the
occupation of the Streets and Other Public Ways, Revenues recefved
from Town facilities will not be assessed a three percent (3%) fee
under this section nor will the Town be pald the three percent (3%)
fee from such revenues collected from Town facilitles.

Payment. Payment of the Franchise Fee shall be made by the
Company to the Town on or before 30 days after the end of each
quarter of each calendar year for the preceding three (3) month
pertod, but shall be adfusted for the portions of the calendar
quarters at the beginning and at the end of this Franchise, All
payments shall be made to the Town Clerk.

For lheJ)urpose of ascertalning or auditing the
correct amount to be pald under the provisions of this Anticle, the
Company shall Dle with the Town Clerk, or such other offidal as
shali be designated by the Town from time to time, a statement, in
such reasonable form as the Town may require, showing the total
gross recelpts received by the Company from the sale of electricity
to Residents within the Service Area for the preceding three (3}
month perfod. The Town Clerk or any official appointed by the
Council shall have limited access to the books of sald Company
for the sole purpose of conrming the quarterly Revenues received
from operations within the Service Area. Such access is conditioned
on the agreement of the Town not to disciose the information o any
third party,

. Should elther the
Company or Town discover either an underpayment or overpayment
of the guarterly Franchise Fee, the party making such discovery
shall ln?orm the other party within a reasonable time. If the error
s sub d as an the Company shall make
payment of the deDclency within 30 days of the date the error was
d. e error Is sub as an 3
credit equal to the overpayment will be appiled to the next quarterly
Franchise payment due the Town. If any dispute arlses regarding
underpayment/overpayment, Company and Town agree to submil
the dispute to binding arbitration, with each party to bear thelr own
costs.

Qccupancy Tax Alternative. In the event sald Franchise Fee levied
hereln should be dedlared invalld and or shall be set aside by a
Court of comguent Jurisdiction, then, and in such event, and In
lieu thereof, the Town may thereafter levy an occupancy tax upon
the Company, not to exceed in any calendar year three percent (3%)
of the Revenues collected from the sale or elecricity within the
Service Area for efecirical energy furnished for fight, heat, power,
and other purposes for that calendar year. Such accupancy tax
shall be adjusted for any Franchise Fees previously pald to the Town
in such calendar year. In the event the Town shall enact such an
occupancy tax, in Jleu of the Franchise Fee, all of the remalning
terms, conditions and provisions of this Ordinance shall remaln in
full force and effect for the period stated hereln. Such occupancy
tax ordinance of enacument shall be designed to meet all legal
requirements to ensure that It Is not construed as an income tax.

. As indicated In Section
8.1, above, the Franchise Fee pald by the Company Is accepted by
the Town In lleu of any occupancy tax, license tax, permht charge,
inspection fee or similar tax on the privilege of doing business or
in connectfon with the physical operation thereof, but does not
exempt the Company from any lawfu! taxation upon its property or
any other tax not related to the Franchise or the physical operation
thereof and does not exempt the Company from payment of head
taxes or other fees or taxes assessed generally upon business.

. At

the Town's option, the Company shall pay In advance or reimburse
the Town for expenses incurred In publication of notices and
ordinances arising out of the negatiations or process of abtaining
this franchise.
Street Cut Permits. The Company will provide the Town with a
Corporate 8ond without Suretles each year to ensure it performs all
conditions imposed by such permits. Upon request from the Town,
the Company will furnish the Town with the Company's estimated
cost of street repalr.

. 1 this Franchise ls terminated by either
the Company or the Town for whatever reason, or |s declared null
and void, all Franchise Fees or occupancy taxes levied herein shall
be suspended as of the date the Franchise is legally terminated.
Final payment of any Franchise Fee or occupancy tax owed and due
the Town shall be made on or before 30 days after the date the
Franchise Is legally termInated. .

ARTICLE 9

Repogs. The Company shall submit reasonable and necessary
reports containing, or based upon, Information readily obtainable
from the Company’s books and records as the Town may request
with resrm 10 the operations of the Company under this Franchise,
and shall, if requested, provide the Town with a list of real property
within the Town which is owned by the Company.
Change of franchise Fee. The Company shall, upon request from
the Town, noll? the Council of any changes in the Franchise Fee
percentage made with other municipalities served by the Company
under a franchise within the State of Colorado. If the Cound|
decides the Franchise Fee percentage hereunder shall be changed,
it shall provide for such change by Ordinance. However, any chmge
in the Franchise Fee percentage shall then be surcharged by the
Company to the Resldents of the Town,

- . The Town expressly
reserves the right Lo nolify the Company of its desire to revise the

52



Franchise Fee to a different percentage of revenue prior to October 1 of the even

10.1

10.2

103

10.4

10.5

10.6

10.7

10.8

10.9

10.10

111

numbered years during the term of this franchise, which revised
Franchise Fee shall become effective on the next succeeding January
1, following notlOcation. Provided, however, that the maximum
amount of the Franchise Fee shall be Ove percent (S%) of the gross
Revenues collected within the Service Area. NotlDcation to the
consumer shall be glven by the Town no less than thirty (30) days
prior to January 1, the effective date of the scheduled Increase, All
_erxpenses assoclated with notiOcation shall be pald entirely by the
own,

ARTICLE 10

. This Ordlnance shall be in full force and effect
from and after Its passage as by law required and the conditlons,
terms, and provisions herein shall remain in full force and effect for
a perlod of 10 years from and after such enactment,

. Prior to the explration of
this Franchise, should the parties desire to renew the terms and
conditions of this Franchise of execute a new Franchise, but have
not yet done so, the partles may temporarily extend the terms and
conditions of this Franchise by written agreement for a period of
not longer than 180 days from such date of expiration, During such
extension, all provisions of the Franchise shalrconllnue [n effect as
Hf the Franchise had not expired.

. At any time during the term of this Franchise,
the Town through Its Council, or the Company, may propose
amendments to this Franchise by giving 30 days written notice to
the other party of the proposed amendment(s} desired, and both
parties thereafter, through thelr designated representatives, shall
withln a reasonable time, negotiate In good faith In an effort to agree
upon a mutually satlsfactory d (s). No d (s) to
this Franchise shall be effective until mutually agreed upon by the
Town and the Company and until all public notice requirements
pursuant 1o Colorado statutes, and ordinance requirements of the
Town, have been met. This section shall not apply to Franchise Fee
changes under Articie 9.

Revocation of Privileges by Condempation. In the event, at any time
during the term of this Franchise, the Town shall condemn any of
the Facllitles of the Company within the Service Area, and thereby
1evoke all or any pant of the privilege and authority hereln granted
10 the Company to serve the Residents of the Service Area, then and
In such event the Town shall pay to the Company Just compensation
as provided by the laws of the State of Colorado for such rights and
Facilities by reason of such condemnation,

. Both the Company and the Town recognize
there may be cIrcumstances whereby compliance with the
provisfons of this Franchise is impossible or is delayed because of
clrcumstances beyond the Company's or Town's control, In those
Instances, the Company or Town shall use Its best efforts to comply
ina llmely manner and to the extent poss|ble,

. Itis agreed that in case of the fallure
of the Company to perform and carry out any of the conditions,
terms and provisions herein set forth in any substantial particular,
wherein such failure is within the Company's control and with
respect to which redress Is not othenvise herein provided, the
Town, acting through its Councll, may, after hearing, determine
such substantlal failure; and, thereupon, after notlce glven the
Company of such failure, the Company may have a reasonable time,
not less than 90 days, unless otherwise agreed by parties, in which
to remedy the conditions respecting which such notice shall have
been given, After the explration of such time and the failure to
correct such conditions, the Councll shall determine whether any or
all rights and privileges granted the Company under this ordinance
shall be forfeited and may declare this Franchise null and void.

. All Facllitles used or placed by the Company
elther within or outside the Service Area shall be and remain the
property of the Company,

. The Company shall not transfer or assign any

rights under this Franchise to athird party, excepting only corporate
reorganlzations of the Company not Including a third party, unless
the Town shall approve In waiting such transfer or assignment.
Approval of the transfer or assignment shall not be unreasonably
withheld.
Removal of Facflities. Upon the expiration of this Franchise, if
thereafter the Compw Facilitles shall not be used for electrlc,
telephone, or cable purposes for a period of 12 successive
months, the Town shall have the option of having the Company
remove such Facilitles or claim such Facllitles as Its own. If the
Town elects to have the Company remove the Facllitles, [t shall give
written notice to the Company directing It to remove such Facilities,
and the Company shall remove the same no later than 90 days after
the date of such notice, unless the Company and the Town agree
to a longer perlod within which removal shall occur. Any Facllitles,
either underground or overhead, remaining after such time that are
not expressly claimed by the Town shall be deemed to have been
abandoned. Any cost Incurred by the Town in removing abandoned
Faclilties, and any labllity assoclated with Facilities abandoned by
the Company shall be the llabillty of the Company. For any Facllities
claimed by the Town, any Habllity associated with such Facililes
shall become the liabllity of the Town,

- . If this
Franchise Is not renewed, or if It js decfared null and void, or the
Company terminates any service provided for hereln for any reason,
and the Town has not provided for alternative electric service to
the Residents of the Service Area, the Company shall not remove
its Facillties and shall be obligated to continue electric service to
the Resldents until alternative electric service Is provided. The

Comp will not withhold any p services necessary to

protect (‘e public, Y i
ARTICLE 11

Purpose. The Company Is committed to programs deslgned

to make a difference In people's lives and the communlties in
which they reside, The Company will voluntarily make monetary
resources avallable to the Town for such programs and/or activties.,
Programs for which such funds shall be spent shall be limited to
(1) beautincation projects, {2) energy conservation projects, (3)
equlpment and technology upgrades for schools, (4) scholarship
funds, (5) acqulsition of open space andfor park land and
devel thereof, p hip of special ¢ y events
and (7) undergrounding of overhead electric and other utllity lines.

11.2

113

114

115

116

117

118

12.1

12.2

123

12.4

13.1

Funds made avallable under this Article may be spent for other
purposes only with the express written consent of the Company.

. The Company shall make annual payments
to the fund equal to one percent (1%) of its ﬁrlor year's Revenues,
protated for the portions of the months at the beginning and end
of the term of this Franchise, collected from the sale of electriclty
within the Service Area, or $2,000, whichever amount Is greater.
Sald payments shall be made into the fund no later than February
15 of the year subsequent to the year In which the gross revenues
are recefved by the Company.

. The fund established by the Company shall be malntained
In a bank account In the name of the Town, but shall be maintained
separately from all other funds and accounts held by the Town,

. All payments from the fund shall be

for projects desciibed In Section 11.1 hereof. Prlor to any such
expenditure, authorization to withdraw from the fund shall be
given by resolution or ordinance duly enacted by the Council, and
such resolution or ordinance shall clearly describe the nature and
purpose of the project for which the expenditure Is made. Prior to
any expenditure, the Town shali notlfy the Company of its intended
use of the funds, Unless the Company objects, in wilting, prior 1o
such expenditure, the Company shall have walved its right to object
in the future if the funds are expended for the use identlDed in the
notice,
Audits. The Town may audit the Company’s books for the iimited
purpose of determining the Revenues being collected within the
Town at any reasonable time and with reasonable prior notice. The
Company may audit the fund account, expendlitures from the fund
and resolutions and ordinances autharizing such expenditutes at
any reasonable time and with reasonable prior notice.

. The Company shall have the
express right to temporarily suspend or terminate in full Its annual
contributions to the Enhancement Fund If It is determined that
funds allocated and pald to the Town are being, or have been,
misappropriated, adminlistered with blas or discrimination or for
other inappropriate actions.

. The Company shall consider advances of
funds, subject to the provisions of this sectlon, for all projects that
speciOcally involve undergrounding of overhead [ines or projects
acceptable to the Company which are related to the Company’s
existing Facllitles, The Town shall make all reasonable attempts
to plan and budget use of the Fund without advancement of future
Funds. However, if the Town requests and the Company and the
Town agree that It Is In the mutual interest of both, the Company
shall anticpate Fund amounts to be available for up to three {3)
years In advance. Both parties shall enter into a special agreement
concerning the advanced Funds, Any amounts advanced shall be
credited agalnst amounts to be expended in succeeding years untll
such advances are eliminated.

. The Community Enhancement Fund
described in this Article Is a program that has been inltiated
solely by the Company. This Town has not made the program a
requirement for granting of a franchise to the Company, Funding
for this program is not a cost of doing business, but is a voluntary
contribution by the Company and is Intended to be and shall be
consldered to be a gift or grant within the meaning of Anticle X,
Sectlon 20, of the Constitution of the State of Colorado for purposes
of determining compliance by the Town with such consthwtional
provisions.

ARTICLE12
' . If a customer(s) within the Town should
request that new Facillties be Installed underground or for the
conversion of existing overhead electrical facilltles of the Company
to underground facilities or [f Town ordinances or resolutions
require a customer(s) to Install Company facilities underground,

the Company shall proceed In accordance with Its
or other customary practices, as each

may from time to time be amended.

Except for the Company's
3 to the C ity Enhancement Fund, which may be
used by the Town to pay for the undergrounding of the Company's
overhead electrlc facilities, any request, requirement imposed by

133

product or the transportation of such product. The partles agree
that this will provide the most efficient and convenlent utllity service
to the Resldents of the Service Area and provide assurance to the
Town of franchise fee collection for each component charged for
the sale and delivery of energy products within the Service Area.

. The rights, privileges, franchises and
obligations granted and contalned in this Ordinance shall inure tc
the benent of and be binding upon the Company, its successors and
assigns.

7 . Both parties shall deslgnate from time to time [n
writing representatives 1o act'as franchlse agents for the Company
and the Town. Such will be the persons to whom notices shall be
sent regarding any action to be taken under this Ordinance. Notice
shall be In writing and forwarded by certiOed mall or hand delivery
to the persons and addresses as herelnafter stated, unless the
persons and addresses are changed at the written request of either
gany. until any such change shall hereafter be made, notices shall

e sent to the Town Manager and to the Company’s Chlef Executive
Officer. Currently the addresses for each are as follows:

Town:
Town Manager
Town of Minturn
P.0. Box 309
302 Pine Streel
Minturn, cC

81645-0309

Officer
Energy

Springs,

134

Chlef  Executive

Holy Cross
P.O. Box 2150
Glenwood
CO 81602-2150

Severabllity. Should any one or more provisions of this Franchise
be determined 1o be lllegal or unenforceable, all other provisions
nevertheless shall remain effective; provided, however, the partles
shall forthwith enter Into good faith negotiations and proceed with
due dlligence to draft provislons that will achieve the orlglnal Intens
of stricken provisions.

. This Franchise constitutes the entire agreemen!
of the parties, There have been no representations made other than
those contalned in this Franchise,

ARTICLE 14

. This grant of Franchise shall not become effective
untll approved by the Town In accordance with its ordinances and
the statutes of the State of Colorado.

. The Company shall Ole with the Town Clerk
its written acceptance of this Franchise and of all its terms and
provisions within 15 business days after the Dnal adoption of thls
Franchise by the Town. The acceptance shall be in the form and
content approved by the Town Attorney. If the Company shall fall tc
timely Dle its written acceptance as herein provided, thls Franchlse
shall become null and vold.

INTRODUCED, TITLE READ IN FULL, APPROVED ON FIRST READING AND

ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL THE 20" DAY OF JULY, 2011,

A PUBLIC

HEARING ON THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE HELD AT THE REGULAR MEETING
OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ON THE
3" DAY OF AUGUST, 2011, AT 7 P.M. IN THEMINTURN TOWN CENTER IN THE
TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO.

Mayor
ATTEST:

resolution or e, or other ¢ lcatlon from the Town to
the Company, asking, or requlring the Company to underground
Its new electrical facllities or its exIsting overhead electric facilitles,
or move, remove, or replace its existing undeiground electrical
facilities, shall be responded to in accordance with the provisions
of the Company's i

or other customary practices, as such may from time to time be
amended.

No provision contalned in this
Article shall be construed to obligate the Company to pay for the
removal and relocation of its underground electrlc facilities where
such is at the request or demand of a person, or a public or private
entlty under clrcumstances which require the party requesting or
demanding such to pay for the relocation under other prowvisi

Town Clerk

THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE READ BY
TITLE, ENACTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED BY TITLE ONLY ON SECOND
READING THIS 3¢ DAY OF AUGUST, 2011,

Attest:

Mayor

hereof or under the provisions of the Company's Electri¢ Service
or other customary practice in use by
the Company, as such may be from time Yo time amended,
& . This Franchise or the Town's Munlclpal
Code, as either may be amended from time to time, shall not
prohlbit or limit the Company's right to enforce its collection of any
cost Increase caused by governmental mandate in accordance with
the provisions of the Company's
or other customary practices of the Company, as suc;
may be from time to time amended. .

ARTICLE 13

. In the event new legislation
materfally affects the terms and conditions of this Franchlse
Ordinance, the parties agree to renegotlate the affected terms and
conditions in good faith as an amendment hereto. The partles
hereto ack vdedge that regulatory and leglslative changes in the
electric utllity, gas utllity and other energy Industrles are cutrently
being discussed natlonwide and statewide; that some changes in
utility Industry sectors have already been implemented; and that
other changes may be made In the future, durlng the term of this
Franchise. The partles agree, that insofar as future changes in the
utllity laws wiil allow, the Company shall always retain the right to
bill customers for utlllty transportation services and energy sales
within the Service Area If It Is the provider of elther the energy

Town Clerk

Town Attorney

Publication Dates:

HOLY CROSS ENERGY

Del Worley, Chlef Executive QOfficer

Date

Published in the Vall Dally on July 26, 2011,

53



Town Councill
MR. GORDON FLAHERTY, MAYOR
MR. GEORGE BRODIN, MAYOR PRO TEM

MRS. SHELLEY BELLM

MR. JERRY BUMGARNER

MR. AGGIE MARTINEZ

MR. EARLE BIDEZ
MR. JOHN ROSENFELD

Town of Minturn
302 PINE STREET
P. O. Box 309, MINTURN, CO 81645
(970) 827-5645 FAX (970) 827-5545
CHRIS CERIMELE— TOWN PLANNER
PLANNERl@MINTURN.ORG

TOWN OF MINTURN PLANNING DEPARTMENT
Town Council Staff Report
Subject: ORD 10 - 2011; An Ordinance granting and approving an
encroachment agreement between the Minturn Towne Homes Home
Owners’ Association and the Town of Minturn.
Chris Cerimele, Town Planner
HEARING DATE: August 3, 2011
Staff Recommendation: Approval

APPLICANT:

Minturn Towne Homes Owners’ Association
LOCATION

Minturn Towne Homes - Taylor Street Area

AGENDA ITEM BRIEF

The Minturn Towne Homes Owners’ Association is requesting a revocable license
agreement from the Town that will allow them to construct a drainage channel,
earth berm and storm sewer inlet along a section of Town-owned land known as
Grant Avenue.

BACKGROUND

The Minturn Towne Homes Owners’ Association approached the Town this past
spring to request permission to install a drainage system on Town-owned land. The
purpose of the proposed system is to alleviate drainage issues that were occurring
on the property. Currently, water flows over the retaining wall pictured below and
into a storm sewer system. The intent of the proposed berm and channel is to
intercept the run-off water before it flows over the retaining wall.

54



| "
T g F v b
!‘ﬁ"' >
g

The proposed system will consist of excavating a small channel to divert run-off
water into a new storm water inlet. Additionally, a small berm will be constructed
on the down slope side of the channel to prevent water from flowing over the
retaining wall and into the living units. The water that is collected in the channel
will flow to the north and be collected in a new storm sewer inlet. The new storm
sewer inlet will be connected to the existing storm sewer system on the property.

The general area where the proposed facilities would be constructed is shown on
the pictures below. Per the Council’s request, the area has been staked to
delineate the boundary of the proposed system. Generally, the system will be
constructed in the middle of the photos below.

55



The project entails the excavation of 52 cubic yards of earth from the Grant
Avenue right-of-way to create the drainage channel. Additionally, 629 cubic
yards of dirt will be brought into the site to be used to create the earthen berm
between the drainage channel and buildings H, | and J of the Minturn Towne

56



Homes. A drainage inlet and pipe will be installed at the north end of the property
to direct the run-off water into the existing drainage system on the property.

Details of the berm construction can be seen here:

i
INSTALL FILL MATERIAL PER
4.0 —-| RECOMMENDATIONS OF & UNDER THE

SUPERVISION OF THE GEOTECHNICAL
ENGINEER (TYP)

VARIES

MULCH, TACTIFY, AND SEED
ALL DISTURBED AREAS W/
NATIVE SCED MIX (TYP)

1" WIDE DITCH BOTTOM j

INSTALL PERMANENT TURF
REINFORCEMENT MAT NA GREEN P550
PER MANUFACTURER'S SPECIFICATIONS

EXISTING —/ ~~
GROUND

PLACE FILL ON FLAT BENCHES PER
GEOTECHNICAL ENGINEER'S DIRECTIONS (TYP)

COMPACT STRUCTURAL FILL TO /

90% STANDARD PROCTOR &
WITHIN 2% OF OPTIMUM

MOISTURE CONTENT (TYP) -

E] BERM CONSTRUCTION DETAIL

The dotted line on the above drawing indicates the existing slope of the hillside.
Soil will be excavated to create the 1’ wide channel. Per the specifications of the
project geotechnical engineer, structural fill (soil) will be brought in for the
construction of the berm. This fill will be placed on excavated benched to ensure
the stability of the berm. In no place will the height of the berm exceed 4°.

Town staff requested a drainage report from the project engineer stating that the
existing storm sewer system could handle the increased flows due to the
construction of the proposed system. The HOA provided the requested report
from Marcin Engineering that concluded the existing storm sewer system could
definitively handle the increased flows. Steve Humann of TST Engineering -the
Town’s contract engineer — reviewed the drainage report from Marcin Engineering
and agreed with their conclusion (see attached email report).

The following drawing indicates the extent of the proposed system. The drainage
channel and berm will be constructed in the hatched area of the drawing.

o7



STORM STRUCTURE 1
STRUCTURE: 48" Manhole
RIM: 7890.80

SUMP; 7886.55

(=)

INV IN:7886.80 18" HDPE
_— ] ROCK W
b AREA
(R

INLET
FEMCE B
> ¥
AND
‘9
e BLDG

A0 AT T L L
T Bl B

TERRACE|
ROCK WALL
AREA

10-FT OFFSET FROM TOP OF
EXISTING RETAINING WALL

BUILDING |

INLET RIM EL=64.82
INV IN(E)=61.52(12")
INV IN(E)=61.52(4")
INV IN(E)=62.27(4")
INV_OUT(W)=60.32

|3"ane—-£¥‘,,2" PE

\
\

4

BRICK
WALL

BUILDING H

ALL

|

1T

ST TR TR
1

A s I

=

IZ=SE==m==

T

NN

T

=

=mm

TORM STRUCTURE 2
TRUCTURE: C-DOT Type C
nlet with Standard Grate
RATE: 7908.68
NV OUT:7904.73 18" HDPE

l' (I
| STA: 0+00 - BEGIN

TYPlCAL SECTION A
Jl’ ;f j!;‘//
g /f/ //// f”f’// // oy
3(";/ / /17 / / ////

Vi // / / / s
,;f,/f?/f/; 2 o / //z
I AéOL(N 6F€M Rurlke J
) /{ SUCH THAT THE SURROUNDING /
STRUCTURAL FILL IS 2.0 FEET ABOVE i
ff ! | THE TOP OF THE GRATE ELEVATION -
/ GQORPINATE WITHENGINEER
”9 ;P,Nf‘ T mf /, /,:f
/ / ’/U ff / /1 /
[g iy
/ TA 0+45 BEGIN / / /
/

e lry 0t
| TYP!IC.;ﬁ}LSIIrEG'Ir:IONEiI‘.fj Ty
IR A (/]
! 'm\ﬁl )
1'#1 |1“' 111115 H:f HH ;r”
| L Ly
| 1‘1 11‘ P iR
iR
JSTA: 0+60-BEGIN | | |1 1{ 1]
f! | TYPICAL SECTION C k] 1]51 ML]‘
jfj'! RN Loy H!lt 5111 REER
e |11t\\u\
|ﬂ|! [Iif !]{E Ilt'[ llﬁ“l \\'l.\l
TR AN AR AN
Py [ JFl Ly I
ga‘ ;J'H lfll ;Jff | !
| I J'rr.l,.J fp ]
I/ | | STA 1415 - BEGIN R
TYPICAL SEGTION D r ’ | f" |
Iy ;
oy
f

F

jlrlrfl Jf
/’I” i
sA0T f | I

L L]

i
|
N
//// | | | |
vy | f{ |
)/, Ly sy Iy F’[ |
s G
C"{/// f////i//lrxf};f{{
/ FLOWLINE OF ’ s /!;

f F‘ROF"DSED DITCH -~ s

e
/ ///
/
f

\ . 1
{ IRIEST AL | M rah A A A Ik 1T =1 1r=r— N




LICENSE AGREEMENT:

The license agreement authorizes the use of the Town right-of-way until such a
time as the Town determines at a public hearing that the area of encroachment is
necessary for use as a recreational traill or other municipal purpose. The
agreement releases and discharges the Town from any and all liability arising from
the construction of the proposed drainage system. Per the direction of the Town
Council, a maintenance provision was added to the license agreement. This
provision states that the Grantee will be responsible for annual maintenance on
the drainage facility to ensure that the channel and inlet remain free from debris
and obstructions.

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends approval of Ord. 10 — 2011 on second reading.

DRAFT MOTION; ORD. 10 - 2011

| move to approve Ord. 10 - 2011 on second reading
OR

Deny Ord. 10 - 2011
Provide alternative direction to staff

Respectfully Submitted

Chris Cerimele, Town Planner
Attachments:
Grading and Drainage Plan — Marcin Engineering

Email from — TST Consulting Engineers
Ordinance 10 - 2011

59



Chris Cerimele

From: Steve Humann [shumann@tstinc.com] i
Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 3:14 PM

To: Chris Cerimele

Cc: Jim White; Don Taranto

Subject: RE: Minturn Townhomes: Drainage Letter
Chris,

We have reviewed the engineering analysis provided by Marcin Engineering LLC for the proposed drainage
improvements to the Minturn Townhomes as discussed in a letter dated May 19, 2011 from Marcin Engineering to Bold
Real Estate Solutions. The information and analysis appear to be accurate and there appears to be no additional flow
exiting the development site with the proposed condition.

Our primary concern, as discussed when we met on site, was the capacity of the existing pipe and inlet infrastructure.
Marcin has stated in the letter that the increase of flow through the pipe in a 100 year storm flow condition will not exceed
the capacity of the system and will not surcharge out of the inlets causing flooding conditions at the inlets. Based on our
review, their calculations and conclusions appear to be correct.

As far as the Town’s concern regarding the outflow from the development sheeting across Taylor Ave. in the absence of a
culvert, the proposed improvements do not make that condition worse in that all the drainage in question ended up in that
same spot anyway. This is an unfortunate situation that should have been looked at during the initial development
approval.

Please let me know if | can be of any additional help in this matter.

Steve F. Humann, P.E.

TST, Inc. Consulting Engineers

760 Whalers Way, Bldg. C, Suite 200
Fort Collins, CO 80525
970-226-0557

shumann@tstinc.com

60



TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. 10, SERIES 2011

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO SIGN A REVOCABLE LICENSE
AGREEMENT WITH MINTURN TOWNE HOMES OWNERS’ ASSOCIATION TO
PERMIT ENCROACHMENT ONTO TOWN RIGHT OF WAY PROPERTY OF THE
TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, AS IT PERTAINS TO GRANT AVENUE, BLOCK
A, TAYLOR ADDITION TO THE TOWN OF MINTURN, EAGLE COUNTY,
COLORADO

WHEREAS, Town of Minturn, Colorado (Grantor) owns for use and benefit of the
citizens of the Town of Minturn, Colorado and the general public, a 50-foot wide platted right of
way in the Taylor Addition to the Town of Minturn, Eagle County, Colorado, upon a portion of
which the Minturn Towne Homes Owners’ Association wishes to construct a drainage channel,
berm and inlet along Grant Avenue, Block A — Taylor Addition to the Town of Minturn on the
aforementioned platted right of way as shown in Attachment A; and

WHEREAS, Minturn Towne Homes Owners’ Association, (Grantee) wish authority to
use the area of the aforementioned platted right of way to construct the aforementioned drainage
channel, berm and inlet. Grantor is agreeable to the use of such property under the terms and
conditions as set forth below, more particularly described in the license agreement attached as
Attachment B, situated in the Town of Minturn, Colorado; and

WHEREAS, after notice provided by law, a public hearing was held before the Minturn
Town Council, at which time the applicant and the public were given an opportunity to express
their opinions regarding the proposed amendment; and

WHEREAS, based on the evidence, testimony and exhibits and recommendations of the
Town Council of the Town of Minturn, Colorado, finds as follows:

1. The proper publication was provided as required by law for the Town Council of the
Town of Minturn, Colorado.

2. The hearings before the Town Council were both extensive and complete and all
pertinent facts, matters and issues were submitted at those hearings.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN
OF MINTURN, COLORADO:

INTRODUCED, read by title, approved on the first reading and ordered published
in full the 20 day of July, 2011. The 3 day of August, 2011, at 7:00 p.m. at the Minturn Town
Hall, Minturn, Colorado 81645 is set for public hearing hereon.

61



TOWN OF MINTURN

By:
Mayor

ATTEST:

Town Clerk

THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE ENACTED AND

ORDERED PUBLISHED BY TITLE ONLY ON SECOND READING THIS _ DAY
OF 52011,
Mayor
ATTEST:
Town Clerk

62



63



Ordinance 10 — Series 2011 (ATTACHMENT B)

LICENSE AGREEMENT

This Agreement, entered into this 20" day of July, 2011, by and between the Town of
Minturn, a Colorado municipal corporation (hereinafter "Grantor") and Minturn Towne Homes
Owners’ Association, (hereinafter "Grantee").

RECITALS

Whereas, Grantor owns, for use and benefit of the citizens of the Town of Minturn, Colorado
and the general public, a 50-foot wide, unimproved, platted public road ("public right of way") in
Block A, Taylor Addition to the Town of Minturn, Eagle County, Colorado, and

Whereas, Grantee wishes authority to use the area depicted on the map attached as Exhibit A
to construct a drainage berm and channel for the purpose of diverting run-off water from the adjacent
hillside into the existing drainage system located on the Grantee’s property and Grantor is agreeable
to the use of such property under the terms and conditions as set forth below.

Now, therefore, for and in consideration of the performing of the covenants and agreements
by the Parties to this Agreement, the Grantor does hereby permit the Grantee to use the property
depicted on the map attached as Exhibit A for the purpose of installing a drainage channel and inlet
for the purpose of diverting run-off water from the adjacent hillside into the existing drainage system
as set forth in this License Agreement:

This license shall extend from the date of this License Agreement until such a time as the
Grantor determines at a public hearing that the area of encroachment is necessary for use as a
recreational trail or other municipal purpose. The following stipulations are expressly agreed by and
between the Grantor and Grantees.

1. Use of Site. The site be used for the construction of a drainage channel and inlet
and for no other purpose whatsoever.

2. Term. As indicated above.

3. Condition of Site. During the term of this License Agreement, Grantees shall keep
the premises licensed under this Agreement in good condition. Grantees agree to
undertake no activity which could be hazardous or in any way detrimental to the
community, or permit further encroachment of the structure into the public right of
way.

4. Maintenance. The Grantee will be responsible for annual maintenance on the
drainage facility to ensure that the channel and inlet remain free from debris and
obstructions.

5. Release From Liability. Grantee hereby releases and discharges the Grantor from
any and all liability arising from this Agreement, to-wit; from damage to its
property, whether in custody of the Grantee or its agents or representatives, or in
the control or custody of the employees or representatives of the Grantor, or
whether in the control or custody of third parties or while upon premises owned or
under the control of the Grantor or Grantee.

64



Ordinance 10 — Series 2011 (ATTACHMENT B)

6. Indemnification. Grantee hereby agrees that it shall indemnify, defend and hold
harmless Grantor and its successors and assigns from, against, and with respect to
any claim, liability, obligation, loss, damage, assessment, judgment, cost or
expense (including, without limitation, reasonable attorneys' fees and expenses and
costs and expenses reasonably incurred in investigating, preparing or defending
against any litigation or claim, action, suit, proceeding or demand, of any kind or
character), of or in any manner relating or attributable to any claims of damages
arising from Grantee's activities associated with this License Agreement.

7. Assignment and Subletting. This License Agreement may not be transferred or
assigned during the term of this License Agreement without the prior written
consent to assignment of this License Agreement by Grantor, nor shall Grantee
permit any other person or entity to share its occupancy hereunder without the
prior written permission of the Grantor.

8. Notices. All notices and communications required herein shall be in writing and
shall be sent by certified mail to the following addresses:

Grantor:

Town Manager
Town of Minturn
PO Box 309
Minturn, CO 81645

Grantee:

Minturn Towne Homes Owners Association
PO Box 5800
Avon, CO 81620

Notices shall be deemed properly given when mailed by certified mail in a sealed envelope, postage
prepaid, addressed to the above addresses. Any such notice or demand shall be deemed to have been
given or made at the time it is deposited in the United States Post Office. Any party may change its
address of record by giving written notice of the change to the other party.

8. Waiver. Failure or delay on the part of Grantee or the Grantor to exercise any
right, power or privilege hereunder shall not operate as a waiver thereof.

9. Prior Negotiations. This License Agreement constitutes the entire agreement of
the parties hereto and shall supersede all prior offers, negotiations and
agreements.

10. Amendments. No revision of this License Agreement shall be valid unless made
in writing and signed by an authorized officer of Grantor and by Grantee.

65



Ordinance 10 — Series 2011 (ATTACHMENT B)

11. Applicable Law. This License Agreement is entered into at Minturn, Eagle
County, Colorado, and it is agreed that the proper jurisdictions and venue of any
action pertaining to the interpretation of enforcement of this License Agreement
shall be in the County or District Court of Eagle County, Colorado. This License
Agreement shall be interpreted under the laws of the State of Colorado.

12. Binding Agreement. It is understood and agreed that this Agreement shall be
binding upon the assigns and successors in interest of the parties hereto.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have set the hands of their respective authorized

officers.
TOWN OF MINTURN,
a Colorado Municipal Corporation,
Grantor
ATTEST:
Town Clerk Mayor
MINTURN TOWN HOMES OWNERS’ ASSOCIATION,
Inc.,
Grantee
By:
Its:
ATTEST:
Secretary

66



Ordinance 10 — Series 2011 (ATTACHMENT B)

STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss.

COUNTY OF EAGLE )

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me, the undersigned Notary Public,
by Gordon “Hawkeye” Flaherty, as Mayor of the Town of Minturn and Jay Brunvand, as Town Clerk of
the Town of Minturn, this day of , 2011.

My commission expires

Witness my hand and seal.

NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss.

COUNTY OF EAGLE )

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before undersigned Notary Public, by :
this day of , 2011,

My commission expires

Witness my hand and seal.

NOTARY PUBLIC

67



TOWN OF MINTURN ORDINANCE CHECKLIST
pe jo - 207
FIRST READING

'7/_’ ?"/// The ordinance shall be introduced and read by title at any regular or special
meeting. Copies shall be available to the public.

7/£3f/’7 If the ordinance is approved on first reading, Mayor and Clerk must sign
ordinance after first reading. It shall be published in full in a newspaper of general
circulation within the Town. The minutes shall reflect number of votes for and against
each ordinance.

[f the ordinance is tabled, it shall be reconsidered at subsequent meetings
until it is approved with or without amendment or rejected by vote of the Council.

4, /2 /7Y The Council shall set a day, hour and place at which the Council shall
hold a public hearing on the ordinance, and notice of such day, hour and place shall be
included in the first publication.

SECOND READING

The ordinance shall be introduced a second time at the meeting at which
the public hearing on the ordinance is held. The ordinance may be read by title only on
second reading. The ordinance may be amended before final approval or rejection by
vote of the Council. The text of any such amendment or amendments shall be read in
full.

If the ordinance is substantially amended it shall be published in full after
final passage. If not amended in substance, it may be published either by title or in full,
as the Council may determine, after final passage.

The minutes shall reflect the number of votes for and against the ordinance.

A true copy of every ordinance shall be numbered and recorded in the
official records of the Town. Its adoption and publication shall be authenticated by the
signatures of the Mayor or Mayor Pro Tem and the Town Clerk and by the certificate of
publication. Proof of publication for both readings shall be attached to the ordinance.

The effective date of ordinances is seven (7) days after publication
following final passage unless a later date is prescribed in the ordinance.

68



Thu, Jul 21, 2011
6801041

Acct: 1003134
Phone: (303)827-5645

14:19:17

Ad Ticket #5

Name: Town of Minturn

E-Mail:
Client:
Caller: ‘@ City: Minturn
Receipt State: CO Zip: 81645-0309

Ad Name: 6801041A
Editions: 8VD/8VDI/
Start: 07/22/11

Original Id: 0

Class: 0990
Stop: 07/22/11

Copyline: 6801041 Ordinance No. 10-2011 Rep: Pam Schultz
TSR SR
mmmw’ RhAL A
Lines: 87 'me e
Depth: 7.26
Columns: 1
Discount; 0.00
Commission:; 0.00
Net: 0.00
Tax: 0.00
Tealpad o 8265 S
Payment 0.00

B 1;;1 :'xm g

=0

ATTERF
Fewn Chur

el I e Vel Dy July 27, 2510
Rt il

Ad shown is not actual print size

69



TOWN OF MINTURN
P.O. Box 309 (302 Pine Street)
Minturn, Colorado 81645-0309

970-827-5645 Fax: 970-827-5545
treasurer@minturn.org

TOWN OF

MINTURN

FROM THE DESK OF
JAY BRUNVAND, TREASURER/FINANCE

MEMORANDUM

TO: Minturn Town Council
FROM: Jay Brunvand, Treasurer/Clerk
CC:

DATE: Wednesday, July 27, 2011

RE: Executive Session

At the Council meeting, Council will need to convene in Executive Session with the
Town Manager and Attorneys to discuss the USFS Boneyard and issues regarding Battle
Mountain Resort. The following motion is recommended:

“Recommended motion: “I move to convene in Executive Pursuant to CRS 24-6-
402(4)(a) for the purposes to consult with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction
regarding the negotiations of the USFS Boneyard property and Pursuant to CRS 24-6-
402(4)(b) for the purposes to consult with the Town's Attorney(s) and receive direction
regarding the negotiations of the Battle Mountain Resort property annexation, water
right issues, and EPA update.”

The Mayor will announce for the record if any decision is to be made as a result of the
Executive Session once the Regular Session meeting reconvenes.

Please contact me in the event you have any questions.

Thank You, Jay

U:\My Documents\MEMO-EXECUTIVE SESSION.doc

70





