TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO
ORDINANCE NO. 5 - SERIES 2011

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN REPEALING AND
REENACTING ARTICLES 1-4 AND 5-8 OF CHAPTER 18 OF THE TOWN OF
MINTURN MUNICIPAL CODE AND REPLACING THOSE SECTIONS WITH
ARTICLES 1-4 AND 5-8 AND ADDING A NEW ARTICLE 9 AND 10 AND
RENUMBERING SUBSEQUENT SECTIONS TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE
THE 2009 EDITIONS OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE,
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE,
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL
CODE, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AND THE
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE AS CURRENTLY ADOPTED BY THE
STATE OF COLORADO

WHEREAS, in promotion of the public health, safety and welfare of the inhabitants of
the Town of Minturn, the Town Council desires to update its ordinances by adopting the 2009
International Building Codes with amendments; and

WHEREAS, section 11.11 of the Home Rule Charter and section 31-16-202, C.R.S., as
amended, permit the contemplated adoption by reference of such codes upon notice and hearing
as provided in Section 31-16-203, C.R.S.; and

WHEREAS, the Minturn Town Council held a public hearing, with proper notice
provided, to consider adoption of such International Codes as required by law; and

WHEREAS, copies of said International Codes are available in the Planning Office at
the Minturn Town Center; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council has determined, based on the evidence and testimony
presented at the public hearing, that the adoption of these codes, as amended herein, will further
the health, safety and welfare of the inhabitants of Minturn; and

NOW, THEREFORE, THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS as follows:

Section 1. Article 1 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Section 18-1-10. Title.

The provisions of the ordinance codified herein shall be know and cited collectively as
the “Town of Minturn Building Code” or “International Codes.”

Section 18-1-20. Codes adopted.

(1) The Town of Minturn adopts by reference the following codes:




a. International Building Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

b. International Residential Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

c. International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001 '

d. International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition as published
by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001

e. International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

f. International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001

g. International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, as published
by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001

h. National Electrical Code as currently adopted by the State of
Colorado.

i. International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor,
Washington, DC 20001 (adopted by Ordinance 8 - Series 2011)

Section 2. Article 2 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows: '

Building Code
Section 18-2-10. International Building Code adopted.

(a) The International Building Code, 2009 Edition, 2" printing, as published by the International
Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, Chapters 1
through 35 inclusive, exclusive of any Appendices, (“IBC”) is hereby adopted by reference as
the Town of Minturn Building Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions,
deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IBC, as adopted and as amended.




Section 18-2-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:

(1) Section 111.2 Certificate Issued shall read: “Final Certificate of Occupancy Inspection
approval shall be the Certificate of Occupancy.”

(2) Section 419.2 Occupancies. The following sentence shall be added: “F and I occupancies
shall not be permitted in a live/work unit.”

(3) Section 1029 Emergency Escapes and Rescue is amended to delete Exception 1

(4) Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Loads is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:
“Snow loads for roods and decks shall be 75 pounds per square foot.”

(5) Section 1809.5 Frost Protection. This section is amended by deleting the section in its
entirety and replacing it with the following language: “Foundation walls, piers and other
permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from frost by the
following method — Footings subject to frost shall have a minimum depth of 48”
measured from finished grade to the bottom of the footing or the depth specified by the
soils engineer of record.”

(6) Section 1809.12 Timber Footings is deleted in its entirety.

(7) Section 2111.13 Exterior Air Intake is amended by adding the following: “Outside
combustion air intake shall be required for all gas-fired and wood burning fireplaces.
Combustion air ducts shall be a minimum 26 gauge sheet metal for the portion of duct
extending through the building on the outside of the fire-resistive shaft. Ducts extending
from the fireplace and exiting directly to the outside without passing through any other
portion of the building may be of any material permitted by the fireplace manufacturer or
the International Mechanical Code. Fireplaces: Where dampers are required to be
removed, clamped or welded open- doors in front of fireplace openings are required.

(8) Section 3001.5 is amended to read as follows: “A fee for each permit and plan review
shall be paid to the Northwest Colorado Council of Governments. The annual certificate
of inspection will be administered by the certified elevator inspection agency. For permit
applications and inspections, contact Elevator Inspection Program at (970) 468-0295.
Ext. 108

Section 3. Article 3 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Residential Code

Section 18-3-10. International Residential Code adopted




(@) The International Residential Code, 2009 Edition, 2" printing, as published by the

International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washingion, DC
20001, Chapters 1 through 44 inclusive and Appendices A, C, G, H, and N, (“IRC”) is
hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Residential Building Code as if
fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as

set forth in this Article.

(b) No residential building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or

moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of
materials and workmanship, conform with the IRC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-3-20. Amendments.

The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:

(1)

@)

€)
(4)

®)

(6)
)

(®)

)

Section R104.4 Inspections is amended by the addition of the following paragraph: “A
third party inspection by a certified log inspection agency shall be required of all
structural members in log framed buildings. A letter from the log grading agency
certifying log grades are in accordance with the plan specifications shall be required at,
or prior to frame inspection. Elevators installed in all structures shall require a third
party plan review and inspection by Northwest Colorado Council of Governments.”

Section R301.2.3 Snow Loads is amended by the addition of the following: “Snow
loads for roofs and decks shall be 75 pounds per square foot.”

Section R302.2.2 Townhouses is amended by the deletion of the exception.

Section R302.5.1 is amended by the addition of the following statement at the end,
Doors shall be self closing.

Section R302.7 is amended to read enclosed accessible spaces under stairs shall have
walls, under stair surfaces and any soffit protected on the enclosed side with 5/8” Type
X gypsum board.

Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems is deleted in its entirety.

Section R313.2 One and two-family dwelling automatic fire systems is deleted in its
entirety.

Section R315.1 Carbon Monoxide alarms is amended by deleting this section and
replacing it with the following language: “For new construction, an approved carbon
monoxide alarm shall be installed within fifteen feet of the entrance to each bedroom in
dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in dwelling units that
have attached garages.”

Section R403.1.4.1 Frost Protection is amended by deleting the section in its entirety
and replacing it with the following: “Foundation walls, piers, and other permanent
supports of buildings shall be protected from frost by the following method — Footings
subject to frost shall have a minimum depth of 48” measured from finished grade to the
bottom of the footing or the depth specified by the soils engineer of record.”




(10) Section R403.2 Footings for Wood Foundations is amended by adding the following:
“Foundations shall be designed by a registered Colorado Engineer or Architect and
approved by a Geotechnical Engineer.

(11) Section R403.3 Frost Protected Shallow Foundations is amended by adding the
following: “Foundations shall be designed by a registered Colorado Engineer or
Architect and approved by a Geotechnical Engineer.

(12) Section R404.2 Wood Foundation Walls is amended by adding the following: -
“Foundations shall be designed by a registered Colorado Engineer or Architect and
approved by the Geotechnical Engineer.”

(13) Section G2425.8 (501.8) Equipment Not Required to be Vented is amended by deleting
item #7. The sentence after this exception should be amended to read: “Where the
appliances listed in Items 5 and 6 above...”

(14) Section G2445 (621) is amended by removing all subsections and replacing it with
“Section G2445.1 General. Unvented room heaters are prohibited from installation.”

(15) Table R301.2(1) is amended by deleting it in its entirety and replacing it with the

following:
Table R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
Roof WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER ICE BARRIER FLOOD AIR MEAN
Snow DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT | HAZARDS | FREEZING | ANNUAL
Speed | Topographic DESIGN Weathering | Frost | Termite
Load TEMP REQUIRED INDEX TEMP
effects line
(mph) CATEGORY
depth
75 90 NO B SEVERE 48" NONE -15°F YES 2007 2000 45°F
psf TO
SLIGHT




(16)

Table R302.6 is amended to read:

SEPERATION

MATERIAL

From residence and attics

not less than5/8” Type X gypsum board
applied on the garage side

From all habitable rooms above the garage

not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum board

Structure(s) supporting floor ceiling
assemblies used for separation required by
this section

not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum board

Garages located less than 6 feet from a
dwelling unit on the same lot

not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum board
applied to the interior side of exterior
walls of the garage that are within this
area

(17) Add a new Section R303.1.2 Mechanical ventilation to read:

(18)

R303.1.2 Mechanical ventilation. Dwelling units shall be provided with a
mechanical exhaust system, supply system, or combination thereof to provide whole-
building ventilation with outdoor air. Such system shall comply with Section

R303.1.2.1 through R303.1.2.2.

Exception:

1. Other approved mechanical ventilation systems.

Add a new Section R303.1.2.1 Mechanical ventilation rate to read:

R303.1.2.1 Mechanical ventilation rate. The mechanical ventilation system shall
provide outdoor air continuously at a rate of not less than that determined in accordance

with Table R303.4(1)

Exception: Continuous operation of the system is not required where the system has

- controls that enable operation for not less the 25% of each 6 hour segment and the

ventilation rate prescribed in Table R303.1.2.1 (1) is multiplied by the factor in

accordance with Table R303.1.2.1 (2)

(19) Add anew table, TABLE R303.1.2.1 (1) to read:

TABLE R303.1.2.1 (1)
VENTILATION AIR REQUIREMENTS, CFM!




FLOOR BEDROOMS
?ﬁf"‘ Q- 0-1 23 45 67 >7
<1,500 30 45 60 75 90
1,500-3,000 45 60 75 90 105
3,001-4,500 60 75 90 105 120
4,501-6,000 75 90 105 120 135
6,001-7,500 90 105 120 135 150
>7,500 105 120 135 150 165

For SI: 1 square foot = 1 square foot = 0.0929 m2.

1. Equation R303.1.2.1 (1) can be used as an alternative to Table R303.1.2.1 (1)
Qfan = 0.01 Afloor + 7.5 (Nbr + 1)
Where:
Qfan = fan flow rate in cubic feet per minute (cfm).
Afloor = floor area in square feet (ft2)
Nbr = number of bedrooms; not to be less than 1

(20) Add a new table, TABLE R303.1.2.1 (2) to read:

TABLE R303.1.2.1 (2)

INTERMITTENT MECHANICAL VENTILATION RATE FACTORS # b
Run-Time
Percentage
In each 6 25% 33% 50% 66% 75%
hour
Segment
Factor 4 3 2 1.5 1.3

a. Interpolation between entries is permitted.
b. The ventilation system run time shall be not less than 25%

(21) Add a new section R303.1.2.2, System design, to read:

R303.1.2.2 System design. The required whole-house ventilation system shall consist
of one or more supply or exhaust fans or a combination therof and associated ducts and
controls. Outdoor air ducts connected to the return side of an air handler shall be
considered to be supply ventilation where the manufacturer’s requirements for a
minimum return air temperature for the air handler are met.

(22) Add a new section R303.1.2.3 System Controls, to read:




R303.1.2.3 System Controls. The mechanical ventilation system shall be provided
with controls that enable occupant override.

(23) Add a new section R303.3.1 Bathroom ventilation to read:

R303.3.1 Bathroom ventilation. Bathrooms shall be mechanically exhausted in
accordance with section 1507.

Section 4. Article 4 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows: ‘

International Fuel Gas Code
Section 18-4-10. International Fuel Gas Code adopted.

() The International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition 2™ printing as published by the International
Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, Chapters 1
through 8 inclusive, (“IFGC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Fuel Gas
Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as
set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IFGC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-4-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:
(1) Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations is amended by deleting exceptions number 3 and 4.

(2) Section 402.6.2 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Facilities and Piping is amending by the
addition of the following sentence: “Liquefied petroleum gas facilities and equipment
shall not be located in any pit or basement, under show windows or interior stairways, in
engine, boiler, heater, or electric meter rooms”. The following exception shall apply:
“equipment may be installed with an approved means of detection and removal of
unburned liquid petroleum gas. A minimum 3” drain pipe to the exterior of the building,
propane sensor and automatic safety shutoff shall be installed. The drain shall not be
trapped and shall be protected from snow closure and rodents. When the above listed
means cannot be achieved, an engineered mechanical exhaust system with a propane
sensor, and an automatic safety shut-off, shall be required”.

(3) Section 501.8 Equipment Not Required to be Vented is amended by the deletion of item
No. 8




Section 5. Article 6 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

International Energy Conservation Code
Section 18-5-10. International Energy Conservation Code adopted.

(a) The International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition 5™ printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001,
Chapters 1 through 6 inclusive, (“IECC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn
Energy Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and
changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IECC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-5-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:

(1) Chapter 1 Administration shall be deleted and chapter 1 of the IBC and IRC shall apply.

Section 6. Article 7 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows: ’

International Plumbing Code

(@) The International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition 3™ printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001,
Chapters 1 through 13 inclusive, (“IPC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of
Minturn Plumbing Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions,
insertions and changes as set forth in this Article. '

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the
Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship,
conform with the IPC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 7. Article 8 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Mechanical Code
Section 18-8-10. International Mechanical Code adopted.

(@) The International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition 4™ printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001,
Chapters 1 through 15 inclusive, (“IMC”) is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn
Mechanical Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and
changes as set forth in this Article.




(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IMC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 8. Article 9 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Property Maintenance Code
Section 18-9-10; International Property Maintenance Code adopted.

(a) The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition 1% printing as published by the
International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, is
hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Property Maintenance Code as if fully set
out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this
Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the IPMC, as adopted and as amended.

Section 9. Article 10 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed
and reenacted to read as follows:

National Electrical Code
Section 18-9-10. National Electrical Code adopted.

(a) The National Electrical Code, as published by the National Fire Protection Association, and
the rules and regulations thereunder, as adopted, amended and updated to the most current
edition by the Colorado State Electrical Board from time to time (“NEC”) pursuant to the
authority set forth in Article 23 of Title 12, C.R.S., is hereby adopted by reference as the City of
Centennial Electrical Code as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions,
insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the City
unless the same shall, as to design, construction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform
with the NEC, as adopted and as amended. :

Section 10.  Severability. If any part, section, sub-section, clause or phrase of this
Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this Ordinance; and the Town Council for the Town of Minturn, Colorado
hereby declares it would have passed this ordinance and each part, section, sub-section, sentence,
clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more parts, sections, sub-
sections, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared invalid.

Section 11.  The Town Council hereby finds, determines and declares that this




Ordinance is necessary and proper for the health, safety and welfare of the Town of Minturn and
the inhabitants thereof.

Section 12.  The repeal or the repeal and re-enactment of any provision of the Minturn
Municipal Code as provided in this ordinance shall not affect any right which has accrued, and
duty imposed, any violation that occurred prior to the effective date hereof, any prosecution
commenced, nor any other action or proceeding as commenced under or by virtue of the
provision repealed or repealed and re-enacted. The repeal of any provision hereby shall not
revive any provision or any ordinance previously repealed or superseded unless expressly stated
herein.

INTRODUCED, TITLE READ IN FULL, APPROVED ON FIRST READING AND
ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL THE ZO _ DAY OF JULY, 2011. A PUBLIC
HEARING ON THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE HELD AT THE REGULAR MEETING

OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ON THE
: Z DAY OF AUGUST, 2011, AT 7 P.M. IN THE MINTURN TOWN CENTER IN THE
TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO.

Town Clerk

\
THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE READ BY
TITLE, ENACTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED BY TITLE ONLY ON SECOND
READING THIS .Z DAY OF ﬁéﬁ*&ﬂf ,2011.
(%

—a J

Town Clerk




TOWN OF MINTURN ORDINANCE CHECKLIST

I - 20 2/
FIRST READING

7 éﬂz /4 The ordinance shall be introduced and read by title at any regular or special
meeting. Copies shall be available to the public.

7/Z (// 7 If the ordinance is approved on first reading, Mayor and Clerk must sign
ordinance after first reading. It shall be published in full in a newspaper of general
circulation within the Town. The minutes shall reflect number of votes for and against
each ordinance.

If the ordinance is tabled, it shall be reconsidered at subsequent meetings
until it is approved with or without amendment or rejected by vote of the Council.

?//7 //  The Council shall set a day, hour and place at which the Council shall
hold a public hearing on the ordinance, and notice of such day, hour and place shall be
included in the first publication.

SECOND READING

The ordinance shall be introduced a second time at the meeting at which
the public hearing on the ordinance is held. The ordinance may be read by title only on
second reading. The ordinance may be amended before final approval or rejection by
vote of the Council. The text of any such amendment or amendments shall be read in
full.

If the ordinance is substantially amended it shall be published in full after
~ final passage. If not amended in substance, it may be published either by title or in full,
as the Council may determine, after final passage.

The minutes shall reflect the number of votes for and against the ordinance.

A true copy of every ordinance shall be numbered and recorded in the
official records of the Town. Its adoption and publication shall be authenticated by the
signatures of the Mayor or Mayor Pro Tem and the Town Clerk and by the certificate of
publication. Proof of publication for both readings shall be attached to the, ordinance.

The effective date of ordinances is seven (7) days after publication
following final passage unless a later date is prescribed in the ordinance.




Fri, Jul 22, 2011
6804958

Acct:

Phone:
E-Mail:
Client:
Caller:
_Receipt

Ad Name:
Editions:
Start:

Color:

Copyline:

1003134
(303)827-5645

Jay

15:22:06

Ad Ticket #5

Name: Town of Minturn
Address: PO Box 309

City: Minturn

State: CO Zip: 81645-0309

6804958D
8VvD/8VvDI/
07/25/11

6804958 2-2 Ordinance No 5-2011

Original Id: 6804915
Class: 0990
Stop: 07/25/11

Issue '
Rep: Pam Schultz

[

Lines:
Depth:

Columns:
Discount;
Commission:

Net:
Tax:

Payment

SHERRTINSS T G PRI ACT EEVAT S R
b e ey - )= “ T e T A B R g
re INEPUINIS SPU H oy o s e o
mTARY w48 it v Al ahAm B At 24 e B ST
2 Unberuatoems sbiarpamt
¥ Bt o A e it o i
0 O s AR L R ik
i Vo stz Eide
10 s e R "
O AL i PR S vk
fety ek, ey
- o
it Vol et i o
0.00 et et
o g 15 . S
0.00
s34 S
L T
0.00 o o :
.
“ . : et
S -y
oyl el e g e L g T s e
0.00 =
] pomtied sy pe
- .
lmirtasl g Putretdn Y
| semvsts bt o i e
= i e irihos e e
faxise e
Porod i prsiemio e florb b e o Wiy o
0.00 : e
. . Cannn
P re—
v ki e e
a a BT N G SN T e TR IR

Wou
v e T pren
WAL o St e e g e o
A {185 m el _ —

Syt
ke A Sk Aokt o T g m ¢ omte

i b s e K

Ad shown is not actual print size




Fri, Jul 22, 2011

15:20:36

6804915
Ad Ticket #5
-~ Acct: 1003134 Name: Town of Minturn
Phone: (303)827-5645 Address: PO Box 309
E-Mail:
Client: |
Caller: Jay City: Minturn
Receipt State: CO Zip: 81645-0309
Ad Name: 6804915D Original Id: 6804893
Editions: 8vVD/8VDV/ Class: 0990
Start: 07/25/11 Stop: 07/25111

Color: Issue 1
Copyline: 6804915 1-2 Ordinance No 5-2011 'Rep: Pam Schultz

Lines: 0

Depth: 15

Columns: 5

Discount: 0.00

Commission: 0.00

Net: 0.00

Tax: 0.00

Payment 0.00

Ad shown is not actual print size




TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO
ORDINANCENO. 5 - SERIES 2011

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN REPEALING AND REENACTING ARTICLES 1-§ AND 58 OF
CHAPTER 18 OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN MUNICIPAL CODE AND REPLACING THOSE SECTIONS WITH
ARTICLES 1-4 AND 5-8 AND ADDING A NEW ARTICLE 9 AND 10 AND RENUMBERING SUBSEQUENT SECTIONS
TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE THE 2009 EDITIONS OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE,
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE AND THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE AS CURRENTLY ADOPTED BY THE STATE
OF COLORADO

WHEREAS, in promoton of the publio healh, sefety and welfoo of the inhabitats of the Town of Mintum, the Tewn Counil
desires toupdate | adopting the 2009 ional Building Codes with amendments; and

WHEREAS, section 11.11 of the Home Rule Charter and section 31-16-202, C.R.S., as amended, permit the contemplated adogtion
by reference of such codes upon notice and hearing es provided in Section 31-16-203, C.RS; and

WHEREAS, the Mintum Town Council held a public hearing, with proper notice provided, 1o consider adoption of such International
Codes as required by aw; and

'WHEREAS, copies of said International Codes sre availoble in the Planning Office a1 the Mintum Town Center; and

'WHEREAS, the Town Council h ined, based an the evid diesti the public heasi doptit
of these codes, as amended herein, will further the health, safety and welfuro of the inhabitants of Mintum; and

NOW, THEREFORE, THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS as follows:
Section 1, Anticle 1 of Chaples 18 of the Mintum Municipal Code is hereby repealed and recnacted to read s follows:
Section §8-1-10. Title,

The provisions of the ordinance codified herein shall be know and cited collectively as the “Town of Mintum Building Codz=™ or
“International Codes.”

Section 18-1-20. Codes adopted,

[O) The Town of Mintum sdopls by reference the follawing codes:

a  Inemational Building Code, es published by th
New Jorsey Avenuo, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001

Code Council, 500
b Infermattonal Residential Code, 2009 Edition, s published by the Intemational Code Council,
500 Now Jerscy Avenus, NW, 61th Floor, Washington, DC 20001

[ International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the Intemational Code Council, 500
New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 2000/

d Iternational Energy Canservation Code, 2009 Edition as published by the Intemationsl Code
Cauncil, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001

e International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, s3 published by the Intemtionel Code Council,
500 New Jersey Avenve, NW, 6th Floor, Washinglon, DC

£ Internationad Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the Intemations] Code Council,
500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 61h Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001

g Intemational PropertyMaintenance Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the Intemational Cod
Council, 500 Now Jersoy Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001

b Nattonal Electrieal Code as currently adopted by the State of Colorada,

A International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the International Code Covnrcil, 500
New Jersey Avenne, N1¥, 6th Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001 (adspled by Ordinwice 8 - Serfes
201)

Seetlon 2, Article 2 of Chapter 18 of tho Mintum Municipal Code is hereby repealed and reenacted to read as follows:
Building Code
Section 18-2-10. International Bullding Code dopted.

(a) The Jntemiational Bullding Code, 2009 Edition, 2% printing, as published by the Intematianal Code Council, 500 New Jersey Aveaus, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001, Chapters 1 through 35 inclusive, exclusive of any Appendices, (*IBC")is hervby adopted by’ reference as the Town of
Minturn Building Code s if fully sct outin this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shalt be hercafier constructed, ecected, enlarged, aliered, of moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction,
quality of meterials and worlamanship, conform with the IBC, as adopied and as smended.

Section 1§-2-20. Amendments,
The following sections of the adopled code ere hereby rovised es follows:

(1) Section 1112 Centificate Jasued shall read: "Final Cestificate of Occupancy Inspection approval shall be the Certifieate of
Occupancy.”

(2)  Section 4192 Occupnacies. The following seatence shall be sdded: “F and I occupancies shall not be permitted in a live/mork
unit.”

(3)  Scction 1029 Emergency Escapes and Rescus is amended to delele Exception /

(4 Section 16082 Ground Snow Loads is hereby deleted and replaced with the following: “Snow loads for roods and decks shall be 75
pounds per square fool.”

() Section 1809.5 Frost Frolection. This section is amended by defeting the section in its entirety and replacing it with the following
Tangusge: “Foundation walls, picrs and,other permenent supports of buildings and structares shall bo protocted from frost by the
following method — Footings subject fo frost shall bave a minimum depth of 48” measured from finished grade to the botiom of the
footing of the depth specified by the soils engincer of secord.”

{6)  Scction 1809.12 Timber Foolings is deleied in its entirety,

() Section 211113 Exterior Air Intake is amended by adding the following; “Outside combustion sir intake shall be sequired for all gas-
fired and wood buming frcplaces, Combustion sir ducts shall be a minimum 26 gaugo sheet metsl for the portion of duct extending
through the buitding on the outside of the fire-resistive shaft. Ducts extending from the fireplace nnd exiting directly to the ou
withou! passing through any other portion of tho building may bo of any malerisl permitted by the fircplece manufucturer o the
Tntemational Mechanical Code. Fircpluces: Where dampers are sequired o be removed, clamped oc welded open- doors in front of
fireplace openings are required.

() Section 3001.5 is amended 1o read as follows: “A fee for each permit and plen review shall be paid 1o the Nosthwest Colorado Council
of Governments. The annusl certificate of inspection will bo sdministered by the certified elevator inspection sgency. For pormit
applications and inspeclions, contact Elevator Inspection Program st (970) 468-0295, Ext, 108

Scction 3. Arlicle 3 of Chapter 18 of the Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and reenncted 1o read as follows:
Residential Code
Section 18-3-10. International Residential Code adopted

(®)  Thelntemational Reddential Code, 2009 Edition, 2% printing, 25 published by the Intemationsl Code Council, 500 New Jersey
Avenue, NW, 61h Floor. Washingion, DC 20001, Chaplers 1 through 44 inclusive and Appendicas A, C. G. H, snd N, ("IRC")
is hereby adopled by refereace as the Town of Mintum Resideatial Building Code as if fully set out in this Ordinence, with the
additians, deletions, insertions and changes aa set forth in this Article.

()  Noresidential building shall be hereafier construcied, erceted, cnlarged, allered, or moved into the Town unfess the same shall,
10 design. constmction, quality of materials and workmanship, conform with the IRC. as adopted and as amended.

Section 18-3-20. Amendments, B
The following scctions of the sdopted code are hereby revised as follows:

w Section R104.4 Inspections is amended by the addition of the following poragraph: "A third party inspection by s extified log

b ] inlogf iidings. Aletter from the log gradingagency ceriifying
log grad mm the plan spesil | 4t or priorto Elovators installed in sll
structures shall require a third party plan roview and inspection by Northwest Colorado Council of Govemments.™

@ Section R301.2.3 Snow Loads is smended by the addition of the folfowing: “Snow loads for roofs and decks shall be 75 pounds
per aquore fool."

[6)] Section R3022.2 h is amended by the deletion of th pli

[O] Section R302.5.1 isamended by the sddition of the following statcment t tho end, Doors shall be self clasing.

) Section R302.7 is amended Lo read enclosed accessible spaces under stairs shall have walls, under stair s\lrfleas and any soffil

protected on the enclosed side with 5787 Type X gypsum board.

(6] Section R313,1 Townhouse automatic fire yprinkler sysiems is deleted in i1s enfirety.
(U] Section R313.2 One and two-family dwelling avtomatic fire systems is deleted in its entirety.
)] Section R315.1 Carbon Monoxide alarms is amended by deieting this section and replacing it with the following language: “For

new construclion. an spproved carbon menoxide alarm shall be installed within fifleen feet of the entrance 0 each bedroom in
dwelling unils within which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in dwelling units that have atisched garages.”

® Section R403.14.1 Frost Protection is smended by deleting tho section in its entirety and replacing it with the following:
“Poundation walls, piers, and other permanent supports of bulldings shall be profected from frost by the following method -
Footings subject o frost shall have s minimum depth of 48" measured from fnished grade to the bottom of the footing or the depth
apecified by the scils engincer of record.”

(10) Section R403.2 Foolings for Wood Foundations is nmended by sdding the folfowing: “Foundations shall be designed by a
registered Colorado Engincer or Architect and spproved by a Geotechnical Engineer.
an Section R403.3 Frost Protected Shallow Foundatioas is amended by adding the following: “Foundations shall be designed by 8
registered Colorsdo Engineer or Architect and approved by @ Geotechnical Engincer.
(12) Section R404.2 Wood Foundation Walls ix smended by adding the following: “Foundations shall be designed by & registered
Colorado Engineer or Architect and npproved by the Geotechnicab Engineer™
13) Section G2425.8 (501.8) Equipment Not Required to be Vented is amended by deleting item H The sentence sfler this
exceplion should be emended o n2ad: “Whore the appliancas listed in Ttems 5 and 6 above.,.
(14) Section G2445 (621) is amended by removing alf subsections and replacing it with “Section G2445.1 Genersl. Vnveated room
heaters are prohibited from installation.”™
(1S)  TebleR301.2(1)is amended by deleting it in its entircty and replacing it with the following:
Table R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEQGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
Roof | WIND DESIGN | SEISMIC | SUBJECTTODAMAGE |WINTER| ICEBARRIER FLOOD AlR MEAN
Snow FROM DESIGN| UNDERLAYMENT [H. ANNUAL
Losd DESIGN Ve Frost | Termite| TEMP REQUIRED INDEX TEMP
effects line
(mph] [CATEGORY depth
75 paf| 90 NO B SEVERE | 48" | NONE| -15°F YES 2007 2000 45°F
TO
SLIG
(16) Teble R302.6 is amended to read:
SEPERATION MATERIAL
From residence and attics not less than /8" Type X gypsum board applied on the gamge side
From aft habitable mom: Ahy nol Jess than 5/8™ Typo X gypxum board
Structute(s) supporiing Aoor ceiling assembliesused for | not fess than $/8™ Type X gypsum bosrd
stparation ired by this section
Garages focated less than 6 feet from a dwelling uniton | not less than 578" Type X gypsum board applied to the interior side of exterior
th ot awalls of tho gamga that arc wilhin this arca.

(i7)  Add anew Seclion R303.1.2 Mechenical ventilation to read:

R303.1.2 Mechanlcal ventilation. Dwelling units shall be provided with a mechanical exhaust system, supply system, or
combination thereof to provide whole-building veatilation with outdoor uir. Such system shall comply with Scstion R303.1.2-1
through R303.12.2,

Exception;
1. Other approved mechanical ventilation systems.
(18)  Add a new Section R303.1.2.1 Mechanical ventilation rato to read:

R303.1.2.1 rate, Th ventilation system shall provide outdoor air continucusly at e mts of
not Joss then that determined in accordance with Table R303.4(1)

Exception: Continuous operation of the system is not required where the system has conlrols that enable opermtion for not
fess tho 25% of cach 6 hour segment and the ventilation rvte prescribed in Table R303.1.2.t (1)is multiplied by the factor in
accordance with Table R303.1.2.1 (2)

(19) Addanew table, TABLE R303.12.1 (1) to read:

TABLE R303.0.2.1(1)
'VENTILATIONAIR REQUIREMENTS, CFM!

FLOOR AREA (SQ. REDROOM.
FL) 0-1 2-3 4.5 £-7 >7
<1.500) 0. 45 £i0. 25 i1}
1,500.3,000 45 £0 a5 20 105
3.001-4,500 60 8 90 105 120
4,501-6,000 75 90 108 120, 135
6.001-7,500 S50 105 120 135 150
>7,500 105 120 135 150 165

For S1: [ square fool = | square foot = 0.0929 m2.
L Equation R303.1.2.1 (1) can boused a3 en sltemative to Table R303.1.2.1 (1)
Qfan = 0.01 Afloor + 2.5 (Nbr + 1)}
‘Where:
Qlan ~ fan flow e in cubic feet per minute (cIm).
Afloor = floor area in square fect (R2)
Nbr = number of bedrooms; not 1o be less than 1

(20)  Add anew table, TABLE R303.12.1 (2) to read:




TABLE R303.1.2.1 (2)
INTERMITTENT MECHANICAL VENTILATION RATE FACTORS O O

Run-Time Percentage In 25% 33% 50% 6% 5%
each6h
Factor 4 3 2 - 13

&. Interpolation between entries is permitted.
b. The ventilation system run time shall be not leas than 25%
(1)  Add anew seclion R303.1.2.2, System design, to read:

R303.1.2.2 System design. The required whole-house ventilation system shall eonsist of one or more supply or exhaust fans
or & combination thesof and associated ducts and controls. Outdoor air ducts connected to the refum side of an air handier shall

i fo be supply where the s requi for a mini retum sir for the air-
handler are met,

(22)  Add a new section R303.1.2.3 System Contyols, to read:
R303.1.2.3 System Controls. The mechenical ventilation system shall be provided with controls that enable occupant override.

23)  Add anew section R303.3.1 Bathroom venlilation 1o read:

R303.3.1 Bath i Bath shall be i h din dance with section 1507,

Sectlon 4, Article 4 of Chapter 18 of the Mintumn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and reenacted to read ss follows:
International Fuel Gas Code
Section 184-10, Intcrnational Fuel Gas Code adopted,

. (@) Tho International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition 2 printing as published by the Internationai Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20001, Chaptess 1 through 8 inclusive, ("[FGC") is hereby adopted by reference s the Town of Minturn Fuel Gas Code as
if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, conslruction,
quality of materisls and workmanship, conform with the IFGC, as adopted and s amended.

Section 18-4-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:
() Section 303.3 Prohibited Locations is amended by deleting exceplions number 3 and 4.

(2)  Section 402.6.2 Liquefied Pelroleum Gas Facilities and Piping is amending by the addition of the following sentence: "Liguefied
petroleum gas facilities and equipment shall not be located in any pit or basement, under show windows or intesior sirways, in
engine, boiler, heater, or electric meter rooms™. The following exception shail apply: “equif may be installed with an approved
means of delection and remova of unbumed liguid petrofeum gas. A minimum 3" din pipe to the exterior of the building, propane
sensor and automatic safety shutoff shall be installed. The drain shall not be trapped and shall be protected from snow closure and
rodents, When the above listed means connot be achieved, an engineered mechanical exhaust system with & propane sensor, and an
aulomalic safety shul-off, shall be required”,

(3)  Section 501.8 Equipment Not Required 1o be Vented is amended by the deletion of jtem No. 8
Section 5, Articte 6 of Chapter 18 of the Mintum Maunicipal Code is hereby repealed and reenacled Lo read as follows:
Internatlonal Encrgy Conservation Code
Scction 18-5-10, International Encrgy Conservation Code adopted.

(0) The International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition 5% printing as published by the Internationsl Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue,
NW, 6th Floor, Washinglon, DC 20001, Chapters 1 through 6 inclusive, (“TECC") is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Mintum Encrgy
Code ns if fully sel out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Adlicle,

Section 7, Article 8 of Chapter 18 of the Mintum Municipal Code is hereby repealed and reenscted to read as follows:
Mechanlcal Code
Sectlon 18-8-10. International Mechanlcal Code adopted.

(n) The Infernational Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition 4 printing as published by the Intemnational Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6tk
Floor, Weshington, DC 20001, Chaplers 1 through 15 inclusive, (“IMC") is hercby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Mechanical Code
as if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article,

(b) No building shall be hereafter construcled, erecled, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction,
quality of materials and workmanship, conform with the IMC, as adopted and as emended.

Section 8, Article 9 of Chapter I8 of the Mintum Municipal Code is hercby repealed and reenscted o read as follows:
Praperty Maintenance Code

Section 18-9-10. T

Property Cade adopted.

(8) The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition 1* printing as published by the Intemational Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue.
NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001, is hereby adopled by referenice as the Town of Mintum Property Maintenance Code as if fully set out in this
Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

() No building shall be hercaller constructed, erected, enlasged, altered, or moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, construction,
quality of meterials and workmanship, conform with the PMC, as adopted and as amended.

Seetion 9, Article 10 of Chapter 18 of tho Minturn Municipal Code is hereby repealed and reenacted o read as follows:
National Electrical Code
Section 18-9-10. National Electrical Code adopted.

(2) The National Electrical Codle, as published by the National Fire Protection Association, and the rules end regulations thereunder, as adopted
amended and updated 1o the most current edition by the Colorado State Electical Board from Lime to time ("NEC”) pursusnt to the authority set fortk
in Article 23 of Tile 12, C.R.S,, is hereby adopted by referonce os the City of Centennial Electrical Code ns if fully set out in this Ordinance with the
additions, delelions, inscriions end changes as set fosth in this Article.

(t) No building shell be hereafler constructed, erected, enlarged, allered, or moved inta the City unless the same shall, as to design, construction,
quality of materials and workmanship, conform with the NEC, as adopled and es amended.

Sectlon 10.  Sevemsbility. If any part, section, sub-section, clause or phrase of this
Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance; and the Towr
Councit for the Town of Mintum, Colorado hereby declares it would have passed this ordinance and each part, seclion, sub-section, senlence, olause
or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more parts, seclions, sub-sections, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared invalid.

Sectlon 1.  The Town Council hereby finds, determines and declares that this
Ordinance is necessary and proper for the health, safety and welfare of the Town of Mintum and the inhabitants thereof,

Section 12, The repeal or the repeal and re-enactment of any provision of the Mintum
Maunicipal Code as provided in this ordinance shall not affect any right which has acerued, and duty imposed, any violation that occured prior (o the
effective dale hereof, any proseculion commenced, nor any other aclion or ing a5 commenced under or by virtue of the provision repeale¢
or repealed and re-enacted. The repeal of any provision hereby shall not revive any provision or any ordi: previously repesled or de¢
unless expressly staled herein.

INTRODUCED, TITLE READ IN FULL, APPROVED ON FIRST READING AND ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL THE DAY
OF JULY, 2011, A PUBLIC HEARING ON THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BE HELD AT THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE TOWN
COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ONTHE ___ DAY OF AUGUST, 2011, AT 7 P.M. IN THE MINTURN TOWN
CENTER IN THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO.

Mayor

Allest:

(b) No building shall be hereafier constructed, erected, enlarged, altered, or moved into the Town unless the same. shall, as to design,
quality of materials and workmanship, conform with the IECC, as adopled and as amended.

Scction 18-5-20. Amendments.
The following sections of the adopted code are hereby revised as follows:
(1) Chapter I Administration shall be deleted and chapler 1 of the IBC and IRC shall apply.
Section 6, Article 7 of Chapter 18 of the Mintum Municipal Code is hereby repealed and reenacted 10 read as follows:
Internationial Plumbing Code

(8) The Infernational Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition 3 printing as published by the Intemational Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th
Floor, Washington, DC 20004, Chaplers | through 13 inclusive, ("IPC") is hereby adopted by reference as the Town of Minturn Plumbing Code ns
if fully set out in this Ordinance with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as set forth in this Article.

(b) No building shall be hereafter constructed, erected, enlarged, allered, or moved into the Town unless the same shall, as to design, conslruction,
quality of materials and workmanship, conform with the IPC, as adopled and as amended. .

Town Clerk

THE TOWN OF MINTURN, COLORADO, ORDAINS THIS ORDINANCE READ BY TITLE, ENACTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED
BY TITLE ONLY ON SECOND READING THIS DAY OF »201L

Mayor

Altest:

Town Clerk

Published in the Vail Daily on July 26, 2011.




